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WRITE-ONCE INFORMATION RECORDING 
MEDIUM, INFORMATION RECORDING 

APPARATUS, INFORMATION RECORDING 
METHOD, INFORMATION REPRODUCING 

APPARATUS AND INFORMATION 
REPRODUCING METHOD 

TECHNICAL FIELD 

The present invention relates to an information recording 
medium, which includes bitmap information indicating 
whether each area has already been recorded or has not been 
recorded yet and on which a random write operation can be 
performed, and also relates to a method and apparatus for 
reading and/or writing from/to such a recording medium. The 
present invention is applicable particularly effectively to a 
write-once optical disc such as a high-density BD-R on which 
a write operation can be performed only once and to reading 
and writing fromfon Such a disc. 

BACKGROUND ART 

Recently, various removable information storage media 
with huge storage capacities and disc drives for handling Such 
media have become immensely popular. Examples of known 
removable information storage media with big storage 
capacities include optical discs such as DVDs and Blu-ray 
Discs (which will also be referred to herein as “BDs). An 
optical disc drive performs a read/write operation by making 
tiny pits (or marks) on a given optical disc using a laser beam, 
and therefore, can be used effectively to handle such remov 
able information storage media with huge storage capacities. 
Specifically, a red laser beam is used for DVDs, while a blue 
laser beam, having a shorter wavelength than the red laser 
beam, is used for BDS, thereby making the storage density 
and storage capacity of BDS higher and greater than those of 
DVDs. As for a BD-R, for example, a maximum storage 
capacity of as much as 27 gigabytes per recording layer has 
been realized. 

For example, there is an optical disc that uses a phase 
change type recording material for its recording layer. A 
phase change type optical disc is irradiated with a laser beam 
and the atomic bonding state of a thin-film Substance, which 
has been deposited on its recording layer, is locally varied 
with the energy injected, thereby writing information there. 
Also, when irradiated with a laser beam with much lower 
power than the one used for recording, the optical disc has its 
reflectance varied due to such a difference in physical condi 
tion. And if the magnitude of such a variation in reflectance is 
detected, the information stored there can be read out. 

Phase change type optical discs include rewritable optical 
discs, on which information can be rewritten a number of 
times by using a phase change type recording material for its 
recording layer, and write-once optical discs, on which infor 
mation can be written only once. If a mark edge write opera 
tion is performed on Such a write-once optical disc, the disc is 
irradiated with a laser beam that has been modulated into a 
multi-pulse train to vary the physical condition of the record 
ing material, thereby leaving recording marks there. And 
information is read out from Such a write-once optical disc by 
sensing a variation in reflectance between those marks and 
spaces formed. 

However, as an optical disc is a removable information 
recording medium, probably there will be some defect on its 
recording layer due to the presence of dust or a scratch. 
Among other things, the higher the density of a recording 
medium, the more easily the recording medium will be 
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2 
affected by defects. That is why it has become a more and 
more common measure to take to carry out a defect manage 
ment on not just rewritable optical discs (such as a BD-RE) 
but also write-once optical discs (such as a BD-R) as well to 
ensure the reliability of the data read or written (see Patent 
Document No. 1, for example). Furthermore, a BD-R is char 
acterized by having not only a sequential recording mode in 
which a write operation is carried out sequentially from a 
particular recording start point, as is typical of write-once 
storage media, but also a random recording mode as well, in 
which a write operation is performed on an arbitrary record 
ing point (see Patent Document No. 2, No. 3 and No. 4, for 
example). 

FIG. 1 illustrates a normal layout of various areas on an 
optical disc. The disklike optical disc 1 has a spiral track 2. 
along which a great many Subdivided blocks 3 are arranged. 
Blocks 3 are not only units of error correction but also the 
smallest units of read/write operations. Each block 3 is called 
sometimes a “cluster” as for BDs and sometimes an "ECC as 
for DVDs. One cluster, which constitutes one block for a BD, 
is equal to 32 sectors (i.e., one sector has a size of 2 kilobytes 
and one cluster has a size of 64 kilobytes). On the other hand, 
one ECC, which constitutes one block for a DVD, is equal to 
16 sectors (i.e., 32 kilobytes). Also, the storage area on the 
optical disc 1 is roughly classified into a lead-in area 4, a data 
area 5 and a lead-out area 6. User data is supposed to be read 
from, and written on, the data area 5. The lead-in area 4 and 
the lead-out area 6 function as margins that allow the optical 
head (not shown) to get back on tracks even if the optical head 
has overrun while accessing an end portion of the data area 5. 
That is to say, these areas 4 and 6 function as “rims' so to 
speak. Such a layout of areas is used commonly on both a 
rewritable optical disc and a write-once optical disc. 

FIG. 2 shows the data structure of a single recording layer 
of a conventional write-once optical disc with a defect man 
agement function. 
The data area 5 is made up of a user data area 14, from/on 

which user data is read or written, and spare areas, each of 
which is defined in advance to provide an alternative block 
(which will be referred to hereinas a “replacement block”) for 
a defective block, if any, in the user data area 14. In the 
example illustrated in FIG. 2, an inner spare area 15 is 
arranged closer to the inner edge of the optical disc 1, and an 
outer spare area 16 is arranged closer to its outer edge. That is 
to say, although one spare area is arranged inside of the data 
area 5 and another spare area is arranged outside of the data 
area 5 in FIG. 2, the spare area could be provided on only one 
of these two sides (e.g., only inside of the data area 5). There 
fore, the arrangement shown in FIG. 2 does not always have 
to be adopted. 

Each of the lead-in and lead-out areas 4 and 6 has areas to 
store a disc management structure (which will be abbreviated 
herein as “DMS) that provides pieces of management infor 
mation about the arrangement (or size) of the spare areas on 
the optical disc 1, the recording mode, defective blocks and so 
on. Specifically, the lead-in area 4 includes first and second 
disc management areas (DMAs) 10 and 11 (which will be 
referred to herein as “DMA #1 and “DMA #2, respec 
tively). On the other hand, the lead-out area 6 includes third 
and fourth DMAS 12 and 13 (which will be referred to herein 
as “DMA #3” and “DMA #4, respectively). It should be 
noted that DMA sometimes Stands for a defect management 
aca. 

DMA #1 through #4 are arranged in their own areas and 
store quite the same pieces of management information 
except some predetermined kind of information Such as loca 
tion information, which is done to prepare for a situation 
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where any of the DMA #1 through #4 has gone defective 
itself. That is to say, even if information can no longer be 
retrieved from one of these four DMAs properly, the defect 
management information can still be acquired as long as there 
is at least one DMA from which information can be retrieved 
properly. 
The lead-in area 4 further has a first TDMA (temporary 

disc management area) 17. The TDMA is an area unique to a 
write-once optical disc which is a non-rewritable (i.e., non 
updatable) disc and is used to add temporary management 
information and update it while the optical disc 1 is being 
used. It should be noted that TDMA sometimes stands for a 
temporary defect management area. 

Hereinafter, it will be described with reference to FIG. 14 
exactly how to use the TDMA 17. First of all, initialization 
formatting processing (which is also called simply “initial 
ization') is carried out so that the write-once optical disc 1 
gets ready to be used by determining the arrangement (or size) 
of the spare areas and the recording mode, thereby recording 
initial TDMS (temporary disc management structure) 20 as 
shown in portion (a) of FIG. 14. 

Next, as shown in portion (b) of FIG. 14, write processing 
is performed on the user data area 14 and TDMS #0 21, of 
which the information (such as defect information and 
recording endpoint information) has been updated as a result 
of the write processing, is written at the top of the unrecorded 
area of the TDMA 17 (i.e., so as to consume the unrecorded 
area to the right from the boundary between the recorded area 
and the unrecorded area). 

After that, the management information will be updated in 
the same way a number of times. And portion (c) of FIG. 14 
illustrates a state in which the management information has 
been updated (m+1) times since the initialization formatting 
processing was done. That is to say, the latest piece of man 
agement information (i.e., the latest TDMS) will be the 
recorded TDMS (i.e., TDMS #m 21 in FIG. 14) that is adja 
cent to the boundary between the recorded and unrecorded 
areas of the TDMA 17. 
The arrangement of the DMAs is not different between a 

write-once optical disc and a rewritable optical disc. How 
ever, since the rewritable optical disc is rewritable (i.e., updat 
able), every piece of management information, including the 
temporary management information while the optical disc 1 
is being used, can be updated in these DMA areas. On the 
other hand, the write-once optical disc is not rewritable (i.e., 
non-updatable). That is why the write-once optical disc 1 has 
an area called “TDMA for updating temporary information, 
which cannot be found in any disc other than write-once ones. 
And when finalize (also called “disc close') processing is 
carried out to prohibit the user from newly adding any further 
piece of information to the optical disc 1 and make the disc a 
read-only one, the contents of the latest TDMS are copied 
onto the DMA. 

In the example illustrated in FIG. 2, only one TDMA 17 is 
Supposed to be arranged in the lead-in area 4. However, two or 
more TDMAS 17 could be arranged (see Patent Document 
No. 5, for example). Optionally, multiple TDMAs may also 
be provided for each recording layer and arranged in the spare 
areas, too. For instance, as shown in FIG. 15, additional 
TDMA #1 and TDMA #2 may be respectively provided for 
the inner and outer spare areas 15 and 16 of the data area 5, in 
addition to TDMA #0 in the lead-in area 4. Also, if the 
write-once optical disc 1 has multiple recording layers, those 
TDMA areas may be provided for each of those multiple 
recording layers. 
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4 
The DMS written on the DMAS and the TDMS 21 written 

on the TDMA 17 are both made up of the same elements. In 
the following description, the TDMS 21 will be described as 
an example. 

FIG. 16 illustrates elements that form a TDMS 21 on a 
BD-R, which is a write-once optical disc, in the random 
recording mode. In FIG. 16, the structure of a write-once 
optical disc 1 with only one recording layer is shown as an 
example. That is why the data that each of these pieces of 
information contains is Supposed to be provided for just one 
recording layer in the example illustrated in FIG. 16. 
The TDMS 21 consists of an SBM (space bitmap) 30, a 

TDFL (temporary defect list) 31 and TDDS (temporary disc 
definition structure) 32. 
The SBM 30 has an SBM header 40 including an identifier 

disclosing its identify as the SBM 30, information about the 
number of times of update, and information about the range of 
the SBM area to manage (e.g., the top address and size of the 
area in question), and bitmap information 41 indicating the 
recording statuses (e.g., recorded and unrecorded States) in 
that range of the SBM area to manage. The bitmap informa 
tion 41 will be described in further detail later. In an optical 
disc 1 with multiple recording layers, the data areas 5 on 
which the SBM 30 can be managed (more specifically, the 
user data area 14) are not physically continuous with each 
other between its multiple recording layers, and therefore, the 
SBM 30 is provided for each of those recording layers. 
The TDFL 31 has: a DFL header 42 including an identifier 

disclosing its identity as the TDFL, information about the 
number of times of update, and information about the number 
of DEL entries 43 (e.g., n+1 in FIG. 16), which is defect and 
replacement information of the TDFL; that number of DEL 
entries 43; and a DEL terminator 44 including an identifier 
disclosing its identity as the terminal position of the TDFL31, 
of which the size is variable according to the number of DFL 
entries 43, and information about the number of times of 
update. The TDFL 31 and the TDDS 32 of one sector size (to 
be described later) may have a size of at most four blocks (i.e., 
four clusters as for a BD) combined if there is only one 
recording layer and may have a size of at most eight blocks 
(i.e., eight clusters as for a BD) combined if there are two 
recording layers. That is to say, the size of the TDFL 31 itself 
is supposed to beat most “four blocks (i.e., four clusters as for 
a BD) minus one sector if there is only one recording layer 
but at most “eight blocks (i.e., eight clusters as for a BD) 
minus one sector if there are two recording layers. 
The TDDS32 has: a DDS header 50 including an identifier 

disclosing its identity as the TDDS 32 and information about 
the number of times of update; an inner spare area size 51 and 
an outer spare area size 52, which are pieces of information 
about the respective sizes of the inner and outer spare areas 15 
and 16 that determine the layout of the respective areas in the 
data area 5; recording mode information 53 indicating 
whether the recording mode is sequential recording mode or 
random recording mode; inner spare area TDMA size 54 and 
an outer spare area TDMA size 55 providing size information 
in a situation where there are TDMAs in the inner and outer 
spare areas 15 and 16 as shown in FIG. 15: SBM #0 location 
information 56, which is information about the storage loca 
tion of the latest SBM 30; and DFL #0 location information 
57, DFL #1 location information 58, DFL #2 location infor 
mation 59, and DFL #3 location information 60, which are 
pieces of location information of the respective blocks in 
which the latest TDFL 31 (of at most four blocks) is stored. 
The TDDS 32 has a fixed size, e.g., a size of one sector as 

described above. 
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Hereinafter, the bitmap information 41 will be described in 
detail with reference to FIG. 19. The bitmap information 41 is 
a piece of information for use to check recorded and unre 
corded portions of a data area on a block-by-block basis, for 
example. In the bitmap information 41, one block of a given 
area range, of which the SBM needs to be managed (e.g., the 
user data area 14), is associated with one bit, the status of that 
block is indicated to be zero if it is still an unrecorded block, 
but its status is changed into one when the block turns into a 
recorded one. That is to say, Supposing the eight blocks A 
through H in the given area range, of which the SBM needs to 
be managed, get associated with bits 0 through 7, respec 
tively, in the one-byte (i.e., eight-bit) data at a predetermined 
byte position in the bitmap information 41 as shown in FIG. 
19, if the entire area of interest is unrecorded as shown in FIG. 
19(A), every bit (i.e., from bit 0 through bit 7) of the bitmap 
information 41 will be zero. On the other hand, after a write 
operation has been performed on the blocks B, C and F, their 
associated bits 1, 2 and 5 of the bitmap information 41 will 
become one and the one-byte (i.e., eight-bit) data at the pre 
determined byte position of the bitmap information 41 will be 
26h, which is a hexadecimal number as shown in FIG. 19CB). 
Since one block is associated with one bit, 4000h (which is a 
hexadecimal, too) blocks can be managed using one sector (2 
kilobytes) of bitmap information 41 and 78000h (which is 
also a hexadecimal and which is 491.520 according to deci 
mal notation) blocks can be managed using 30 sectors of 
bitmap information 41. 
As for a BD-R, if the maximum capacity per recording 

layer is 27 gigabytes, the maximum number of blocks (or 
clusters) included in the user data area 14 is less than 68000h 
(which is again a hexadecimal). That is why it should be 
enough if the bitmap information 41 has a size of 30 sectors. 
As a result, supposing the SBM header 40 has a size of one 
sector, it is possible to ensure that the combined size of the 
SBM 30 with a size of 31 sectors and the TDDS 32 with a size 
of one sectoris always equal to or Smaller than one block (i.e., 
32 sectors or one cluster). On the other hand, as the size of the 
TDFL 31 is variable according to the number of DFL entries 
43, it is impossible to ensure that the combined size of the 
TDFL 31 and the TDDS 32 is always equal to or smaller than 
one block. 

Each of the SBM 30 and the TDFL 31 is always written on 
the TDMA 17 using its combination with the TDDS 32 as a 
single recording unit (which is called a “disc management 
structure update unit”). 

Next, the initial TDMS 20 (see FIG. 14) will be described. 
The initial TDMS20 is arranged at the top of the TDMA 17 

(i.e., at the position to be used (recorded) earliest on the 
optical disc 1). 
The initial TDMS 20 has the same elements as, but slightly 

different contents from, a normal TDMS 21. As shown in 
FIG. 17, the initial TDMS 20 includes one block (i.e., one 
cluster) of data as a combination of the initial SBM 30 and the 
TDDS 32 that form one disc management structure update 
unit, and another block (i.e., another cluster) of data as a 
combination of the initial TDFL 31 and the TDDS 32 that 
form another disc management structure update unit. 
As used herein, the “initial SBM 30” refers to an SBM, for 

which only information about the identifier of its SBM header 
40 and the area range of the SBM to be managed are defined 
and information about the number of times of its updates and 
the bitmap information 41 are all Zero (i.e., the user data area 
14 is totally unrecorded). 

Also, the TDDS 32 to be written in combination with the 
initial SBM 30 not just includes the DDS header 50 providing 
only identifier information but also defines the sizes of the 

10 

15 

25 

30 

35 

40 

45 

50 

55 

60 

65 

6 
respective spare areas (i.e., the inner and outer spare areasizes 
51 and 52), the sizes of the TDMAs in those spare areas (i.e., 
inner- and outer-spare-area TDMA sizes 54 and 55) and 
recording mode information 53 (e.g., random recording mode 
in this example). Furthermore, information about the location 
at which the SBM 30 is going to be written is stored as the 
SBM H0 location information 56. DFL H0 location informa 
tion 57 corresponding to the initial TDFL 31 to be described 
later is stored as the TDFL location information, and indicates 
the block location on which the initial TDFL 31 and TDDS 32 
are written next to the initial SBM 30 and the TDDS 32. 
As for the DFL #1, #2 and #3 location information 58,59 

and 60 not to be used, null data (e.g., Zero) indicating that 
these pieces of information are not available may be written, 
for example. 

Also, the initial TDFL 31 refers to a TDFL of the minimum 
size including no DFL entries 43 at all, i.e., the TDFL 
includes only the DFL header 42 (which provides only iden 
tifier information, but of which the number of DEL entries 43 
and information about the number of times of updates are 
both Zero) and the DEL terminator 44 (for which identifier 
information has been defined but of which the number of 
times of update information is zero). Since the initial TDFL 
31 has a size that is equal to or Smaller than one sector size, the 
combined size will be equal to or smaller than one block (or 
cluster) size even when written in combination with the 
TDDS 32. Furthermore, the TDDS 32 to be written in this 
case may have almost the same data as what is written as the 
initial SBM 30 and TDDS 32 described above. It is only the 
DFL H0 location information 57 that can be different. That is 
to say, if data cannot be written on an intended block due to 
the presence of a defect, for example, but has been written on 
the next block instead, for example, only this value can be 
different from the value of the TDDS 32 that has been written 
with the initial SBM 30. 
As described above, at the top of the TDMA 17, stored is a 

portion of the data of the initial TDMS 20. In addition, at that 
top location, always written is a TDDS 32 that provides 
information that clearly indicates the area arrangement and 
recording mode of the data area 5 on the optical disc 1. Thus, 
even if it is impossible to decide, on the spot, exactly where 
such a TDDS 32, providing information that indicates the 
area arrangement and recording mode of the data area 5 on the 
optical disc 1, is located (e.g., if there are a number of TDMAs 
or if the TDMA has already been updated a number of times), 
the area arrangement and recording mode of the data area 5 
can still be determined definitely by reading out the data from 
one block at the top of the TDMA 17 (or the first one of its 
following blocks on which a read/write operation can be 
performed properly if it is a defective block). 

Particularly, in a situation where a read-only apparatus for 
the optical disc 1 is loaded with an optical disc 1 with no spare 
areas, as long as at least the layout (i.e., area arrangement) of 
the optical disc 1 is known, that apparatus can also perform 
read processing at the read request issued by the host even 
without getting the latest management information. That is 
why the latest management information is not always 
required and the TDDS 32 indicating the layout of the optical 
disc 1 is preferably obtained as soon as possible and as 
securely as possible. Therefore, from that standpoint, it is also 
preferred that data that always has the TDDS 32 at a prede 
termined location (e.g., one block at the top of the TDMA 17) 
be written. 

Furthermore, in a situation where there are multiple 
TDMAs, if the size information of the TDMA located on the 
spare area were not available, then even the location of that 
TDMA could not be determined. For that reason, it is very 
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important and efficient for an optical disc drive to perform a 
read/write operation on this optical disc 1 that the data of the 
TDDS 32 is always arranged at a predetermined location 
(e.g., at the top of the TDMA 17 in this example). 

In the foregoing example, a random recording mode has 
been described. In a sequential recording mode, on the other 
hand, SRRI (SRR information), providing information about 
the top location of recording tracks (which are also called an 
SRR (sequential recording range)) and information about the 
end location of the recorded portion, will just be written 
instead of the SBM30. In that case, the initial TDMS consists 
of an initial TDFL 31, an initial SRRI and a TDDS 32, has a 
size that is equal to or Smaller than one block (or one cluster) 
and therefore, written as one block (one cluster) data. 

It should be noted that a DMS to be written on a DMA and 
a TDMS to be written on a TDMA have mutually different 
orders of data written and arranged. Specifically, in the 
TDMS, the TDDS is arranged at the end of the TDMS. In the 
DMS, on the other hand, the DDS is arranged at the top 
location of the DMS (see Patent Document No. 1). 

Also, recently, people have been trying harder and harder 
to further increase the storage capacities of optical discs. 
Examples of those methods for realizing optical discs with 
huge capacities (i.e., methods for increasing their storage 
capacities) include increasing the storage density per record 
ing layer by shorting the lengths of recording marks and 
spaces to be left or shortening the track pitch and increasing 
the overall storage capacity by providing multiple informa 
tion recording layers. 
Among these methods, according to the method for 

increasing the storage density per recording layer by short 
ening the lengths of the marks and spaces to be left, a storage 
density of 32 gigabytes or 33.4 gigabytes per recording layer, 
which is approximately 25% greater than the maximum size 
of 27 GB of conventional BDs, is expected to be realized. And 
even higher storage densities could be realized in the future, 
tOO. 
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SUMMARY OF INVENTION 

Technical Problem 

However, if the storage capacity per recording layer 
increased, the sizes of the data area 5 and the user data area 14 
to be managed using the SBM would naturally increase, too. 
As described above, 4000h (which is a hexadecimal number 
and which corresponds to 16.384 according to decimal nota 
tion) blocks can be managed with one sector of bitmap infor 
mation 41. If the maximum size of the bitmap information 41 
is 30 sectors, the number of manageable blocks will be 
78000h (which is a hexadecimal number and which corre 
sponds to 491.520 according to decimal notation). Supposing 
the storage capacity per recording layer increased to 33.4 
gigabytes, for example, approximately 7D000h (which is a 
hexadecimal number and which corresponds to approxi 
mately 512,000 according to decimal notation) blocks would 
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8 
be needed per recording layer. To manage these blocks, how 
ever, 32 sectors, which are greater than 30 sectors as the 
maximum size of the bitmap information 41, would be 
needed. In that case, however, the combined size of the SBM 
30 and the TDDS 32 would exceed one block (32 sectors). 
Consequently, the size of one disc management structure 
update unit that is a combination of the SBM 30 and the 
TDDS 32 would also exceed one block (i.e., two blocks or 
more). 

In such a situation, if the initial TDMS 20 were written in 
the conventional procedure so as to have the same contents as 
the conventional one, then the initial TDMS 20 would have 
the layout shown in FIG. 18. In that case, the data of the TDDS 
32 could not always bearranged at the predetermined location 
(i.e., the top of the TDMA 17). In the example illustrated in 
FIG. 18, the TDDS 32 is located on the second block from the 
top. However, if a block of the TDMA 17 on which the initial 
TDMS 20 is going to be written were a defective block, for 
example, a write operation would be retried a number of times 
on the next block until the write operation gets done properly. 
That is why search should be done while checking out every 
block in order to locate a block with the proper TDDS 32. 

Furthermore, in that case, the bitmap information 41 
included in the SBM 30 to be written on the top block of the 
initial TDMS 20 would have any value that is meaningful bit 
by bit. For that reason, information about the identifier dis 
closing its identity as the TDDS 32 to be included in the DDS 
header 50 and the bitmap information 41 could happen to 
agree with each other. Consequently, it would be very difficult 
to search for the TDDS 32 on the properly written block3. 

It is therefore an object of the present invention to provide 
an information recording medium, of which the layout is 
determined so that data including the TDDS32 can always be 
arranged at a predetermined location (e.g., at the top block of 
the TDMA 17) even if the size of management information 
such as the SBM 30 has increased as the storage capacity per 
recording layer increases, and also provide a method for 
performing a read/write operation on Such an information 
recording medium. 

Solution to Problem 

A write-once information recording medium according to 
the present invention has at least one recording layer and 
information is written on a block-by-block basis on it. The 
write-once information recording medium includes: a user 
data area on which user data is going to be written; and a 
management information area to store management informa 
tion about the write-once information recording medium. The 
user data area is provided for each recording layer. The man 
agement information includes: a space bitmap including bit 
map information for use to manage recording statuses in the 
user data area on a predetermined one of the recording layers; 
and a disc definition structure including location information 
of the space bitmap. The size of the space bitmap is deter 
mined so that the combined size of the space bitmap itself and 
the disc definition structure always becomes equal to that of 
one block, irrespective of the size of the user data area. If the 
size of the user data area on the predetermined recording layer 
exceeds a predetermined one, multiple space bitmaps are 
generated for the user data area of the predetermined record 
ing layer. A disc management structure update unit, including 
one of the multiple space bitmaps and the disc definition 
structure and having a size of one block, is written on the 
management information area. 

In one preferred embodiment, if the size of the user data 
area on the predetermined recording layer exceeds the prede 
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termined size, the bitmap information is divided into multiple 
pieces of bitmap information. Each of the multiple space 
bitmaps is provided with one of those pieces of bitmap infor 
mation. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases. The predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, the 
disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to that 
of one block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list, 
which provides no information about a defective area. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 
An information writing apparatus according to the present 

invention writes information on a write-once information 
recording medium, which has at least one recording layer and 
on which information is written on a block-by-block basis. 
The write-once information recording medium includes: a 
user data area on which user data is going to be written; and a 
management information area to store management informa 
tion about the write-once information recording medium. The 
user data area is provided for each recording layer. The man 
agement information includes: a space bitmap including bit 
map information for use to manage recording statuses in the 
user data area on a predetermined one of the recording layers; 
and a disc definition structure including location information 
of the space bitmap. The size of the space bitmap is deter 
mined so that the combined size of the space bitmap itself and 
the disc definition structure always becomes equal to that of 
one block, irrespective of the size of the user data area. If the 
size of the user data area on the predetermined recording layer 
exceeds a predetermined one, the information writing appa 
ratus generates multiple space bitmaps for the user data area 
of the predetermined recording layer, and writes a disc man 
agement structure update unit, including one of the multiple 
space bitmaps and the disc definition structure and having a 
size of one block, on the management information area. 

In one preferred embodiment, if the size of the user data 
area on the predetermined recording layer exceeds the prede 
termined size, the bitmap information is divided into multiple 
pieces of bitmap information. Each of the multiple space 
bitmaps is provided with one of those pieces of bitmap infor 
mation. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 
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10 
In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 

information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases. The predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, the 
disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to that 
of one block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list, 
which provides no information about a defective area. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 
An information writing method according to the present 

invention is designed to write information on a write-once 
information recording medium, which has at least one record 
ing layer and on which information is written on a block-by 
block basis. The write-once information recording medium 
includes: a user data area on which user data is going to be 
written; and a management information area to store manage 
ment information about the write-once information recording 
medium. The user data area is provided for each recording 
layer. The management information includes: a space bitmap 
including bitmap information for use to manage recording 
statuses in the user data area on a predetermined one of the 
recording layers; and a disc definition structure including 
location information of the space bitmap. The size of the 
space bitmap is determined so that the combined size of the 
space bitmap itself and the disc definition structure always 
becomes equal to that of one block, irrespective of the size of 
the user data area. The information writing method includes 
the steps of: if the size of the user data area on the predeter 
mined recording layer exceeds a predetermined one, gener 
ating multiple space bitmaps for the user data area of the 
predetermined recording layer; and writing a disc manage 
ment structure update unit, including one of the multiple 
space bitmaps and the disc definition structure and having a 
size of one block, on the management information area. 

In one preferred embodiment, the method further includes 
the steps of: if the size of the user data area on the predeter 
mined recording layer exceeds the predetermined size, divid 
ing the bitmap information into multiple pieces of bitmap 
information; and associating one of those pieces of bitmap 
information with each of the multiple space bitmaps. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases. The predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, the 
disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to that 
of one block. 
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In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list, 
which provides no information about a defective area. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 
An information reading apparatus according to the present 

invention reads information from a write-once information 
recording medium, which has at least one recording layer and 
on which information is written on a block-by-block basis. 
The write-once information recording medium includes: a 
user data area on which user data is going to be written; and a 
management information area to store management informa 
tion about the write-once information recording medium. The 
user data area is provided for each recording layer. The man 
agement information includes: a space bitmap including bit 
map information for use to manage recording statuses in the 
user data area on a predetermined one of the recording layers; 
and a disc definition structure including location information 
of the space bitmap. The size of the space bitmap is deter 
mined so that the combined size of the space bitmap itself and 
the disc definition structure always becomes equal to that of 
one block, irrespective of the size of the user data area. If the 
size of the user data area on the predetermined recording layer 
exceeds a predetermined one, multiple space bitmaps are 
generated for the user data area of the predetermined record 
ing layer. A disc management structure update unit, including 
one of the multiple space bitmaps and the disc definition 
structure and having a size of one block, is written on the 
management information area. And the information reading 
apparatus reads the disc management structure update unit, 
including the disc definition structure and having a size of one 
block, from the management information area and obtains the 
space bitmap. 

In one preferred embodiment, if the size of the user data 
area on the predetermined recording layer exceeds the prede 
termined size, the bitmap information is divided into multiple 
pieces of bitmap information. Each of the multiple space 
bitmaps is provided with one of those pieces of bitmap infor 
mation. And the information reading apparatus reads an asso 
ciated piece of bitmap information from each space bitmap. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases, and the predetermined size is the size of the user 
data area when the combined size of the bitmap information, 
the disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to 
that of one block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 
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In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 

information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list. 
The initial defect list provides no information about a defec 
tive area. The information reading apparatus reads either the 
disc management structure update unit or the second disc 
management structure update unit from a block at the prede 
termined location. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 
An information reading method according to the present 

invention is designed to read information from a write-once 
information recording medium, which has at least one record 
ing layer and on which information is written on a block-by 
block basis. The write-once information recording medium 
includes: a user data area on which user data is going to be 
written; and a management information area to store manage 
ment information about the write-once information recording 
medium. The user data area is provided for each recording 
layer. The management information includes: a space bitmap 
including bitmap information for use to manage recording 
statuses in the user data area on a predetermined one of the 
recording layers; and a disc definition structure including 
location information of the space bitmap. The size of the 
space bitmap is determined so that the combined size of the 
space bitmap itself and the disc definition structure always 
becomes equal to that of one block, irrespective of the size of 
the user data area. If the size of the user data area on the 
predetermined recording layer exceeds a predetermined one, 
multiple space bitmaps are generated for the user data area of 
the predetermined recording layer. A disc management struc 
ture update unit, including one of the multiple space bitmaps 
and the disc definition structure and having a size of one 
block, is written on the management information area. The 
information reading method includes the step of reading the 
disc management structure update unit, including the disc 
definition structure and having a size of one block, from the 
management information area and obtains the space bitmap. 

In one preferred embodiment, if the size of the user data 
area on the predetermined recording layer exceeds the prede 
termined size, the bitmap information is divided into multiple 
pieces of bitmap information. Each of the multiple space 
bitmaps is provided with one of those pieces of bitmap infor 
mation. The information reading method further includes the 
step of reading an associated piece of bitmap information 
from each space bitmap. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases. The predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, the 
disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to that 
of one block. 
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In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list. 
The initial defect list provides no information about a defec 
tive area. The information reading method includes the step of 
reading either the disc management structure update unit or 
the second disc management structure update unit from a 
block at the predetermined location in the management infor 
mation area. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 

ADVANTAGEOUSEFFECTS OF INVENTION 

According to the present invention, even if the storage 
capacity per recording layer has increased and if the size of 
management information about that recording layer has also 
increased, management information including a TDDS Such 
as the layout information of a write-once information record 
ing medium is always stored (or arranged) at a predetermined 
location (i.e., on the top block) in the management informa 
tion area of the write-once information recording medium. 
Then, even for a read-only apparatus that does not always 
need the latest management information, the TDDS including 
the layout information of the write-once information record 
ing medium can be obtained quickly and securely. As a result, 
faster response to a read instruction issued by a host device is 
realized. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF DRAWINGS 

FIG. 1 illustrates an optical disc as a preferred embodiment 
of the present invention. 

FIG. 2 illustrates the data structure of a recording layer of 
the optical disc according to the preferred embodiment of the 
present invention. 

FIG. 3 illustrates the data structure of an initial TDMS 
according to a first specific preferred embodiment of the 
present invention. 

FIG. 4 illustrates what kinds of information are contained 
in the TDDS 32 according to a preferred embodiment of the 
present invention. 

Portions (a) through (c) of FIG. 5 schematically illustrate 
how the TDMS is written and what location information is 
provided by a TDDS in the first preferred embodiment of the 
present invention. 

FIG. 6 is a block diagram illustrating an optical disc read 
ing/writing apparatus for use in preferred embodiments of the 
present invention. 

FIG. 7 is a flowchart showing how to get initializing for 
matting processing (i.e., initialization) done according to the 
first preferred embodiment of the present invention. 

Portions (a) and (b) of FIG. 8 illustrate the data structure of 
an initial TDMS 20 according to a second specific preferred 
embodiment of the present invention. 
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FIG. 9 is a flowchart showing how to get initializing for 

matting processing (i.e., initialization) done according to the 
second preferred embodiment of the present invention. 

FIG. 10 illustrates the data structure of an initial TDMS 
according to a third specific preferred embodiment of the 
present invention. 

Portions (a) and (b) of FIG. 11 schematically illustrate how 
the TDMS is written and what location information is pro 
vided by the TDDS in the third preferred embodiment of the 
present invention. 

FIG. 12 illustrates the data structure of an initial SEM 30 
according to the third preferred embodiment of the present 
invention. 

FIG. 13 is a flowchart showing how to get initializing 
formatting processing (i.e., initialization) done according to 
the third preferred embodiment of the present invention. 

FIG. 14 illustrates how to update a TDMA. 
FIG. 15 illustrates how a number of TDMAs may be 

arranged on a recording layer. 
FIG.16 illustrates what kinds of information are contained 

in a TDDS. 
FIG. 17 illustrates the data structure of an initial TDMS 20. 
FIG. 18 illustrates the data structure of another initial 

TDMS2O. 
FIGS. 19(A) and 19(B) illustrate bitmap information. 
FIG. 20 illustrates a cross section of an optical disc as a 

specific preferred embodiment of the present invention. 
FIG. 21 illustrates the structure of a multilayer disc. 
FIG. 22 illustrates the structure of a single-layer disc as a 

preferred embodiment of the present invention. 
FIG. 23 illustrates the structure of a dual-layer disc as a 

preferred embodiment of the present invention. 
FIG. 24 illustrates the structure of a three-layer disc as a 

preferred embodiment of the present invention. 
FIG. 25 illustrates the structure of a four-layer disc as a 

preferred embodiment of the present invention. 
FIG. 26 illustrates the physical structure of an optical disc 

as a preferred embodiment of the present invention. 
FIG. 27(A) illustrates an exemplary 25 GE BD and FIG. 

27(B) illustrates an optical disc that has a higher storage 
density than the 25 GB BD. 

FIG. 28 illustrates how a series of recording marks on a 
track is irradiated with a light beam. 

FIG. 29 is a graph showing how the OTF changes with the 
shortest recording mark on a disc with a storage capacity of 25 
GB. 

FIG. 30 shows an example in which the spatial frequency 
of the shortest mark (2T) is higher than an OTF cutoff fre 
quency and in which a 2T read signal has an amplitude of 
ZO. 

DESCRIPTION OF EMBODIMENTS 

Hereinafter, preferred embodiments of the present inven 
tion will be described with reference to the accompanying 
drawings. In the following description of preferred embodi 
ments of the present invention, the information recording 
medium is supposed to be a write-once information recording 
medium to which information can be added only once. It 
should be noted that the storage capacity of this recording 
medium per recording layer (i.e., the size of the user data area 
14) is defined so that the SBM 30 has a size of at least one 
block (more specifically, the bitmap information 41 has a size 
of 31 sectors or more) and that the combined size of the SBM 
30 and the TDDS 32 is more than one block. 
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(Embodiment 1) 

(1) Area Arrangement 

An optical disc 1 as a write-once information recording 
medium according to a first specific preferred embodiment of 
the present invention has the same area arrangement (or lay 
out) as what has already been described with reference to 
FIG 2. 

(2) Data Arrangement of Initial TDMS 20 

FIG. 3 illustrates the data arrangement of an initial tempo 
rary disc management structure (TDMS) 20 that is written at 
the top of the temporary disc management area (TDMA) 17 
(or the first one of multiple TDMAs) of the optical disc 1 
according to the first preferred embodiment of the present 
invention. 
As shown in FIG. 3, the initial TDMS 20 is made up of an 

initial space bitmap (SBM) 30, two temporary disc definition 
structures (TDDS) 32 and an initial temporary defect list 
(TDFL)31. On each of the SBM30 and the TDFL 31, a write 
operation is performed in combination with its associated 
TDDS 32 (i.e., on the basis of a disc management structure 
update unit). The initial TDMS 20 shown in FIG.3 consists of 
the same elements as, but has a different order of writing 
from, the initial TDMS shown in FIG. 17. Specifically, before 
data including the initial SBM 30 is written, one block (or one 
cluster) of data of the combination of the initial TDFL 31 and 
the TDDS 32 (i.e., a disc management structure update unit) 
is written (or arranged) at the top. After that, two blocks (or 
two clusters) of data of the combination of the initial SBM 30 
and the TDDS 32 (i.e., disc management structure update 
units) are written (or arranged). It should be noted that when 
those three block units of data are generated in combination, 
meaningless data portions of those three blocks of the data 
may be either dummy data (all of which is Zero) or padding 
data indicating its meaninglessness, thereby generating data 
with a size of one block. 

With such an arrangement, even if the size of the SBM 30 
increases with the storage capacity per recording layer so 
much that the size of the disc management structure update 
unit, i.e., the combined size of the SBM30 and the TDDS 32, 
exceeds one block (i.e., two blocks or more), data including 
the TDDS32 can always be arranged at the first block of the 
TDMA 17. And if that first block is a defective one, that data 
can be arranged at the first one of its following blocks on 
which a read/write operation can be performed properly. 

It should be noted that the same effect would be achieved 
even if such a method is applied to a situation where the SBM 
30 has a size of 31 sectors or less (i.e., a situation where the 
combined size of the SBM 30 and the TDDS32 is equal to or 
smaller than one block). 
The specific procedure of writing will be described later in 

Section (5). 

(3) Various Kinds of Information Contained in 
TDDS 32 

FIG. 4 illustrates the data structure of the TDDS32 accord 
ing to the first preferred embodiment of the present invention. 
The TDDS 32 shown in FIG. 4 contains basically the same 

information as what has already been described with refer 
ence to FIG. 16 but further has SBM #1 location information 
61 as well as the SBM #0 location information 56. 

Specifically, the TDDS32 shown in FIG. 4 includes: a DDS 
header 50 including an identifier disclosing its identity as the 
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TDDS 32 and information about the number of times of 
update; an inner spare area size 51 and an outer spare area size 
52, which are pieces of information about the respective sizes 
of the inner and outer spare areas 15 and 16 that determine the 
layout of the respective areas in the data area 5; recording 
mode information 53 indicating whether the recording mode 
is sequential recording mode or random recording mode; 
inner spare area TDMA size 54 and an outer spare area 
TDMA size 55 providing size information in a situation 
where there are TDMAs in the inner and outer spare areas 15 
and 16 as shown in FIG. 15; DFL #0 location information 57, 
DFL #1 location information 58, DFL #2 location informa 
tion 59, and DFL #3 location information 60, which are pieces 
of location information of the respective blocks in which the 
latest TDFL31 (of atmost four blocks) is stored; and SBM #0 
location information56 and SBM #1 location information 61, 
which are pieces of information about the storage location of 
the latest SBM 30. That is to say, as the SBM 30 has a size of 
two blocks, its location information also increases accord 
ingly. 

Hereinafter, it will be described in detail by way of specific 
examples why these pieces of location information (i.e., the 
location information of the TDFL 31 and that of the SBM30) 
should be provided for respective blocks. 

FIG. 5 schematically illustrates how the TDMS 21 (see 
FIG. 14) is written on the TDMA 17 and what location infor 
mation is provided by the TDDS32. In FIG. 5, four blocks A 
through D of the TDMA 17 will be taken as an example. 

Portion (a) of FIG. 5 illustrates a situation where the com 
bined data size of the TDFL 31 and the TDDS 32 is equal to 
or smaller than one block and a situation where the SBM 30 
and the TDFL 31 are written at the same time (e.g., when the 
initial TDMS 20 is written). 
On the first block A, written are the TDFL 31 and the TDDS 

32. At this point in time, the DFL #0 location information of 
the TDDS 32 points to the top location of the block A on 
which the TDFL 31 is arranged. On the other hand, the SBM 
#0 location information 56 and the SBM #1 location infor 
mation 61 are written so as to point to the respective top 
locations of the blocks B and C as their expected locations 
because these SBMs #0 and #1 have not been written yet. 

Subsequently, the data of the SBMs 30 and the TDDS32 is 
written over two consecutive blocks. At this point in time, the 
DFL #0 location information 57 of the TDDS 32 also points 
to the top location of the block A on which the TDFL 31 is 
arranged just like the TDDS 32 described above. On the other 
hand, the SBM #0 location information 56 and the SBM #1 
location information 61 are also written so as to point to the 
respective top locations of the blocks B and C that are loca 
tions on which these SBMs #0 and #1 have actually been 
written. 

That is to say, in this example, both of the two TDDS's 32 
to be written have the same location information. 

Portion (b) of FIG.5 illustrates a situation where the TDFL 
31 has a size of more than two blocks and where block B to be 
written is a defective one. As the TDFL 31 and the TDDS 32 
have a combined size of three blocks, the data of the first 
block (TDFL #0) is written on block A. However, as the next 
block B is a defective block, the data of the second block 
(TDFL #1) is written on the block C that follows the defective 
one. And then the rest of the data (i.e., the data of TDFL #2 
and TDDS32 that has a combined size of one block) is written 
on block D. In that case, the DFL #0 location information 57 
points to the top location of the block A, the DFL #1 location 
information 58 points to the top location of the block C, and 
the DFL #2 location information 59 points to the top location 
of the block D, as indicated by the solid arrows in FIG. 5. 
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As in portion (a) of FIG. 5, portion (c) of FIG. 5 also 
illustrates a situation where the combined data size of the 
TDFL 31 and the TDDS 32 is equal to or smaller than one 
block, where the SBM 30 and the TDFL 31 are written at the 
same time, and where block C to be written is a defective one. 
On the first block A, written are the TDFL 31 and the TDDS 
32. At this point in time, the DFL #0 location information of 
the TDDS 32 points to the top location of the block A on 
which the TDFL 31 is arranged. On the other hand, the SBM 
#0 location information 56 and the SBM #1 location infor 
mation 61 are written so as to point to the respective top 
locations of the blocks B and C as their expected locations 
because these SBMs #0 and #1 have not been written yet as 
indicated by the dotted arrows in FIG. 5. 

Subsequently, the data of the SBMs 30 and the TDDS32 is 
written over two blocks. In this case, the SBM #0 can be 
written properly on the block B but the write operation on the 
block C fails because that block C is a defective one. Thus, the 
data of the SBM H1 and the TDDS 32 that has a combined size 
of one block is written on the block D that follows the defec 
tive one. 

At this point in time, the respective pieces of location 
information of the TDDS 32 point to the following locations. 
Specifically, the DFL #0 location information 57 points to the 
top location of the block A on which the TDFL 31 is arranged 
just like the TDDS32 described above. On the other hand, the 
SBM #0 location information 56 and the SBM H1 location 
information 61 point to the respective locations on which 
these SBMs #0 and #1 have actually been written as indicated 
by the solidarrows in FIG.5. That is to say, although the SBM 
#0 location information 56 points to the block B, the SBM #1 
location information 61 points to the top location of the block 
D contrary to its location expected from the TDDS32 that has 
been written on the block A. 

That is to say, in this example, the two TDDS 32 to be 
written have partially different contents but correct informa 
tion is always written on the newest TDDS32 (i.e., the TDDS 
32 written on the block D in the example illustrated in portion 
(c) of FIG. 5). 

In the example described above, it is already known that the 
TDFL 31 and the SBMs 30 need to be written at the same 
time. In a situation Such as the one shown in portion (c) of 
FIG. 5, however, the SBM #0 location information 56 and the 
SBM #1 location information 61 may be unchanged from 
their previous ones so as to point to the locations of the 
previous SBMs 30 that have been written properly. That is to 
say, by pointing to the previous locations at which the write 
operation has been done successfully instead of storing infor 
mation about their expected locations, a wrong piece of loca 
tion information will never be retrieved, no matter what 
TDDS 32 has been read. 

In the example illustrated in portions (a) and (c) of FIG. 5, 
the writing order of the TDMS 21 is defined so that the TDFL 
31 is written earlier than the SBMs 30. However, this order 
should be observed for at least the initial TDMS 20 of Section 
(2) described above. Thus, as for the TDMS 21, the SBMs 30 
may be written earlier than the TDFL 31. 

(4) Reading/writing Apparatus 

FIG. 6 illustrates a configuration for an optical disc read 
ing/writing apparatus 100 for performing read and write 
operations on the optical disc 1 of this preferred embodiment 
of the present invention. This apparatus 100 may be either a 
recorder or a read-only apparatus. 
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The optical disc reading/writing apparatus 100 is con 

nected to a high-order controller (not shown) through an I/O 
bus 180. The high-order controller may be a host computer 
(host PC), for example. 
The optical disc reading/writingapparatus 100 includes: an 

instruction processing section 110 for processing instructions 
given by the high-order controller; an optical head 120 that 
irradiates the optical disc 1 with a laser beam to perform a 
read/write operation on it; a laser control section 130 for 
controlling the power of the laser beam that has been emitted 
from the optical head 120; a mechanism control section 140 
for moving the optical head 120 to a target location and 
performing a servo control operation; a memory 150 for 
managing the user data that has been read or written and 
various other kinds of information; a management informa 
tion storage memory 160 for storing various management 
information such as information about the latest SBM 30, 
TDFL 31 or TDDS 32 that has been read from, or written on, 
the TDMA and DMA; and a system control section 170 for 
controlling the overall system processing including read/ 
write processing on the optical disc 1. 
The system control section 170 includes: a writing section 

171 and a reading section 172 for reading and writing data 
including user data and management information; an access 
location managing section 173 for determining the location 
on the optical disc 1, which data is going to be read from, or 
written on next time, by reference to the management infor 
mation about the optical disc 1: a management information 
updating section 174 for updating the management informa 
tion that is stored in the management information storage 
memory 160; and a management information generating sec 
tion 175 for generating TDMS 21 and DMS to be written on 
the TDMA or DMA by combining the data to be updated from 
the SBM 30, TDFL 31 and TDDS 32 that are stored in the 
management information storage memory 160. 

(5) Method for Writing (or Initializing) Initial TDMS 
2O 

FIG. 7 is a flowchart showing the procedure in which the 
optical disc reading/writing apparatus 100 performs initializ 
ing formatting processing (i.e., initialization) on the write 
once optical disc 1. 

First, in Step 701, management information in an initial 
state is generated. Specifically, the management information 
generating section 175 generates SBM 30, TDFL 31 and 
TDDS 32 in the initial state in the management information 
storage memory 160. In this case, the SBM 30, TDFL 31 and 
TDDS 32 in the initial state refer to pieces of management 
information, for which only identifier information has been 
defined but of which the number of times of update is all Zero. 
As for the SBM 30 and TDFL 31, the “SBM 30 and TDFL 31 
in the initial state' are synonymous with the “initial SBM 30 
and “initial TDFL 31', respectively. 

Next, in Step 702, the initial TDMS 20 is generated. Spe 
cifically, the management information generating section 175 
makes the initial TDMS 20 in a writing form by combining 
the SBM 30, TDFL 31 and TDDS 32 with each other so that 
the management information in the initial State that has been 
generated in the previous processing step 701 has the form of 
the initial TDMS 20 shown in FIG. 3. More specifically, the 
management information generating section 175 secures a 
data area of three blocks for writing in the management infor 
mation storage memory 160, resets that area entirely with 
data Zero, and then arranges the initial TDFL 31 at the top of 
the first block, the TDDS 32 at the end of the first block, the 
initial SBM 30 from the top of the second block, and the 
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TDDS32 at the end of the third block, thereby generating data 
corresponding to the initial TDMS20. As for the TDDS32, its 
value will change when the location information is updated in 
the processing step 703 or 705 to be described later. That is 
why it is preferred that the TDDS 32 not be arranged at this 5 
point in time but be arranged just before the write operation is 
performed. 

Subsequently, in Step 703, the location information about 
the TDFL 31 is updated. Specifically, just before starting a 
write operation, the management information updating sec- 10 
tion 174 updates the DFL location information in the data 
corresponding to the TDDS 32 that has been generated in the 
management information storage memory 160. More specifi 
cally, the system control section 170 uses the access location 
managing section 173 and thereby calculates a writing loca- 15 
tion (e.g., the top location of the TDMA 17) on which the 
initial TDMS20 can be written. Meanwhile, the management 
information updating section 174 updates the DFL #0 loca 
tion information 57 so that the information 57 points to the 
writing location (e.g., the top location of the TDMA 17) that 20 
has been calculated by the access location managing section 
173, and also resets all of the DEL #1 location information58, 
DFL H2 location information 59 and DEL #3 location infor 
mation 60 into zero. Then, those data are arranged at their 
predetermined location (e.g., at the end of the first block in 25 
this case) in the data area that has been secured for writing in 
the management information storage memory 160. 
As for the location information about the SBM 30, it is still 

unknown exactly at which location that information will be 
written eventually. That is why the location information about 30 
the SBM 30 may either remain Zero or its location informa 
tion may be predicted on the supposition that that piece of 
information will also be written properly. 

Next, in Step 704, a part of the initial TDMS 20 is written. 
Specifically, the system control section 170 instructs the laser 35 
control section 130 to set writing conditions including laser 
power and write strategy, gets the optical head 120 moved by 
the mechanism control section 140 to the writing location that 
has been determined by the access location managing section 
173 in the previous processing step 703, and then gets the 40 
combined data of the initial TDFL 31 and TDDS32, which is 
the data of the first block of the initial TDMS 20, written by 
the writing section 171. If the write operation on this block 3 
has failed, then the same series of processing steps are carried 
out all over again from the processing step 703 and the write 45 
operation is repeatedly performed until everything is written 
correctly. 

Thereafter, in Step 705, the location information about the 
SBM 30 is updated. Specifically, on the verge of starting a 
write operation, the management information updating sec- 50 
tion 174 updates the SBM location information in the data 
corresponding to the TDDS 32 that has been generated in the 
management information storage memory 160. More specifi 
cally, the system control section 170 calculates a writing 
location (e.g., the second block as counted from the top of the 55 
TDMA 17 if the write operation has been done successfully at 
the first attempt in the previous processing step 704) next to 
the location on which a part of the initial TDMS 20 has been 
written in the previous processing step 704 by using the 
access location managing section 173. Meanwhile, the man- 60 
agement information updating section 174 updates the SBM 
#0 location information 56 so that the information 56 points to 
the writing location (e.g., the top of the second block as 
counted from the top of the TDMA 17) that has been calcu 
lated by the access location managing section 173, and also 65 
updates the SBM #1 location information 61 so that the infor 
mation 61 points to the next block location (i.e., the top of the 
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third block as counted from the top of the TDMA 17). It 
should be noted that the write operation is performed with the 
DFL #0 location information 57 pointing to the same writing 
location as in the previous processing step 704 and with the 
DFL #1, #2 and #3 location information 58, 59 and 60 all 
supposed to be zero (i.e., as in the TDDS 32 that has been 
written in the previous processing step 704). 

Next, in Step 706, another part of the initial TDMS 20 is 
written. Specifically, the system control section 170 instructs 
the laser control section 130 to set writing conditions includ 
ing laser power and write strategy, gets the optical head 120 
moved by the mechanism control section 140 to the writing 
location that has been determined by the access location 
managing section 173 in the previous processing step 705, 
and then gets the combined data of the initial SBM 30 and 
TDDS32, which is the data of the remaining two (i.e., second 
and third) blocks of the initial TDMS 20, written by the 
writing section 171. If the write operation on any of these 
blocks has failed, then the same series of processing steps are 
carried out all over again on that block in question from the 
processing step 705 and the write operation is repeatedly 
performed until everything is written correctly on every 
block. 

Although not described for this flow, the TDDS 32 may 
contain information about the number of times of update in 
the DDS header 50. During the initializing formatting pro 
cessing, Zero or any other appropriate value indicating that it 
is information that has been written during the initializing 
formatting processing is written as the number of times of 
update. In this case, each of the SBM 30 and the TDFL 31 is 
written only once during the initializing formatting process 
ing, and therefore, may be written with their information 
about the number of times of update supposed to be zero. As 
for the TDDS32, on the other hand, the TDDS is written twice 
during the initializing formatting processing. In that case, the 
write operation is also performed with its information about 
the number of times of update supposed to be zero in order to 
indicate that each TDDS 32 is included in the initial TDMS 
20. However, the write operation may also be performed with 
the information about the number of times of update Sup 
posed to be zero for the first TDDS32 to write and one for the 
second TDDS 32 to write, respectively. That is to say, the 
write operation may be performed with the exact number of 
times of update set each time. 
By performing these processing steps, the processing of 

writing the initial TDMS20 gets done during the initializing 
formatting. According to the method described above, data 
including the TDDS 32 can always be arranged at the top 
location of the TDMA 17. That is why even if the data size of 
management information has increased due to an increase in 
the number of recording layers stacked in a single disc or an 
increase in the storage density of a disc, the area arrangement 
of the optical disc 1 can still be understood by reading outdata 
from a predetermined location even without searching the 
TDMA 17 for the latest piece of management information. 
(Embodiment 2) 

(1) Area Arrangement 

An optical disc 1 as a second specific preferred embodi 
ment of the present invention has the same area arrangement 
(or layout) as what has already been described for the optical 
disc 1 of the first preferred embodiment of the present inven 
tion. 

(2) Data Arrangement of Initial TDMS 20 

FIG. 8 illustrates the data arrangement of an initial tempo 
rary disc management structure (TDMS) 20 that is written at 
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the top of the temporary disc management area (TDMA) 17 
(or the first one of multiple TDMAs) of the optical disc 1 
according to the second preferred embodiment of the present 
invention. 

In the initial TDMS 20 of this second preferred embodi- 5 
ment of the present invention, the initial space bitmap (SBM) 
30 has different contents from its counterpart of the first 
preferred embodiment of the present invention described 
above. 

Since the bitmap information 41 of the SBM 30 needs to 
have a size of one block (i.e., 32 sectors), the combined data 
of the SBM 30 and the temporary disc definition structure 
(TDDS) 32 (i.e., the disc management structure update unit) 
should have a size corresponding to two blocks. As shown in 
FIG. 8, the initial SBM 30 included in the initial TDMS 20 of 
this second preferred embodiment of the present invention is 
characterized by consisting of the SBM header 40 alone and 
having no bitmap information 41. 

This point will be described in further detail. When the 20 
initial TDMS 20 is written (i.e., when the initializing format 
ting is carried out), the entire storage area (including the data 
area 5) on the optical disc 1 is still unrecorded. That is to say, 
the bitmap information 41 of the SBM 30 contained in the 
initial TDMS 20 is written as data consisting of zeros only. In 25 
other words, even if no data has actually been written yet, the 
bitmap information 41 included in the initial TDMS 20 can 
still be detected. That is why the initial SBM 30 of this 
preferred embodiment consists of the SBM header 40 alone, 
with no bitmap information 41, in order to reduce the size of 
the initial TOMS 20, which is one of the features of this 
preferred embodiment. 

Portion (a) of FIG. 8 illustrates an exemplary layout for the 
initial TDMS 20. Each of the initial temporary defect list 
(TDFL)31 and the TDDS32 to be included in combination in 
the initial TDMS 20 has only to have a size of one sector, so 
does the initial SBM 30. That is why data of one block, 
including the initial SBM 30, the initial TDFL 31 and the 
TDDS 32, is treated as a disc management structure update 40 
unit only for the initial TDMS 20 and these pieces of infor 
mation are written as one block collectively. 

Portion (b) of FIG. 8 illustrates another exemplary layout 
for the initial TDMS20. As in the first preferred embodiment 
of the present invention described above, the first block of the 45 
initial TDMS 20 is data of one block (i.e., a disc management 
structure update unit), which is a combination of the initial 
TDFL 31 and the TDDS 32 to be written (or arranged) at the 
top location, and the next block thereof is data of another 
block (i.e., a disc management structure update unit), which is 
a combination of the initial SBM 30 and the TDDS 32 to be 
written (or arranged) next. 
As shown in these drawings, by introducing the initial 

SBM 30 as data consisting of the SBM header 40 alone into 
the initial TDMS 20, data including the TDDS32 can always 
be arranged on the first block at the top location of the TDMA 
17 (or on the first one of its following blocks on which a 
read/write operation can be performed properly if the first 
block is a defective block). 60 
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(3) Various Kinds of Information Contained in 
TDDS 32 

In the optical disc 1 of the second preferred embodiment of 65 
the present invention, each TDDS 32 contains the same data 
as its counterpart of the optical disc 1 of the first preferred 
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embodiment of the present invention that has already been 
described with reference to FIG. 4. 

(4) Reading/Writing Apparatus 

An optical disc reading/writing apparatus 100 for perform 
ing a read/write operation on the optical disc 1 of this second 
preferred embodiment of the present invention has the same 
configuration as its counterpart of the first preferred embodi 
ment of the present invention that has already been described 
with reference to FIG. 6. 

(5) Method for Writing (or Initializing) Initial TDMS 
2O 

FIG. 9 is a flowchart showing the procedure in which the 
optical disc reading/writing apparatus 100 performs initializ 
ing formatting processing (i.e., initialization) on the write 
once optical disc 1 according to the second preferred embodi 
ment of the present invention. In the example to be described 
below, the initial TDMS 20 is supposed to be written as one 
block collectively as shown in portion (a) of FIG.8. It should 
be noted that the procedure of writing as shown in portion (b) 
of FIG. 8 is basically the same as what has already been 
described in Section (5) with reference to FIG. 7 for the first 
preferred embodiment of the present invention, and the 
description thereof will be omitted herein. 

First, in Step 901, management information in an initial 
state is generated. Specifically, the management information 
generating section 175 generates SBM 30, TDFL 31 and 
TDDS 32 in the initial state in the management information 
storage memory 160. In this case, the SBM 30, TDFL 31 and 
TDDS 32 in the initial state refer to pieces of management 
information, for which only identifier information has been 
defined but of which the number of times of update is all Zero. 
As for the SBM 30 and TDFL 31, the “SBM 30 and TDFL 31 
in the initial state' are synonymous with the “initial SBM 30 
and “initial TDFL 31', respectively. 

Next, in Step 902, the initial TDMS 20 is generated. Spe 
cifically, the management information generating section 175 
makes the initial TDMS 20 in a writing form by combining 
the SBM 30, TDFL 31 and TDDS 32 with each other so that 
the management information in the initial State that has been 
generated in the previous processing step 901 has the form of 
the initial TDMS 20 shown in portion (a) of FIG. 8. More 
specifically, the management information generating section 
175 secures a data area of one block for writing in the man 
agement information storage memory 160, resets that area 
entirely with data Zero, and then arranges the initial TDFL 31 
at the first sector of that block, the initial SBM 30 at the 
second last sector of that block, and the TDDS 32 at the last 
sector of that block, thereby generating data corresponding to 
the initial TDMS 20. As for the TDDS 32, its value will 
change when the location information is updated in the pro 
cessing step 903 to be described later. That is why it is pre 
ferred that the TDDS 32 not be arranged at this point in time 
but be arranged just before the write operation is started. 

Subsequently, in Step 903, the location information about 
the TDFL 31 and the SBM 30 is updated. Specifically, just 
before starting a write operation, the management informa 
tion updating section 174 updates the DFL location informa 
tion and the SBM location information in the data corre 
sponding to the TDDS 32 that has been generated in the 
management information storage memory 160. More specifi 
cally, the system control section 170 uses the access location 
managing section 173 and thereby calculates a writing loca 
tion (e.g., the top location of the TDMA 17) on which the 
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initial TDMS20 can be written. Meanwhile, the management 
information updating section 174 updates the DEL #0 loca 
tion information 57 so that the information 57 points to the 
writing location (e.g., the top location of the TDMA 17) that 
has been calculated by the access location managing section 
173, and also resets all of the DFL #1, #2 and #3 location 
information 58, 59 and 60 into zero. Furthermore, the man 
agement information updating section 174 also updates the 
SBM #0 location information 56 so that the information 56 
points to its writing location in the same block (e.g., the top of 
the 31 sector as counted from the top of the first block of the 
TDMA 17). On the other hand, the SBM #1 location infor 
mation 61 is set to be either Zero or a value indicating that 
there is effective bitmap information 41 but that the informa 
tion has not been written yet (e.g., FFFFFFFFh, which is a 
hexadecimal number). Then, those data are arranged at their 
predetermined location (e.g., at the end of the first block in 
this case) in the data area that has been secured for writing in 
the management information storage memory 160. 

Next, in Step 904, a part of the initial TOMS 20 is written. 
Specifically, the system control section 170 instructs the laser 
control section 130 to set writing conditions including laser 
power and write strategy, gets the optical head 120 moved by 
the mechanism control section 140 to the writing location that 
has been determined by the access location managing section 
173 in the previous processing step 903, and then gets the 
combined data of the initial SBM 30, initial TDFL 31 and 
TDDS32, which is the data of the initial TDMS 20, written by 
the writing section 171. If the write operation on this block 3 
has failed, then the same series of processing steps are carried 
out all over again from the processing step 903 and the write 
operation is repeatedly performed until everything is written 
correctly. 
By performing these processing steps, the processing of 

writing the initial TDMS20 gets done during the initializing 
formatting. 

According to the method described above, data including 
the TDDS32 can always be arranged at the top location of the 
TDMA 17. That is why even if the data size of management 
information has increased due to an increase in the number of 
recording layers stacked in a single disc or an increase in the 
storage density of a disc, the area arrangement of the optical 
disc 1 can still be understood by reading out data from a 
predetermined location even without searching the TDMA 17 
for the latest piece of management information. 
(Embodiment 3) 

(1) Area Arrangement 

An optical disc 1 as a third specific preferred embodiment 
of the present invention has the same area arrangement (or 
layout) as what has already been described for the optical disc 
1 of the first preferred embodiment of the present invention. 

(2) Data Arrangement of Initial TDMS 20 

FIG. 10 illustrates the data arrangement of an initial tem 
porary disc management structure (TDMS) 20 that is written 
at the top of the temporary disc management area (TDMA) 17 
(or the first one of multiple TDMAs) of the optical disc 1 
according to the third preferred embodiment of the present 
invention. 

In the initial TDMS 20 of this third preferred embodiment 
of the present invention, the initial space bitmap (SBM) 30 
has the same structure as, but is written in a different way 
from, the counterpart of the first preferred embodiment of the 
present invention described above. 
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As shown in FIG. 10, the initial TDMS 20 also includes an 

initial space bitmap (SBM) 30, temporary disc definition 
structures (TDDS’s) 32 and an initial temporary defect list 
(TDFL)31 as in what is shown in FIG. 17 but these elements 
are written in a different way. 

Specifically, the SBM 30, which is a combination of an 
SBM header 40 with a size of one sector and bitmap infor 
mation 41 with a size of 31 sectors or more, has a size of at 
least 32 sectors (i.e., one block). In this preferred embodi 
ment, such an SBM 30 is split into two space bitmaps, each 
having a size of at most 31 sectors (i.e., initial SBM #030 and 
initial SBM #130). Each of these two fragments of data is 
combined with the TDDS 32 to generate data with a size of 
one block as a single disc management structure update unit. 
And the write operation is supposed to be performed on that 
unit. In this manner, each of those space bitmaps is defined to 
have a size of one block when combined with the TDDS 32 
irrespective of the size of the user data area 14. 
More specifically, if the combined size of the SBM header 

40 and the bitmap information 41 is one block and one sector 
(i.e., 33 sectors in total if the SBM header 40 has a size of one 
sector and the bitmap information 41 has a size of 32 sectors), 
then an initial SBM #030 with effective data of 17 sectors, 
consisting of the SBM header 40 and the first half (i.e., 16 
sectors) of the bitmap information 41 (which will be referred 
to herein as “partial bitmap information #041), and another 
initial SBM H130 with effective data of 16 Sectors that are the 
second half of the bitmap information 41 (which will be 
referred to herein as “partial bitmap information #141') are 
formed. Then, each of those SBMs is combined with the 
TDDS 32, thereby forming a disc management structure 
update unit and performing a write operation based on that 
unit. As a result, a write operation can be performed so that the 
TDDS 32 is arranged on every block as shown in FIG. 10. 

In this preferred embodiment, the size of the user data area 
14 in a situation where the combined size of the bitmap 
information 41, the TDDS 32 and the SBM header 40 is one 
block is supposed to be a “predefined size'. If the size of the 
user data area 14 on a predetermined recording layer exceeds 
that predefined size, the bitmap information 41 is split into 
multiple pieces of bitmap information (e.g., two pieces of 
bitmap information, which will be referred to herein as “par 
tial bitmap information #041 and “partial bitmap informa 
tion #141, respectively, if the size of the user data area 14 is 
twice or less as large as the predefined size). In that case, each 
of the multiple space bitmaps (i.e., SBMs #0 and #1 30) 
includes its associated one of the multiple pieces of bitmap 
information. Each of the multiple space bitmaps (SBMs #0 
and #130) has a size of one block when combined with the 
TDDS 32. 

It should be noted that as for the data of one block, which 
is a combination of either the initial SBM H030 and the TDDS 
32 or the initial SBM #130 and the TDDS 32, data other than 
the 17 Sectors of the initial SBM #030 and the one sector of 
the TDDS 32 and the data other than two sectors of the initial 
SBM H130 and one sector of the TDDS 32 are not to be used. 
That is why Such non-used data may be either dummy data 
consisting of Zeros only or padding data indicating its mean 
inglessness and those non-used data are combined, thereby 
generating and writing data with a size of one block. 

With such an arrangement, even if the size of the SBM 30 
(more specifically, the bitmap information 41) increases with 
the storage capacity per recording layer (i.e., the size of the 
user data area 14) so much that the size of the disc manage 
ment structure update unit, i.e., the combined size of the SBM 
30 and the TDDS 32, exceeds one block (i.e., two blocks or 
more), data including the TDDS32 can always be arranged at 
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the first block of the TDMA 17. And if that first block is a 
defective one, that data can be arranged at the first one of its 
following blocks on which a read/write operation can be 
performed properly. More specifically, with Such an arrange 
ment, the TDDS 32 can be written on every block of the 
TDMA 17 on which the initial TDMS 20 has been written. 

It should be noted that this writing method is applicable to 
not just the initial TDMS20 during the initializing formatting 
processing but also a normal TDMS 21 while an ordinary 
write operation is performed on the TDMA. 

In the example described above, the bitmap information 41 
with a size of 32 sectors is supposed to be split into partial 
bitmap information including the data of the first 16 sectors 
thereof and partial bitmap information including the data of 
the last 16 sectors thereof and those two pieces of partial 
bitmap information are Supposed to be arranged separately in 
the SBM #030, which is the first one block of the SBM 30 of 
the initial TDMS 20, and in the SEM #1 30, which is the 
second one block of the SBM 30, respectively. The advantage 
to be achieved by such an arrangement will be described. 

Specifically, the bitmap information 41 changes when a 
write operation is performed on an area range to be managed 
by reference to the bitmap information 41 of the SBM 30. In 
Such a situation, if the write operation has been performed on 
only a block corresponding to an area managed by reference 
to the first 16 sectors of the bitmap information 41, just the 
first 16 sectors of the bitmap information 41 change but the 
other 16 sectors remain the same. 

In that case, only the SBM #030 including the data of the 
first 16 sectors of the bitmap information 41 (i.e., the partial 
bitmap information #0 41) needs to be updated in the SBM 
30. For example, if a write operation has been performed on 
only the area to be managed by reference to the first 16 sectors 
(i.e., the partial bitmap information #0 41) of the bitmap 
information 41 (i.e., injust a part of the area to be managed by 
reference to the bitmap information 41 of the SBM 30) and 
the bitmap information 41 has changed as shown in portion 
(a) of FIG. 11 after the initializing formatting processing has 
gotten done, just the SBM #0 changed needs to be updated as 
shown in portion (b) of FIG. 11. 

In that case, the SBM #0 location information 56 pointed to 
by the TDDS 32 is changed into one that points to the top 
location of the block D that has just been written newly, but 
the SBM #1 location information 61 may be left as it is so as 
to still point to the top location of the block B on which the 
previous write operation has been performed. 

If only a part of the management information (such as the 
SBM 30) to be updated is written on the TDMA 17 as 
described above, the TDMA 17, which is a management 
information area, can be used more efficiently compared to a 
situation where the data of the entire SBM 30 (with a size of 
two blocks in this example) should be written every time. 

Nevertheless, if only such a part to be updated is written on 
the TDMA 17, the information about the number of times of 
update contained in the SBM header 40 would be a problem. 
That is to say, every time the SBM 30 to be written is updated, 
the write operation should be performed with the information 
about the number of times of update incremented one by one 
in the SBM header 40. That is why according to the arrange 
ment in which the SBM header 40 is included in only the 
SBM #030 as shown in FIG. 10, even if a write operation has 
been performed on an area to be managed by reference to the 
partial bitmap information #141 included in the SBM #130 
and if just that partial bitmap information #141 of the SBM 
#130 has changed, not only the SBM #130 but also the SBM 
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#030, including the SBM header 40 with the information 
about the number of times of update, should be written at the 
same time. 
To overcome such a problem, the SBM header 40 may be 

provided for every disc management structure update unit 
with a size of one block including the bitmap information 41 
as shown in FIG. 12. That is to say, the SBM header 40 may 
be provided for not just the SBM #030 but also the SBM #1 
30 as well. In that case, the SBM #130 consists of the SBM 
header and the second 16 sectors of the bitmap information 41 
(i.e., the partial bitmap information #141) and has effective 
data with a size of 17 sectors. Then, there will be multiple 
(e.g., two in this example) independent SBMs 30 on a prede 
termined recording layer. 
More particularly, the SBM header 40 contains informa 

tion about the area range to be managed by reference to the 
SBM. That is to say, the user data area 14 to be managed by 
reference to the bitmap information 41 is split into an area 
range to be managed with the SBM #030 and an area range to 
be managed with the SBM #130 and the SBM header 40 is 
provided for each of these two ranges to manage it. The area 
ranges to be managed by reference to the SBM #030 and the 
SBM #130 are different from each other. That is why the 
SBM header 40, containing information about the area ranges 
to managed with the SBM, is preferably provided for both of 
the SBMs #0 and #130. Also, to update the information about 
the number of times of update as described above, the SBM 
header 40 is preferably provided for both of the SBMs #0 and 
#130 when the SBM 30 is partially updated. 
As described above, each of the multiple space bitmaps 

(SBMs #0 and #130) for use to manage the user data area 14 
on a predetermined recording layer may have a header (i.e., 
the SBM header 40) containing information about the area 
range to be managed by reference to the partial bitmap infor 
mation (i.e., the partial bitmap information #0 or #1 41) 
contained in itself. Furthermore, the header (i.e., the SBM 
header 40) of each of the multiple space bitmaps (SBMs #0 
and #1 30) may contain information about the number of 
times of update of the space bitmap SBM 30. 
As a result, ifa write operation has been performed only on 

the area to be managed by reference to the partial bitmap 
information #141 included in SBM #130 and if only the 
partial bitmap information #141 of SBM #130 has changed, 
just that SBM #130 can be updated. On the other hand, if the 
partial bitmap information of both SBMs #0 and #130 has 
changed, a TDMS 21 including both of those SBMs #0 and #1 
30 is written on the TDMA 17. However, if only the partial 
bitmap information #141 of SBM #130 has changed, then a 
TDMS 21 including SBM #130 but not including SBM #030 
is written on the TDMA 17. 
As described above, if a write operation has been per 

formed on a management area to be managed by reference to 
a particular piece of partial bitmap information, then the 
space bitmap included in that particular piece of partial bit 
map information has only to be updated and written on the 
temporary disc management area TDMA 17. If a write opera 
tion has been performed on a space bitmap management area 
including a particular piece of bitmap information, there is no 
need to update every space bitmap and write it on the tempo 
rary disc management area TDMA 17. That is to say, since 
only a portion of the management information to be updated 
can be written on the TDMA 17 in this manner, the temporary 
disc management area TDMA 17 can be used more effi 
ciently. 

In the example described above, the bitmap information 41 
with a size of 32 sectors is supposed to be evenly split into first 
16 sectors and second 16 sectors to be assigned as respective 
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pieces of partial bitmap information to the SBMs #0 and #1 
30. However, the assignment does not always have to be done 
evenly. 

For example, it would also be efficient to assign the first 30 
sectors (i.e., the maximum size that any piece of partial bit 
map information can possibly have) to the SBM #030 and the 
last two sectors to the SBM #130, respectively. This would be 
effective particularly when only the SBM #030 has the SBM 
header 40 with information about the number of times of 
update. In that case, the size of the area to be managed with the 
bitmap information 41 contained in the SBM #030 including 
the SBM header 40 that must be written every time the SBM 
30 is written on the TDMA 17 is preferably greater than that 
of the area to be managed with the bitmap information 41 
contained in the SBM #130 with no SBM header 40. In Such 
a situation, the bigger the area to be managed by reference to 
the bitmap information 41, the higher the probability of 
change of the bitmap information 41 and the less often the 
SBM #130 needs to be updated as a result. 

For that reason, if only the partial bitmap information of the 
SBMs #0 and #130 has changed, a TDMS 21 including both 
the SBM H030 and the SBM H130 is written on the TDMA 
17. However, if only the partial bitmap information #141 of 
the SBM #130 has changed, a TDMS 21 including the SBM 
#130 but not including the SBM #030 may be written on the 
TDMA 17. Consequently, the effect of selectively writing 
only a part of the management information to be updated on 
the TDMA 17 as described above can be achieved. 

Optionally, the header (i.e., the SBM header 40) of the 
multiple space bitmaps (i.e., the SBMs #0 and #130) may 
include an identifier indicating that this information is a space 
bitmap (i.e., the SBM #0 or #130) and information about the 
area range to be managed by reference to the partial bitmap 
information (i.e., the partial bitmap information #0 or #141) 
that each of those space bitmaps (SBMs #0 and #130) has. 
Examples of those pieces of information about the area range 
to be managed by reference to the partial bitmap information 
include the top address and size of the area in question. 
As a result, by retrieving information (e.g., the top address 

and size of the area in question) about the area range to be 
managed with the header of a particular space bitmap, that 
area managed by reference to that particular space bitmap can 
be located. In addition, if such information about the area 
range to be managed by reference to the header (e.g., the top 
address and size of the area in question) is included, any 
arbitrary size can be assigned to the space bitmap manage 
ment area and the assignment patterns can be changed easily, 
thus allowing the user a broader range of selectivity (or flex 
ibility). 

(3) Various Kinds of Information Contained in 
TDDS 32 

In the optical disc 1 of the third preferred embodiment of 
the present invention, each TDDS 32 contains the same data 
as its counterpart of the optical disc 1 of the first preferred 
embodiment of the present invention that has already been 
described with reference to FIG. 4. 

(4) Reading/writing Apparatus 

An optical disc reading/writing apparatus 100 for perform 
ing a read/write operation on the optical disc 1 of this third 
preferred embodiment of the present invention has the same 
configuration as its counterpart of the first preferred embodi 
ment of the present invention that has already been described 
with reference to FIG. 6. 
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Hereinafter, it will be described what processing will be 

done by the apparatus and method for writing information on 
the optical disc 1 of the third preferred embodiment of the 
present invention if the size of the user data area 14 of a 
particular recording layer exceeds a predetermined size (e.g., 
the size of the user data area in a situation where the bitmap 
information 41, the TDDS 32 and the SBM header 40 have a 
combined size of one block). In that case, multiple space 
bitmaps (e.g., SBMs #0 and #130) are formed with respect to 
the user data area of the particular recording layer. Then, a 
disc management structure update unit, including one of the 
multiple space bitmaps (SBMs #0 and #130) and the disc 
definition structure TDD 32, is written on the temporary disc 
management area TDMA 17. 

Such writing processing and the writing processing to be 
described later are carried out by making the system control 
section 170 (see FIG. 6) control the respective components of 
the reading/writing apparatus 100 and by having the optical 
head 120 irradiate the optical disc 1 with a laser beam. 

Also, if the size of the user data area 14 of a particular 
recording layer exceeds a predetermined size (e.g., the size of 
the user data area 14 in a situation where the bitmap informa 
tion 41, the TDDS 32 and the SBM header 40 have a com 
bined size of one block), then the bitmap information 41 is 
split into multiple pieces of partial bitmap information (i.e., 
partial bitmap information #0 and #141). Then one of those 
pieces of partial bitmap information may be provided for each 
of the multiple space bitmaps (i.e., the SBMs #0 and #130). 

Also, the disc management structure update unit is written 
on a block at a predetermined location in the temporary disc 
management area TDMA 17. Alternatively, instead of such a 
disc management structure update unit, a second disc man 
agement structure update unit, including the disc definition 
Structure TDDS 32 and the initial defect list TDFL 31 and 
having a size of one block, may also be written. In that case, 
the temporary disc definition structure TDDS32 may include 
the location information of the initial defect list. 
The initial defect list TDFL 31 is a TDFL of the Smallest 

size including no DFL entries 43 at all, which are pieces of 
information about a defective area. That is to say, the initial 
defect list TDFL31 is a TDFL including a DFL header 42, for 
which only identifier information is defined and in which the 
number of DFL entries 43 and information about the number 
of times of update are Zero, and a DFL terminator 44, for 
which identifier information is defined and in which informa 
tion about the number of times of update is Zero. As the initial 
TDFL 31 has a size that is equal to or smaller than one sector, 
the combined size will be equal to or smaller than one block 
(i.e., one cluster) even when written along with the TDDS32. 

Also, the “block at a predetermined location in the tempo 
rary disc management area TDMA 17 refers to the first one 
of multiple readable and writable blocks in the temporary disc 
management area TDMA 17. 

Hereinafter, an apparatus and method for reading informa 
tion from the optical disc 1 of the third preferred embodiment 
of the present invention will be described. The reading pro 
cessing is carried out by having the optical head 120 irradiate 
the optical disc 1 with a laser beam, receiving its reflected 
light to generate a read signal, and then making the system 
control section 170 (see FIG. 6) control the respective com 
ponents of the reading/writing apparatus 100. 
A number of space bitmaps (i.e., the SBMs #0 and #130) 

are formed with respect to the user data area 14 in a particular 
recording layer. In the temporary disc management area 
TDMA 17 of the optical disc 1, stored is a disc management 
structure update unit including one of those space bitmaps 
(SBMs #0 and #130) and the temporary disc definition struc 
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ture TDDS 32 and having a size of one block. From this 
temporary disc management area TDMA 17 of this optical 
disc 1, retrieved are a disc management structure update unit 
including the temporary disc definition structure TDDS 32 
and having a size of one block and the space bitmap (i.e., 
SBM #0 or #130). 

Also, in the optical disc 1 of this preferred embodiment, the 
bitmap information 41 is split into multiple pieces of partial 
bitmap information (i.e., partial bitmap information #0 and #1 
41) and one of those pieces of partial bitmap information is 
provided for each of the multiple space bitmaps (i.e., the 
SBMs #0 and #130). One of those space bitmaps may be read 
from Such an optical disc 1 and partial bitmap information 
(which may be partial bitmap information #0 or #141) may be 
retrieved from that space bitmap. 

Also, on a block at a predetermined location in the tempo 
rary disc management area TDMA 17 of the optical disc 1 of 
this preferred embodiment, stored is either a disc manage 
ment structure update unit or a second disc management 
structure update unit including the temporary disc definition 
Structure TDDS 32 and the initial defect list TDFL 31 and 
having a size of one block. In that case, either the disc man 
agement structure update unit or the second disc management 
structure update unit may be read from a block at a predeter 
mined location in the temporary disc management area 
TDMA 17. Optionally, the temporary disc definition structure 
TDDS 32 may have information about the location of an 
initial defect list. In this case, the “block at a predetermined 
location in the temporary disc management area TDMA 17 
may be the first one of multiple readable and writable blocks 
in the temporary disc management area TDMA 17. 

(5) Method for Writing (or Initializing) Initial TDMS 
2O 

FIG. 13 is a flowchart showing the procedure in which the 
optical disc reading/writing apparatus 100 performs initializ 
ing formatting processing (i.e., initialization) on the write 
once optical disc 1 according to the third preferred embodi 
ment of the present invention. 

First, in Step 1301, management information in an initial 
state is generated. Specifically, the management information 
generating section 175 generates SBM 30, TDFL 31 and 
TDDS 32 in the initial state in the management information 
storage memory 160. In this case, the SBM 30, TDFL 31 and 
TDDS 32 in the initial state refer to pieces of management 
information, for which only identifier information has been 
defined but of which the number of times of update is all Zero. 
As for the SBM 30 and TDFL 31, the “SBM 30 and TDFL 31 
in the initial state' are synonymous with the “initial SBM 30 
and “initial TDFL 31', respectively. 

Next, in Step 1302, the initial TDMS 20 is generated. 
Specifically, the management information generating section 
175 makes the initial TDMS 20 in a writing form by combin 
ing the SBM 30, TDFL 31 and TDDS 32 with each other so 
that the management information in the initial state that has 
been generated in the previous processing step 1301 has the 
form of the initial TDMS 20 shown in FIG. 10. 
More specifically, if the SBM 30 has a size of one block and 

one sector (i.e., 33 sectors), for example, the management 
information generating section 175 secures a data area of 
three blocks for writing in the management information Stor 
age memory 160, resets that area entirely with data Zero, and 
then arranges data corresponding to the first 17 sectors (i.e., 
the initial SBM #030 consisting of one sector of the SBM 
header 40 and the first 16 sectors of the bitmap information 41 
(partial bitmap information #0 41)) for the initial SBM 30 
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from the top of the first block. The management information 
generating section 175 also arranges the TDDS 32 at the last 
sector of the first block, data corresponding to the second 16 
sectors (i.e., the initial SBM #130 including the partial bit 
map information #141) for the initial SBM 30 from the top of 
the second block, the TDDS 32 at the last sector of the second 
block, the initial TDFL 31 at the top of the third block, and the 
TDDS 32 at the last sector of the third block, thereby gener 
ating data corresponding to the initial TDMS 20. 
As shown in FIG. 12, each of the multiple space bitmaps 

(SBMs #0 and #130) for use to manage the user data area 14 
on a predetermined recording layer may have a header (i.e., 
the SBM header 40) containing information about the area 
range to be managed by reference to the partial bitmap infor 
mation (i.e., the partial bitmap information #0 or #1 41) 
contained in itself. In that case, the data to be arranged at the 
top of the second block in the data area that has been secured 
in the management information storage memory 160 will be 
data of 17 sectors consisting of one sector of the SBM header 
40 and data of the second 16 sectors of the initial SBM (i.e., 
the initial SBM #130 including the partial bitmap informa 
tion #141). 

Furthermore, the SBM header 40 may include an identifier 
indicating that this information is a space bitmap and infor 
mation about the area range to be managed by reference to 
each of the multiple space bitmaps (e.g., the top address and 
size of the area in question). Also, the SBM header 40 may 
further contain information about the number of times of 
update of the space bitmap SBM 30. 
As for the TDDS 32, its value will change when the loca 

tion information is updated in the processing step 1303,1305 
or 1307 to be described later. That is why it is preferred that 
the TDDS 32 not be arranged at this point in time but be 
arranged just before the write operation is performed. 

Subsequently, in Step 1303, the location information about 
the SBM 30 is updated. Specifically, just before starting a 
write operation, the management information updating sec 
tion 174 updates the SBM location information in the data 
corresponding to the TDDS 32 that has been generated in the 
management information storage memory 160. More specifi 
cally, the system control section 170 uses the access location 
managing section 173 and thereby calculates a writing loca 
tion (e.g., the top location of the TDMA 17) on which the 
initial TDMS20 can be written. Meanwhile, the management 
information updating section 174 updates the SBM #0 loca 
tion information 56 so that the information 56 points to the 
writing location (e.g., the top location of the TDMA 17) that 
has been calculated by the access location managing section 
173, and also resets all of the DFL #1, #2 and #3 location 
information 58, 59 and 60 into zero. Then, those data are 
arranged at their predetermined location (e.g., at the last 
sector of the first block in this case) in the data area that has 
been secured for writing in the management information Stor 
age memory 160. 
As for the SBM #1 location information 61 that is infor 

mation about the location of the SBM 30 and the TDFL HO 
location information 57 that is information about the location 
of the TDFL 31, it is still unknown at this point in time exactly 
at which locations those pieces of information should be 
written eventually. That is why those pieces of location infor 
mation may either remain Zero or their location information 
may be predicted on the Supposition that those pieces of 
information will also be written properly. For example, the 
SBM #1 location information 61 may point to the top location 
of the second block as counted from the top of the TDMA 17 
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and the DFL #0 location information 57 may point to the top 
location of the third block as counted from the top of the 
TDMA 17. 

Next, in Step 1304, a part of the initial TDMS20 is written. 
Specifically, the system control section 170 instructs the laser 
control section 130 to set writing conditions including laser 
power and write strategy, gets the optical head 120 moved by 
the mechanism control section 140 to the writing location that 
has been determined by the access location managing section 
173 in the previous processing step 1303, and then gets the 
combined data of the initial SBM #030 and TDDS 32, which 
is the data of the first block of the initial TDMS 20, written by 
the writing section 171. If the write operation on this block 3 
has failed, then the same series of processing steps are carried 
out all over again from the processing step 1303 and the write 
operation is repeatedly performed until everything is written 
correctly. 

Thereafter, in Step 1305, the location information about the 
SBM 30 is updated. Specifically, on the verge of starting a 
write operation, the management information updating sec 
tion 174 updates the SBM location information in the data 
corresponding to the TDDS 32 that has been generated in the 
management information storage memory 160. More specifi 
cally, the system control section 170 gets a writing location on 
which the initial TDMS 20 can be written (e.g., the top loca 
tion of the second block as counted from the top of the TDMA 
17 if the write operation has been done successfully at the first 
attempt in the previous processing step 1304) calculated by 
the access location managing section 173. Meanwhile, the 
management information updating section 174 updates the 
SBM #1 location information 61 so that the information 61 
points to the writing location (e.g., the top location of the 
second block as counted from the top of the TDMA 17) that 
has been calculated by the access location managing section 
173. In this case, the SBM #0 location information 56 is 
Supposed to point to the location on which a write operation 
has been performed in the previous processing step 1304, and 
the DFL #1, #2 and #3 location information 58,59 and 60 is 
Supposed to be Zero. Then, those data are arranged at prede 
termined locations (e.g., at the last sector of the second block 
as counted from the top in this case) in the data area that has 
been secured for writing in the management information Stor 
age memory 160. 
As for the TDFL H0 location information 57 that is infor 

mation about the location of the TDFL 31, it is still unknown 
at this point in time exactly at which location that information 
will be written eventually. That is why the TDFL #0 location 
information 57 may either remain Zero or its location infor 
mation may be predicted on the Supposition that that piece of 
information will also be written properly. For example, the 
DFL #0 location information 57 may point to the top location 
of the third block as counted from the top of the TDMA 17, 
which is next location where the write operation can be per 
formed. 

Next, in Step 1306, a part of the initial TDMS20 is written. 
Specifically, the system control section 170 instructs the laser 
control section 130 to set writing conditions including laser 
power and write strategy, gets the optical head 120 moved by 
the mechanism control section 140 to the writing location that 
has been determined by the access location managing section 
173 in the previous processing step 1305, and then gets the 
combined data of the initial SBM #130 and TDDS 32, which 
is the data of the second block of the initial TDMS 20, written 
by the writing section 171. If the write operation on this block 
3 has failed, then the same series of processing steps are 
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carried out all over again from the processing step 1305 and 
the write operation is repeatedly performed until everything is 
written correctly. 

Thereafter, in Step 1307, the location information about the 
TDFL 31 is updated. Specifically, on the verge of starting a 
write operation, the management information updating sec 
tion 174 updates the TDFL location information. More spe 
cifically, the system control section 170 gets a writing loca 
tion on which the initial TDMS 20 can be written (e.g., the 
third block as counted from the top of the TDMA 17 if the 
write operation has been done successfully at the first attempt 
in the previous processing steps 1304 and 1306), next to the 
location on which the part of the initial TDMS 20 has been 
written in the previous processing step 1306, calculated by 
the access location managing section 173. Meanwhile, the 
management information updating section 174 updates the 
DFL H0 location information 57 So that the information 57 
points to the writing location (e.g., the top location of the third 
block as counted from the top of the TDMA 17) that has been 
calculated by the access location managing section 173. In 
this case, the SBM #0 location information 56 is updated to 
point to the location on which a write operation has been 
performed in the previous processing step 1304, the SBM #1 
location information 61 is updated to point to the location on 
which a write operation has been performed in the previous 
processing step 1306, and the DFL #1, #2 and #3 location 
information 58, 59 and 60 is written as Zero (i.e., as in the 
TDDS 32 that has been written in the processing step 1304). 

Next, in Step 1308, another part of the initial TDMS 20 is 
written. Specifically, the system control section 170 instructs 
the laser control section 130 to set writing conditions includ 
ing laser power and write strategy, gets the optical head 120 
moved by the mechanism control section 140 to the writing 
location that has been determined by the access location 
managing section 173 in the previous processing step 1307, 
and then gets the combined data of the initial TDFL 31 and 
TDDS 32, which is the data of the third block (i.e., the last 
block) of the initial TDMS 20, written by the writing section 
171. If the write operation on this block has failed, then the 
same series of processing steps are carried out all over again 
from the processing step 1307 and the write operation is 
repeatedly performed until everything is written correctly. 
The TDDS 32 contains information about the number of 

times of update in the DDS header 50. During the initializing 
formatting processing, Zero or any other appropriate value 
indicating that it is information that has been written during 
the initializing formatting processing is written as the number 
of times of update. In this case, each of the SBM 30 and the 
TDFL 31 is written only once during the initializing format 
ting processing, and therefore, may be written with their 
information about the number of times of update Supposed to 
be Zero. As for the TDDS32, on the other hand, the TDDS 32 
is written three times during the initializing formatting pro 
cessing. In that case, the write operation is performed with its 
information about the number of times of update Supposed to 
be zero in order to indicate that each TDDS 32 is included in 
the initial TDMS 20. However, the write operation may also 
be performed with the information about the number of times 
of update supposed to be zero for the first TDDS 32 to write, 
one for the Second TDDS 32 to write and two for the third 
TDDS 32 to write. That is to say, the write operation may be 
performed with the exact number of times of update set each 
time. 
By performing these processing steps, the processing of 

writing the initial TDMS20 gets done during the initializing 
formatting. 
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According to the method described above, the TDDS 32 
can be arranged in every block 3 to be written on the TDMA 
17 (i.e., the TDDS 322 can also be arranged at a predeter 
mined location such as the top location of the TDMA 17). 
That is why even if the data size of management information 
has increased due to an increase in the number of recording 
layers Stacked in a single disc or an increase in the storage 
density of a disc, the area arrangement of the optical disc 1 can 
still be understood just by reading out data from a predeter 
mined location even without searching the TDMA 17 for the 
latest piece of management information. 

It has been described with reference to FIG. 13 how to get 
a write operation done during the initializing formatting pro 
cessing. However, when a normal TDMS 21 including an 
SBM 30 is going to be written, for example, not both of the 
SBM #030 and SBM #130 that form the SBM 30 always 
have to be written as mentioned in Section (2) of the descrip 
tion of the third preferred embodiment of the present inven 
tion. That is to say, as in Section (2) of the description of the 
third preferred embodiment of the present invention, only 
some block of the SBM 30, in which the bitmap information 
41 is updated and which includes information to be written on 
the TDMA 17, may be written. 

The optical disc 1 of any of the first through third preferred 
embodiments of the present invention described above is a 
write-once optical disc with at least one recording layer. FIG. 
20 illustrates a cross section of the optical disc 1. In FIG. 20. 
a multilayer optical disc 1 with three recording layers is 
illustrated as an example. The optical disc 1 includes an 
information recording layer 1002 consisting of recording lay 
ers L0, L1 and L2 that are stacked in this order so that the 
recording layer L0 is located most distant from that side of the 
optical disc 1 irradiated with a light beam (i.e., closest to the 
substrate 1001). The user data area 14 is provided for each of 
these recording layers. 

It will be described briefly how to make this optical disc 1. 
First, recording layers L0, L1 and L2, including tracks on 
which address signals and information signals representing 
control data are written, are formed in this order on a disc 
substrate 1001. As a result, recording layers, on each of which 
the user data area, defect management areas and spare areas 
are arranged as shown in FIGS. 1 and 2, can be obtained. 
Optionally, spacer layers may be provided between the 
recording layers. Also, the recording layers may be coated 
with a cover layer, for example. 

Although not described for the first, second and third pre 
ferred embodiments of the present invention, if there are 
multiple TDMAS as shown in FIG. 15, an indicator area that 
provides information about the TDMA currently used may 
sometimes be arranged at the top of the TDMA 17, for 
example. Even so, the “top location of the TDMA 17that has 
been described as an example of the “predetermined location 
at which the initial TDMS 20 needs to be written refers 
herein to the top location of an area for use to write a TDMS 
(which may be either the initial TDMS20 or a normal TDMS 
21) except such an indicator area, i.e., a block in the manage 
ment information area of the optical disc 1 on which a write 
operation is performed earlier than anywhere else (one of 
multiple readable/writable blocks that is located at the top of 
the management information area). 

Also, according to some alternative method, a copy of the 
first TDDS 32 to be written on the TDMA could be stored in 
that indicator area. In that case, the area arrangement of the 
optical disc 1 could be understood by scanning that indicator. 
However, in Some situation, no such indicator has been stored 
(e.g., when one of multiple TDMAS to use earliest (such as the 
TDMA 17 in the lead-in area 4) is used). Even so, the same 

10 

15 

25 

30 

35 

40 

45 

50 

55 

60 

65 

34 
effect will beachieved by always arranging data including the 
TDDS32 at a predetermined location (e.g., the top location of 
the TDMA to use earliest). 

In the first, second, and third preferred embodiments of the 
present invention described above, the SBM 30 is supposed to 
have a size of two blocks. However, the same effects as the 
ones that have already been described for the first, second and 
third preferred embodiments of the present invention can also 
be achieved even if the SBM 30 has a size of three blocks or 
O. 

As the SBM 30 has a size of more than one block (i.e., two 
blocks or more) in the first, second, and third preferred 
embodiments of the present invention described above, the 
SBM 30 could have information such as an SBM terminator, 
indicating that this is the end location of the SBM 30, just like 
the DFL terminator 44 of the TDFL 31. 

Furthermore, in the first, second and third preferred 
embodiments of the present invention described above, the 
SBM 30 is supposed to be used as a typical piece of manage 
ment information. However, the present invention does not 
have to be applied to just the SBM30. Rather, the same effect 
will be achieved even if the present invention is applied to a 
different kind of management information that has a size of 
one block or more when written on the TDMA 17, but will 
form, along with a TDDS 32, a disc management structure 
update unit with a size of more than one block (i.e., two blocks 
or more), during the initializing formatting processing, in 
particular. 

Hereinafter, an information recording medium according 
to the present invention will be described in further detail. 

Main Parameters 

Although the present invention is applicable to various 
types of storage media including Blu-ray Discs (BDS) and 
discs compliant with other standards, the following descrip 
tion will be focused on a BDs. Specifically, BDs are classified 
according to the property of their recording film into various 
types. Examples of those various BDs include a BD-ROM 
(read-only), a BD-R (write-once), and a BD-RE (rewritable). 
And the present invention is applicable to an R (write-once) 
type recording medium. Main optical constants and physical 
formats for Blu-ray Discs are disclosed in “Blu-ray Disc 
Reader' (published by Ohmsha, Ltd.) and on White Paper at 
the website of Blu-ray Disc Association (http://www.blu 
raydisc.com), for example. 

Specifically, as for a BD, a laser beam with a wavelength of 
approximately 405 nm (which may fall within the range of 
400 nm to 410 nm supposing the tolerance of errors is +5 nm. 
with respect to the standard value of 405 nm) and an objective 
lens with an NA (numerical aperture) of approximately 0.85 
(which may fall within the range of 0.84 to 0.86 supposing the 
tolerance of errors is +0.01 with respect to the standard value 
of 0.85) are used. A BD has a track pitch of about 0.32 um 
(which may fall within the range of 0.310 to 0.330 um Sup 
posing the tolerance of errors is +0.010 Lum with respect to the 
standard value of 0.320 um) and has one or two recording 
layers. ABD has a single-sided single-layer or a single-sided 
dual-layer structure on the laser beam incident side, and its 
storage plane or recording layer is located at a depth of 75um 
to 100 um as measured from the surface of the protective 
coating of the BD. 
A write signal is supposed to be modulated by 17PP modu 

lation technique. Recording marks are Supposed to have the 
shortest mark length of 0.149 um or 0.138 um (which is the 
length of a 2T mark, where T is one cycle of a reference clock 
pulse and a reference period of modulation in a situation 
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where a mark is recorded in accordance with a predetermined 
modulation rule), i.e., a channel bit length T of 74.50 nm or 
69.00 nm. The BD has a storage capacity of 25GB or 27 GB 
(more exactly, 25.025 GB or 27.020 GB) if it is a single-sided, 
single-layer disc but has a storage capacity of 50 GB or 54GB 
(more exactly, 50.050 GB or 54.04.0 GB) if it is a single-sided, 
dual-layer disc. 
The channel clock frequency is supposed to be 66 MHz 

(corresponding to a channel bit rate of 66.000 Mbit/s) at a 
standard BD transfer rate (BD 1x), 264 MHz (corresponding 
to a channel bit rate of 264.000 Mbit/s) at BD 4x transfer rate, 
396 MHz (corresponding to a channel bit rate of 396.000 
Mbit/s) at BD 6x transfer rate, and 528 MHz (corresponding 
to a channel bit rate of 528,000 Mbit/s) at BD 8x transferrate. 
And the standard linear velocity (which will also be 

referred to herein as “reference linear velocity' or “1x') is 
supposed to be 4.917 m/sec or 4.554 m/sec. The 2x, 4.x, 6x 
and 8x linear velocities are 9.834 m/sec. 19.668 m/sec. 
29.502 m/sec, and 39.336 m/sec. respectively. A linear veloc 
ity higher than the standard linear Velocity is normally a 
positive integral number of times as high as the standard 
linear velocity. But the factor does not have to be an integer 
but may also be a positive real number. Optionally, a linear 
velocity that is lower than the standard linear velocity (such as 
a 0.5x linear velocity) may also be defined. 

It should be noted that these parameters are those of single 
layer or dual-layer BDs already on the market, which have a 
storage capacity of approximately 25 GB or approximately 
27 GB per layer. To further increase the storage capacities of 
BDS, high-density BDS with a storage capacity of approxi 
mately 32 GB or approximately 33.4 GB per layer and three 
or four-layer BDs have already been researched and devel 
oped. Hereinafter, exemplary applications of the present 
invention to such BDs will be described. 

Structure with Multiple Information Recording 
Layers 

For example, Supposing the optical disc is a single-sided 
disc, from/on which information is read and/or written by 
having a laser beam incident on the protective coating (cover 
layer) side, if two or more recording layers need to be pro 
vided, then those multiple recording layers should be 
arranged between the Substrate and the protective coating. An 
exemplary structure for Such a multilayer disc is shown in 
FIG. 21. The optical disc shown in FIG. 21 has (n+1) infor 
mation recording layers 502 (where n is an integer that is 
equal to or greater than Zero). Specifically, in this optical disc, 
a cover layer 501, (n+1) information recording layers (layers 
Ln through L0) 502, and a substrate 500 are stacked in this 
order on the surface on which a laser beam 505 is incident. 
Also, between each pair of adjacent ones of the (n+1) infor 
mation recording layers 502, inserted as an optical buffering 
member is a spacer layer 503. That is to say, the reference 
layer L0 may be arranged at the deepest level that is located at 
a predetermined depth from the light incident Surface (i.e., at 
the greatest distance from the light source). Multiple record 
ing layerS L1, L2, ... and Ln may be stacked one upon the 
other from over the reference layer L0 toward the light inci 
dent Surface. 

In this case, the depth of the reference layer L0 as measured 
from the light incident surface of the multi-layer disc may be 
equal to the depth (e.g., approximately 0.1 mm) of the only 
recording layer of a single-layer disc as measured from the 
light incident surface. If the depth of the deepest layer (i.e., 
the most distant layer) is constant irrespective of the number 
of recording layers stacked (i.e., if the deepest layer of a 
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multilayer disc is located at Substantially the same distance as 
the only recording layer of a single-layer disc), compatibility 
can be ensured in accessing the reference layer, no matter 
whether the given disc is a single-layer one or a multilayer 
one. In addition, even if the number of recording layers 
stacked increases, the influence of tilt will hardly increase. 
This is because although the deepest layer is affected by tilt 
most, the depth of the deepest layer of a multilayer disc is 
approximately the same as that of the only recording layer of 
a single-layer disc, and does not increase in this case even if 
the number of recording layers stacked is increased. 
As for the beam spot moving direction (which will also be 

referred to herein as a “tracking direction” or a “spiral direc 
tion”), the optical disc may be either a parallel path type oran 
opposite path type. 

In a disc of the parallel path type, the spot goes in the same 
direction on every layer, i.e., from Some inner radial location 
toward the outer edge of the disc or from some outer radial 
location toward the inner edge of the disc on every recording 
layer. 
On the other hand, in a disc of the opposite path type, the 

spot moving directions are changed into the opposite one 
every time the layers to scan are changed from one recording 
layer into an adjacent one. For example, if the spot on the 
reference layer L0 goes from some inner radial location 
toward the outer edge (which direction will be simply referred 
to herein as “outward'), then the spot on the recording layer 
L1 will go from some outer radial location toward the inner 
edge (which direction will be simply referred to herein as 
“inward'), the spot on the recording layer L2 will go outward, 
and so forth. That is to say, the spot on the recording layer Lim 
(where m is either Zero or an even number) will go outward 
but the spot on the recording layer Lim--1 will go inward. 
Conversely, the spot on the recording layer Lim (where m is 
either Zero or an even number) will go inward but the spot on 
the recording layer Lm+1 will go outward. 
As for the thickness of the protective coating (cover layer), 

to minimize the influence of spot distortion due to either a 
decrease in focal length with an increase in numerical aper 
ture NA or the tilt, the protective coating may have its thick 
ness reduced. A numerical aperture NA is defined to be 0.45 
for a CD, 0.65 for a DVD, but approximately 0.85 for a BD. 
For example, if the recording medium has an overall thick 
ness of approximately 1.2 mm, the protective coating may 
have a thickness of 10 um to 200 um. More specifically, a 
single-layer disc may include a transparent protective coating 
with a thickness of approximately 0.1 mm and a substrate 
with a thickness of approximately 1.1 mm. On the other hand, 
a dual-layer disc may include a protective coating with a 
thickness of approximately 0.075 mm, a spacer layer with a 
thickness of approximately 0.025 mm and a substrate with a 
thickness of approximately 1.1 mm. And if the disc has three 
or more recording layers, the thickness(es) of the protective 
coating and/or spacer layer could be further reduced. 

Configurations for Single- to Four-layer Discs 

FIGS. 22, 23, 24 and 25 illustrate exemplary configurations 
for single-layer, dual-layer, three-layer and four-layer discs, 
respectively. As described above, if the distance from the light 
incident surface to the reference layer L0 is supposed to be 
constant, each of these discs may have a total disc thickness of 
approximately 1.2 mm (but is more preferably 1.40 mm or 
less if there is a label printed) and the substrate 500 may have 
a thickness of approximately 1.1 mm. That is why the dis 
tance from the light incident surface to the reference layer L0 
will be approximately 0.1 mm in any of the examples shown 
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in FIGS. 23 to 25. In the single-layer disc shown in FIG. 22 
(i.e., if n=0 in FIG. 21), the cover layer 5011 has a thickness 
of approximately 0.1 mm. In the dual-layer disc shown in 
FIG. 23 (i.e., if n=1 in FIG. 21), the cover layer 5012 has a 
thickness of approximately 0.075 mm and the spacer layer 
5302 has a thickness of approximately 0.025 mm. And in the 
three-layer disc shown in FIG. 24 (i.e., if n=2 in FIG. 21) and 
in the four-layer disc shown in FIG.25 (i.e., if n=3 in FIG.21), 
the cover layer 5013,5014 and/or the spacer layer 5303,5304 
may be even thinner. 

Manufacturing Process of the Optical Disc 

Such a single-layer or multilayer disc (i.e., a disc with k 
recording layers, where k is an integer that is equal to or 
greater than one) may be made by performing the following 
manufacturing process steps. 

First of all, the k recording layers, from which information 
is retrievable using a laser beam with a wavelength of 400 nm 
to 410 nm through an objective lens with a numerical aperture 
of 0.84 to 0.86, are formed on a substrate with a thickness of 
approximately 1.1 mm. 

Next, (k-1) spacer layers are formed between the record 
ing layers. As for a single-layer disc, k=1 and k-1-0, and 
therefore, no spacer layers are provided. 

Subsequently, a protective coating with a thickness of 0.1 
mm or less is formed on the k" one of the recording layers as 
counted from the Substrate (i.e., the most distant recording 
layer from the substrate in a multilayer disc). 

In the step of forming the recording layers, when the i” 
recording layer (where i is an odd number that falls within the 
range of one through k) as counted from the substrate is 
formed, either concentric or spiral tracks are made so that the 
laser beam scans that recording layer from Some inner radial 
location on the disc toward the outer edge thereof. On the 
other hand, when the j" recording layer (where j is an even 
number that falls within the range of one through k) as 
counted from the substrate is formed, either concentric or 
spiral tracks are made so that the laser beam scans that record 
ing layer from Some outer radial location on the disc toward 
the inner edge thereof. As for a single-layer disc, k=1, and 
therefore, the odd number i that falls within the range of one 
through k must be one when k-1, and only one recording 
layer is provided as the i' recording layer. Also, if k=1, there 
is no even number that falls within the range of one through 
k, and therefore, noj" recording layer is provided. 
And various areas can be assigned to the tracks on each of 

those recording layers. 
FIG. 26 illustrates the physical structure of an optical disc 

1 according to a preferred embodiment of the present inven 
tion. On the disklike optical disc 1, a lot of tracks 2 are 
arranged either concentrically or spirally. And each of those 
tracks 2 is subdivided into a lot of sectors. As will be 
described later, data is supposed to be written on each of those 
tracks 2 on the basis of a block 3 of a predetermined size. 

The optical disc 1 of this preferred embodiment has a 
greater storage capacity per information recording layer than 
a conventional optical disc (such as a 25 GB BD). The storage 
capacity is increased by increasing the storage linear density, 
e.g., by shortening the mark length of recording marks to be 
left on the optical disc, for example. As used herein, “to 
increase the storage linear density’ means shortening the 
channel bit length, which is a length corresponding to one 
cycle time Tofa reference clock signal (i.e., a reference cycle 
time T of modulation in a situation where marks are recorded 
by a predetermined modulation rule). The optical disc 1 may 
have multiple information recording layers. In the following 
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description, however, only one information recording layer 
thereof will be described for convenience sake. In a situation 
where there are multiple information recording layers in the 
same optical disc, even if the tracks have the same width 
between the respective information recording layers, the Stor 
age linear densities could also be different from one layer to 
another by uniformly varying the mark lengths on a layer-by 
layer basis. 

Each track 2 is divided into a lot of blocks every 64 kB 
(kilobytes), which is the data storage unit. And sequential 
block addresses are assigned to those blocks. Each of those 
blocks is subdivided into three subblocks, each having a 
predetermined length (i.e., three subblocks form one block). 
Subblock numbers of 0, 1 and 2 are assigned to the three 
subblocks in this order. 

Storage Density 

Hereinafter, the storage density will be described with 
reference to FIGS. 27, 28, and 29. 

FIG. 27(A) illustrates an example of a 25 GB BD, for 
which the laser beam 123 is supposed to have a wavelength of 
405 nm and the objective lens 220 is supposed to have a 
numerical aperture (NA) of 0.85. 
As in a DVD, data is also written on the track 2 of a BD as 

a series of marks 120, 121 that are produced as a result of a 
physical variation. The shortest one of this series of marks 
will be referred to herein as the “shortest mark'. In FIG. 
27(A), the mark 121 is the shortest mark. 

In a BD with a storage capacity of 25GB, the shortest mark 
121 has a physical length of 0.149 um, which is approxi 
mately 1/2.7 of the shortest mark of a DVD. And even if the 
resolution of a laser beam is increased by changing the param 
eters of an optical system Such as the wavelength (405 nm) 
and the NA (0.85), this value is still rather close to the limit of 
optical resolution, below which recording marks are no 
longer sensible for the light beam. 

FIG. 28 illustrates a state where a light beam spot is being 
formed on the series of recording marks on the track. In a BD, 
the light beam spot 30 has a diameter of about 0.39 um, which 
may vary with parameters of the optical system. If the storage 
linear density is increased without changing the structures of 
the optical system, then the recording marks will shrink for 
the same spot size of the light beam spot 30 and the read 
resolution will decrease. 
On the other hand, FIG. 27(B) illustrates an example of an 

optical disc with an even higher storage density than a 25 GB 
BD. But even for such a disc, the laser beam 123 is also 
supposed to have a wavelength of 405 nm and the objective 
lens 220 is also supposed to have a numerical aperture (NA) 
of 0.85. Among the series of marks 124,125 of such a disc, the 
shortest mark (a 2T mark) 125 has a physicallength of 0.1115 
um (or 0.11175 um). Compared to FIG. 27(A), the spot size 
remains approximately 0.39 um but both the recording marks 
and the interval between the marks have shrunk. As a result, 
the read resolution will decrease. 
The shorter a recording mark, the smaller the amplitude of 

a read signal to be generated when the recording mark is 
scanned with a light beam. And the amplitude goes Zero when 
the mark length gets equal to the limit of optical resolution. 
The inverse number of one period of these recording marks is 
called a “spatial frequency” and a relation between the spatial 
frequency and the signal amplitude is called an “optical trans 
fer function (OTF). As the spatial frequency rises, the signal 
amplitude decreases almost linearly. And the retrievable limit 
frequency at which the amplitude of the signal goes Zero is 
called an OTF cutoff. 
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FIG. 29 is a graph showing how the OTF of a BD with a 
storage capacity of 25GB changes with the shortest recording 
mark length. The spatial frequency of the shortest mark on a 
BD is approximately 80% of, and is rather close to, the OTF 
cutoff frequency. It can also be seen that a read signal repre 
senting the shortest mark has amplitude that is as Small as 
approximately 10% of the maximum detectable amplitude. 
The storage capacity at which the spatial frequency of the 
shortest mark on a BD is very close to the OTF cutoff fre 
quency (i.e., the storage capacity at which the read signal has 
almost no amplitude) corresponds to approximately 31 GB in 
a BD. When the frequency of the read signal representing the 
shortest mark comes close to, or exceeds, the OTF cutoff 
frequency, the limit of optical resolution may have been 
reached, or even Surpassed, for the laser beam. As a result, the 
read signal comes to have decreased amplitude and the SNR 
drops steeply. 

That is why the high storage density optical disc shown in 
FIG. 27(B) would have its storage linear density defined by 
the frequency of the read signal representing the shortest 
mark, which may be in the vicinity of the OTF cutoff fre 
quency (i.e., it is lower than, but not significantly lower than, 
the OTF cutoff frequency) or higher than the OTF cutoff 
frequency. 

FIG. 30 is a graph showing how the signal amplitude 
changes with the spatial frequency in a situation where the 
spatial frequency of the shortest mark (2T) is higher than the 
OTF cutoff frequency and where the 2T read signal has zero 
amplitude. In FIG. 30, the spatial frequency of the shortest 
mark 2T is 1.12 times as high as the OTF cutoff frequency. 

Relation Between Wavelength, NA and Mark Length 

An optical disc B with high storage density needs to satisfy 
the following relation between the wavelength, the numerical 
aperture, and the mark/space lengths. 

Supposing the shortest mark length is TM nm and the 
shortest space length is TS nm, the sum P of the shortest mark 
length and the shortest space length is (TM--TS) nm. In the 
case of 17 modulation, P-2T+2T-4T. Using the three param 
eters of the wavelength w of the laser beam (which is 405 
nmit5 nm, i.e., in the range of 400 nm to 410 nm), the numeri 
cal aperture NA (which is 0.85+0.01, i.e., in the range of 0.84 
to 0.86) and the sum P of the shortest mark length and the 
shortest space length (where P=2T+2T-4T in the case of 17 
modulation, in which the shortest length is 2T), if the unit 
length T decreases to the point that the inequality 

Ps/2NA 

is satisfied, then the spatial frequency of the shortest mark 
exceeds the OTF cutoff frequency. 

If NA=0.85 and w=405, then the unit length T correspond 
ing to the OTF cutoff frequency is calculated by 

(Conversely, if P-W2NA is satisfied, then the spatial fre 
quency of the shortest mark becomes lower than the OTF 
cutoff frequency). 
As can be seen easily, just by increasing the storage linear 

density, the SNR would decrease due to the limit of optical 
resolution. That is why if the number of information record 
ing layers per disc were increased excessively, then the 
decrease in SNR might be an impermissible degree, consid 
ering the system margin. Particularly around a point where 
the frequency of the shortest recording mark exceeds the OTF 
cutoff frequency, the SNR will start to decrease steeply. 

In the foregoing description, the storage density has been 
described by comparing the frequency of the read signal 
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representing the shortest mark to the OTF cutoff frequency. 
However, if the storage density of BDs is further increased, 
then the storage density (and the storage linear density and the 
storage capacity) can be defined based on the same principle 
as what has just been described by reference to the relation 
between the frequency of the read signal representing the 
second shortest mark (or the third shortest mark or an even 
shorter recording mark) and the OTF cutoff frequency. 

Storage Density and Number of Layers 

ABD, of which the specifications include a wavelength of 
405 m and a numerical aperture of 0.85, may have one of the 
following storage capacities per layer. Specifically, if the 
spatial frequency of the shortest marks is in the vicinity of the 
OTF cutoff frequency, the storage capacity could be approxi 
mately equal to or higher than 29 GB (such as 29.0 GB+0.5 
GB or 29 GB+1 GB), approximately equal to or higher than 
30 GB (such as 30.0 GB+0.5 GB or 30 GB+1 GB), approxi 
mately equal to or higher than 31 GB (such as 31.0 GB+0.5 
GB or 31 GB+1 GB), or approximately equal to or higher than 
32 GB (such as 32.0 GB+0.5 GB or 32 GB+1 GB). 
On the other hand, if the spatial frequency of the shortest 

marks is equal to or higher than the OTF cutoff frequency, the 
storage capacity per layer could be approximately equal to or 
higher than 32 GB (such as 32.0 GB+0.5 GB or 32 GB+1 
GB), approximately equal to or higher than 33 GB (such as 
33.0 GB+0.5 GB or 33 GB+1 GB), approximately equal to or 
higher than 33.3 GB (such as 33.3 GB+0.5 GB or 33.3 GB+1 
GB), approximately equal to or higher than 33.4 GB (such as 
33.4 GB+0.5 GB or 33.4 GB+1 GB), approximately equal to 
or higher than 34 GB (such as 34.0 GB+0.5 GB or 34 GB+1 
GB) or approximately equal to or higher than 35 GB (such as 
35.0 GB+0.5 GB or 35 GB+1 GB). 

In this case, if the storage density per layer is 33.3 GB, an 
overall storage capacity of approximately 100 GB (more 
exactly, 99.9 GB) is realized by the three recording layers 
combined. On the other hand, if the storage density per layer 
is 33.4 GB, an overall storage capacity that is more than 100 
GB (more exactly, 100.2 GB) is realized by the three record 
ing layers combined. Such a storage capacity is almost equal 
to the capacity in a situation where four recording layers, each 
having a storage density of 25 GB, are provided for a single 
BD. For example, if the storage density per layer is 33 GB, the 
overall storage capacity is 33x3=99GB, which is just 1 GB 
(or less) smaller than 100 GB. On the other hand, if the 
storage density per layer is 34 GB, the overall storage capac 
ity is 34x3=102 GB, which is 2 GB (or less) larger than 100 
GB. Furthermore, if the storage density per layer is 33.3 GB, 
the overall storage capacity is 33.3x3–99.9 GB, which is only 
0.1 GB (or less) smaller than 100 GB. And if the storage 
density per layer is 33.4 GB, the overall storage capacity is 
33.4x3=100.2 GB, which is just 0.2 GB (or less) larger than 
100 GB. 

It should be noted that if the storage density were increased 
significantly, then it would be difficult to perform a read 
operation accurately because the shortest marks should be 
read under rather severe conditions. That is why a realistic 
storage density that would realize an overall storage capacity 
of 100 GB or more without increasing the storage density too 
much would be approximately 33.4 GB per layer. 

In this case, the optical disc may have either a four-layer 
structure with a storage density of 25 GB per layer or a 
three-layer structure with a storage density of 33-34 GB per 
layer. If the number of recording layers stacked in a disc is 
increased, however, the read signal obtained from each of 
those layers will have decreased amplitude (or a decreased 
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SNR) and stray light will also be produced from those layers 
(i.e., the read signal obtained from each recording layer will 
be affected by a signal obtained from an adjacent layer). For 
that reason, if a three-layer disc with a storage density of 
33-34 GB per layer is adopted instead of a four-layer disc with 
a storage density of 25 GB per layer, then an overall storage 
capacity of approximately 100 GB will be realized by the 
smaller number of layers (i.e., three instead of four) with the 
influence of Such stray light minimized. That is why a disc 
manufacturer who'd like to realize an overall storage capacity 
of approximately 100 GB while minimizing the number of 
recording layers stacked would prefer a three-layer disc with 
a storage density of 33-34 GB per layer. On the other hand, a 
disc manufacturer who'd like to realize an overall storage 
capacity of approximately 100 GB using the conventional 
format as it is (i.e., a storage density of 25GB per layer) could 
choose a four-layer disc with a storage density of 25GB per 
layer. In this manner, manufacturers with different needs 
could achieve their goals using mutually different structures, 
and therefore, are afforded an increased degree of flexibility 
in disc design. 

Alternatively, if the storage density per layer is in the 30-32 
GB range, the overall storage capacity of a three-layer disc 
will be short of 100 GB (i.e., approximately 90-96 GB) but 
that of a four-layer disc will be 120 GB or more. Among other 
things, if the storage density per layer is approximately 32 
GB, a four-layer disc will have an overall storage capacity of 
approximately 128 GB, which is the seventh power of two 
that would be processed easily and conveniently by a com 
puter. On top of that, compared to the overall storage capacity 
of approximately 100 GB realized by a three-layer disc, even 
shortest marks could also be read under less severe condi 
tions. 

That is why when the storage density needs to be increased, 
a number of different storage densities per layer (Such as 
approximately 32 GB and approximately 33.4 GB) are pref 
erably offered as multiple options so that a disc manufacturer 
can design a disc more flexibly by adopting one of those 
multiple storage densities and any number of recording layers 
in an arbitrary combination. For example, a manufacturer 
who'd like to increase the overall storage capacity while 
minimizing the influence of multiple layers stacked is offered 
an option of making a three-layer disc with an overall storage 
capacity of approximately 100 GB by stacking three record 
ing layers with a storage density of 33-34 GB per layer. On the 
other hand, a manufacturer who'd like to increase the overall 
storage capacity while minimizing the impact on read perfor 
mance is offered an option of making a four-layer disc with an 
overall storage capacity of approximately 120 GB or more by 
stacking four recording layers with a storage density of 30-32 
GB per layer. 

Furthermore, if grooves are cut on an optical information 
recording medium, the recording medium comes to have 
groove portions and land portion between the groove por 
tions. That is why the methods of writing data need to be 
changed depending on whether data should be written on 
groove portions or on land portions. Specifically, data can be 
written in various manners, e.g., only on groove portions, 
only on land portions, or both on groove and land portions. In 
this case, a method of writing data on portions (i.e., either 
groove portions or land portions) that are raised as viewed 
from under the light incident surface is called “On-Groove' 
writing. On the other hand, a method of writing data on 
portions that are depressed as viewed from under the light 
incident surface is called “In-Groove' writing. According to 
the present invention, at least one of these two writing meth 
ods may be adopted arbitrarily. That is to say, only the On 
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Groove writing or only the In-Groove writing should be 
adopted, or one of these two methods could be used selec 
tively. 

If one of these two writing methods needs to be permitted 
selectively, writing method specifying information, indicat 
ing which of the two writing methods (i.e., the On-Groove 
writing or In-Groove writing) should be adopted for the 
medium, may be written on the medium. As for a multilayer 
medium, the writing method specifying information for the 
respective layers needs to be stored. In that case, the writing 
method specifying information for the respective layers may 
be stored collectively in the reference layer (which could be 
the deepest (L0) or shallowest layer as viewed from under the 
light incident surface or the layer to be accessed earlier than 
any other layer during a disc loading process). Alternatively, 
only an associated piece of writing method specifying infor 
mation may be stored in each layer. Still alternatively, the 
writing method specifying information for all layers could be 
stored on each and every layer. 

Also, the writing method specifying information could be 
stored in the BCA (burst cutting area) or a disc information 
area or superposed on the wobbled groove. The disc informa 
tion area is located inside and/or outside of the data storage 
area and used to store mainly control information. The disc 
information area is a read-only area and may have a broader 
track pitch than the data storage area. The writing method 
specifying information could be stored in one, any two, or 
even all, of these areas and portions. 

Furthermore, the direction in which the groove starts wob 
bling for the very first time according to the On-Groove 
writing method may be opposite to the one according to the 
In-Groove writing method. That is to say, if the groove starts 
to wobble inward (i.e., toward the center of the disc) accord 
ing to the On-Groove writing method, then the groove should 
start to wobble outward according to the In-Groove writing 
method. Alternatively, if the groove starts to wobble outward 
according to the On-Groove writing method, then the groove 
should start to wobble inward according to the In-Groove 
writing method. In this manner, by getting the groove to start 
wobbling in mutually opposite directions between the On 
Groove and In-Groove writing methods, the polarity of track 
ing can be the same, no matter which of these two methods is 
adopted. This is because although a write operation is per 
formed on the raised portion according to the On-Groove 
writing method as viewed from under the light incident sur 
face, a write operation is performed on the depressed portion 
according to the In-Groove writing method as viewed from 
under the light incident Surface. That is why Supposing the 
groove depths are the same between these two methods, their 
tracking polarities will be opposite to each other. Thus, if the 
groove is Supposed to start wobbling in mutually opposite 
directions between these two methods, then their tracking 
polarities should be the same. 
The recording film may have the following two different 

properties, which are determined by the reflectances of 
recorded and unrecorded portions thereof. Specifically, if the 
unrecorded portion has a higher reflectance than the recorded 
portion, then the recording film has high-to-low (H to L) 
property. On the other hand, if the unrecorded portion has a 
lower reflectance than the recorded portion, then the record 
ing film has low-to-high (L to H) property. According to the 
present invention, at least one of these two recording film 
properties may be adopted arbitrarily. That is to say, the 
recording film of a given medium may have only the H to L 
property or only the L to H property. Or the recording film 
could permit one of these two properties selectively. 
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If one of these two properties needs to be permitted selec 
tively, recording film property specifying information, indi 
cating which of the two properties the recording film should 
have (i.e., either H to L or L to H), may be written on the 
medium. As for a multilayer medium, the recording film 
property specifying information for the respective layers 
needs to be stored. In that case, the recording film property 
specifying information for the respective layers may be stored 
collectively in the reference layer (which could be the deepest 
(L0) or shallowest layer as viewed from under the light inci 
dent surface or the layer to be accessed earlier than any other 
layer during a disc loading process). Alternatively, only an 
associated piece of recording film property specifying infor 
mation may be stored in each layer. Still alternatively, the 
recording film property specifying information for all layers 
could be stored on each and every layer. 

Also, the recording film property specifying information 
could be stored in the BCA (burst cutting area) or a disc 
information area or superposed on the wobbled groove. The 
disc information area is located inside and/or outside of the 
data storage area and used to store mainly control informa 
tion. The disc information area is a read-only area and may 
have a broader track pitch than the data storage area. The 
recording film property specifying information could be 
stored in one, any two, or even all, of these areas and portions. 
As for the various formats and methods mentioned above, 

as the storage densities increase, optical disc media will have 
multiple different storage densities. In that case, only some of 
those various formats and methods could be adopted accord 
ing to the storage density or others could be changed into 
different formats or methods. 
As described above, a write-once information recording 

medium according to the present invention has at least one 
recording layer and information is written on a block-by 
block basis on it. The write-once information recording 
medium includes: a user data area on which user data is going 
to be written; and a management information area to store 
management information about the write-once information 
recording medium. The user data area is provided for each 
recording layer. The management information includes: a 
space bitmap including bitmap information for use to manage 
recording statuses in the user data area on a predetermined 
one of the recording layers; and a disc definition structure 
including location information of the space bitmap. The size 
of the space bitmap is determined so that the combined size of 
the space bitmap itself and the disc definition structure always 
becomes equal to that of one block, irrespective of the size of 
the user data area. If the size of the user data area on the 
predetermined recording layer exceeds a predetermined one, 
multiple space bitmaps are generated for the user data area of 
the predetermined recording layer. A disc management struc 
ture update unit, including one of the multiple space bitmaps 
and the disc definition structure and having a size of one 
block, is written on the management information area. 

In one preferred embodiment, if the size of the user data 
area on the predetermined recording layer exceeds the prede 
termined size, the bitmap information is divided into multiple 
pieces of bitmap information. Each of the multiple space 
bitmaps is provided with one of those pieces of bitmap infor 
mation. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
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increases. The predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, the 
disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to that 
of one block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list, 
which provides no information about a defective area. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 
An information writing apparatus according to the present 

invention writes information on a write-once information 
recording medium, which has at least one recording layer and 
on which information is written on a block-by-block basis. 
The write-once information recording medium includes: a 
user data area on which user data is going to be written; and a 
management information area to store management informa 
tion about the write-once information recording medium. The 
user data area is provided for each recording layer. The man 
agement information includes: a space bitmap including bit 
map information for use to manage recording statuses in the 
user data area on a predetermined one of the recording layers; 
and a disc definition structure including location information 
of the space bitmap. The size of the space bitmap is deter 
mined so that the combined size of the space bitmap itself and 
the disc definition structure always becomes equal to that of 
one block, irrespective of the size of the user data area. If the 
size of the user data area on the predetermined recording layer 
exceeds a predetermined one, the information writing appa 
ratus generates multiple space bitmaps for the user data area 
of the predetermined recording layer, and writes a disc man 
agement structure update unit, including one of the multiple 
space bitmaps and the disc definition structure and having a 
size of one block, on the management information area. 

In one preferred embodiment, if the size of the user data 
area on the predetermined recording layer exceeds the prede 
termined size, the bitmap information is divided into multiple 
pieces of bitmap information. Each of the multiple space 
bitmaps is provided with one of those pieces of bitmap infor 
mation. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases. The predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, the 
disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to that 
of one block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 
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In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list, 
which provides no information about a defective area. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 
An information writing method according to the present 

invention is designed to write information on a write-once 
information recording medium, which has at least one record 
ing layer and on which information is written on a block-by 
block basis. The write-once information recording medium 
includes: a user data area on which user data is going to be 
written; and a management information area to store manage 
ment information about the write-once information recording 
medium. The user data area is provided for each recording 
layer. The management information includes: a space bitmap 
including bitmap information for use to manage recording 
statuses in the user data area on a predetermined one of the 
recording layers; and a disc definition structure including 
location information of the space bitmap. The size of the 
space bitmap is determined so that the combined size of the 
space bitmap itself and the disc definition structure always 
becomes equal to that of one block, irrespective of the size of 
the user data area. The information writing method includes 
the steps of: if the size of the user data area on the predeter 
mined recording layer exceeds a predetermined one, gener 
ating multiple space bitmaps for the user data area of the 
predetermined recording layer; and writing a disc manage 
ment structure update unit, including one of the multiple 
space bitmaps and the disc definition structure and having a 
size of one block, on the management information area. 

In one preferred embodiment, the method further includes 
the steps of: if the size of the user data area on the predeter 
mined recording layer exceeds the predetermined size, divid 
ing the bitmap information into multiple pieces of bitmap 
information; and associating one of those pieces of bitmap 
information with each of the multiple space bitmaps. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases. The predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, the 
disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to that 
of one block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
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and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list, 
which provides no information about a defective area. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 
An information reading apparatus according to the present 

invention reads information from a write-once information 
recording medium, which has at least one recording layer and 
on which information is written on a block-by-block basis. 
The write-once information recording medium includes: a 
user data area on which user data is going to be written; and a 
management information area to store management informa 
tion about the write-once information recording medium. The 
user data area is provided for each recording layer. The man 
agement information includes: a space bitmap including bit 
map information for use to manage recording statuses in the 
user data area on a predetermined one of the recording layers; 
and a disc definition structure including location information 
of the space bitmap. The size of the space bitmap is deter 
mined so that the combined size of the space bitmap itself and 
the disc definition structure always becomes equal to that of 
one block, irrespective of the size of the user data area. If the 
size of the user data area on the predetermined recording layer 
exceeds a predetermined one, multiple space bitmaps are 
generated for the user data area of the predetermined record 
ing layer. A disc management structure update unit, including 
one of the multiple space bitmaps and the disc definition 
structure and having a size of one block, is written on the 
management information area. And the information reading 
apparatus reads the disc management structure update unit, 
including the disc definition structure and having a size of one 
block, from the management information area and obtains the 
space bitmap. 

In one preferred embodiment, if the size of the user data 
area on the predetermined recording layer exceeds the prede 
termined size, the bitmap information is divided into multiple 
pieces of bitmap information. Each of the multiple space 
bitmaps is provided with one of those pieces of bitmap infor 
mation. And the information reading apparatus reads an asso 
ciated piece of bitmap information from each space bitmap. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases, and the predetermined size is the size of the user 
data area when the combined size of the bitmap information, 
the disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to 
that of one block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list. 
The initial defect list provides no information about a defec 
tive area. The information reading apparatus reads either the 
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disc management structure update unit or the second disc 
management structure update unit from a block at the prede 
termined location. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 
An information reading method according to the present 

invention is designed to read information from a write-once 
information recording medium, which has at least one record 
ing layer and on which information is written on a block-by 
block basis. The write-once information recording medium 
includes: a user data area on which user data is going to be 
written; and a management information area to store manage 
ment information about the write-once information recording 
medium. The user data area is provided for each recording 
layer. The management information includes: a space bitmap 
including bitmap information for use to manage recording 
statuses in the user data area on a predetermined one of the 
recording layers; and a disc definition structure including 
location information of the space bitmap. The size of the 
space bitmap is determined so that the combined size of the 
space bitmap itself and the disc definition structure always 
becomes equal to that of one block, irrespective of the size of 
the user data area. If the size of the user data area on the 
predetermined recording layer exceeds a predetermined one, 
multiple space bitmaps are generated for the user data area of 
the predetermined recording layer. A disc management struc 
ture update unit, including one of the multiple space bitmaps 
and the disc definition structure and having a size of one 
block, is written on the management information area. The 
information reading method includes the step of reading the 
disc management structure update unit, including the disc 
definition structure and having a size of one block, from the 
management information area and obtains the space bitmap. 

In one preferred embodiment, if the size of the user data 
area on the predetermined recording layer exceeds the prede 
termined size, the bitmap information is divided into multiple 
pieces of bitmap information. Each of the multiple space 
bitmaps is provided with one of those pieces of bitmap infor 
mation. The information reading method further includes the 
step of reading an associated piece of bitmap information 
from each space bitmap. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, each of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps includes a header that provides informa 
tion about an area range to be managed by reference to its 
associated piece of bitmap information for the space bitmap 
itself. 

In a specific preferred embodiment, the size of the bitmap 
information increases as the size of the user data area 
increases. The predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, the 
disc definition structure, and the header becomes equal to that 
of one block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the top address and size of an area range 
managed by reference to that piece of bitmap information. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the header provides 
information about the number of times the space bitmap has 
been updated. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, on a block at a pre 
determined location in the management information area, 
written is either the disc management structure update unit or 
a second disc management structure update unit, which 
includes the disc definition structure and an initial defect list 
and which has a size of one block. The disc definition struc 
ture includes location information about the initial defect list. 
The initial defect list provides no information about a defec 
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tive area. The information reading method includes the step of 
reading either the disc management structure update unit or 
the second disc management structure update unit from a 
block at the predetermined location in the management infor 
mation area. 

In this particular preferred embodiment, the block at the 
predetermined location is located at the top of multiple read 
able and writable blocks in the management information area. 

Another information recording medium according to the 
present invention is a write-once information recording 
medium, which has at least one recording layer and on which 
a write operation is performed on a block-by-block basis. The 
write-once information recording medium includes: a data 
area on which user data is going to be written; and a manage 
ment information area to store a disc management structure, 
which provides management information about the informa 
tion recording medium. The data area is provided for each 
recording layer. The disc management structure includes: a 
space bitmap for use to examine recorded and unrecorded 
statuses in the data area on a recording layer basis; a defect list 
for managing defects in the data area; and a disc definition 
structure including layout information of the write-once 
information recording medium and location information of 
the space bitmap and the defect list. The space bitmap and the 
defect list are written on the management information area on 
the basis of a disc management structure update unit, which is 
defined by combining the disc definition structures with each 
other. The combined size of the space bitmap and the disc 
definition structure on each recording layer is more than one 
block. And the disc management structure update unit with a 
size of one block, including the disc definition structure, is 
written at least on a block at a predetermined location in the 
management information area. 

In one preferred embodiment, the block at the predeter 
mined location is a block in the management information area 
on which a write operation is performed earlier than any other 
block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the block at the prede 
termined location is located at the top of the management 
information area. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the disc definition 
structure update unit with a size of one block, formed by 
combining the defect list and the disc definition structure in an 
initial state, is written on the block at the predetermined 
location. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, the space bitmap on 
each recording layer is divided into a number of space bitmap 
portions that are able to form the disc definition structure 
update unit with a size of one block when combined with the 
disc definition structure. The disc definition structure update 
unit with a size of one block, which is formed by combining 
the space bitmap portions and the disc definition structure, is 
written on the management information area. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, the space bitmap on 
each recording layer is made up of bitmap data indicating 
whether each block in the data area is recorded or unrecorded; 
and a header that provides information about the bitmap data. 
The disc definition structure update unit, formed by combin 
ing the header and the disc definition structure without the 
bitmap data of the space bitmap, is written on the block at the 
predetermined location. 

Another information writing method according to the 
present invention is designed to perform a write operation on 
a write-once information recording medium, which has at 
least one recording layer and on which information is written 
on a block-by-block basis. The write-once information 
recording medium includes: a data area on which user data is 
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going to be written; and a management information area to 
store a disc management structure, which provides manage 
ment information about the information recording medium. 
The data area is provided for each recording layer. The disc 
management structure includes: a space bitmap for use to 
examine recorded and unrecorded statuses in the data area on 
a recording layer basis; a defect list for managing defects in 
the data area; and a disc definition structure including layout 
information of the write-once information recording medium 
and location information of the space bitmap and the defect 
list. The space bitmap and the defect list are written on the 
management information area on the basis of a disc manage 
ment structure update unit, which is defined by combining the 
disc definition structures with each other. The combined size 
of the space bitmap and the disc definition structure on each 
recording layer is more than one block. The information 
writing method includes the step of writing the disc manage 
ment structure update unit with a size of one block, including 
the disc definition structure, at least on a block at a predeter 
mined location in the management information area. 

In one preferred embodiment, the block at the predeter 
mined location is a block in the management information area 
on which a write operation is performed earlier than any other 
block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the block at the prede 
termined location is located at the top of the management 
information area. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the disc definition 
structure update unit with a size of one block, formed by 
combining the defect list and the disc definition structure in an 
initial state, is written on the block at the predetermined 
location. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, the space bitmap on 
each recording layer is divided into a number of space bitmap 
portions that are able to form the disc definition structure 
update unit with a size of one block when combined with the 
disc definition structure. The disc definition structure update 
unit with a size of one block, which is formed by combining 
the space bitmap portions and the disc definition structure, is 
written on the management information area. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, the space bitmap on 
each recording layer is made up of bitmap data indicating 
whether each block in the data area is recorded or unrecorded; 
and a header that provides information about the bitmap data. 
The disc definition structure update unit, formed by combin 
ing the header and the disc definition structure without the 
bitmap data of the space bitmap, is written on the block at the 
predetermined location. 

Another information writing apparatus according to the 
present invention is designed to perform a write operation on 
a write-once information recording medium, which has at 
least one recording layer and on which information is written 
on a block-by-block basis. The write-once information 
recording medium includes: a data area on which user data is 
going to be written; and a management information area to 
store a disc management structure, which provides manage 
ment information about the information recording medium. 
The data area is provided for each recording layer. The disc 
management structure includes: a space bitmap for use to 
examine recorded and unrecorded statuses in the data area on 
a recording layer basis; a defect list for managing defects in 
the data area; and a disc definition structure including layout 
information of the write-once information recording medium 
and location information of the space bitmap and the defect 
list. The space bitmap and the defect list are written on the 
management information area on the basis of a disc manage 
ment structure update unit, which is defined by combining the 
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disc definition structures with each other. The combined size 
of the space bitmap and the disc definition structure on each 
recording layer is more than one block. The information 
writing apparatus includes a control section for writing the 
disc management structure update unit with a size of one 
block, including the disc definition structure, at least on a 
block at a predetermined location in the management infor 
mation area. 

In one preferred embodiment, the block at the predeter 
mined location is a block in the management information area 
on which a write operation is performed earlier than any other 
block. 

In another preferred embodiment, the block at the prede 
termined location is located at the top of the management 
information area. 

In still another preferred embodiment, the control section 
writes the disc definition structure update unit with a size of 
one block, formed by combining the defect list and the disc 
definition structure in an initial state, on the block at the 
predetermined location. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, the space bitmap on 
each recording layer is divided into a number of space bitmap 
portions that are able to form the disc definition structure 
update unit with a size of one block when combined with the 
disc definition structure. The control section writes the disc 
definition structure update unit with a size of one block, 
which is formed by combining the space bitmap portions and 
the disc definition structure, on the management information 
aca. 

In yet another preferred embodiment, the space bitmap on 
each recording layer is made up of bitmap data indicating 
whether each block in the data area is recorded or unrecorded; 
and a header that provides information about the bitmap data. 
The control section writes the disc definition structure update 
unit, formed by combining the header and the disc definition 
structure without the bitmap data of the space bitmap, on the 
block at the predetermined location. 

Another information reading method according to the 
present invention is a method for reading information from a 
write-once information recording medium, which has at least 
one recording layer and on which a write operation is per 
formed on a block-by-block basis. The write-once informa 
tion recording medium includes: a data area on which user 
data is going to be written; and a management information 
area to store a disc management structure, which provides 
management information about the information recording 
medium. The data area is provided for each recording layer. 
The disc management structure includes: a space bitmap for 
use to examine recorded and unrecorded statuses in the data 
area on a recording layer basis; a defect list for managing 
defects in the data area; and a disc definition structure includ 
ing layout information of the write-once information record 
ing medium and location information of the space bitmap and 
the defect list. The space bitmap and the defect list are written 
on the management information area on the basis of a disc 
management structure update unit, which is defined by com 
bining the disc definition structures with each other. The 
combined size of the space bitmap and the disc definition 
structure on each recording layer is more than one block. And 
the information reading method includes the step of reading 
the disc management structure update unit with a size of one 
block, including the disc definition structure, at least from a 
block at a predetermined location in the management infor 
mation area. 

Another information reading apparatus according to the 
present invention is designed to read information from a 
write-once information recording medium, which has at least 
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one recording layer and on which a write operation is per 
formed on a block-by-block basis. The write-once informa 
tion recording medium includes: a data area on which user 
data is going to be written; and a management information 
area to store a disc management structure, which provides 
management information about the information recording 
medium. The data area is provided for each recording layer. 
The disc management structure includes: a space bitmap for 
use to examine recorded and unrecorded statuses in the data 
area on a recording layer basis; a defect list for managing 
defects in the data area; and a disc definition structure includ 
ing layout information of the write-once information record 
ing medium and location information of the space bitmap and 
the defect list. The space bitmap and the defect list are written 
on the management information area on the basis of a disc 
management structure update unit, which is defined by com 
bining the disc definition structures with each other. The 
combined size of the space bitmap and the disc definition 
structure on each recording layer is more than one block. And 
the information reading apparatus includes a control section 
for reading the disc management structure update unit with a 
size of one block, including the disc definition structure, at 
least from a blockata predetermined location in the manage 
ment information area. 
Industrial Applicability 
An information recording medium according to the present 

invention can be used as a write-once optical disc on which a 
write operation can be performed at random at any locations. 
Also, an information reading/writing method according to the 
present invention is applicable to an optical disc drive that can 
read and write from/to a write-once optical disc on which a 
write operation can be performed at random at any locations. 

REFERENCE SIGNS LIST 

1 optical disc 
2 track 
3 blocks 
4 lead-in area 
5 data area 
6 lead-out area 
10, 11, 12, 13 DMA 
14 user data area 
15, 16 spare area 
17 TDMA 
20 initial TDMS 
21 TDMS 
3OSBM 
31 TDFL 
32 TDDS 
40 SBM header 
41 itmap information 
42 DFL header 
43 DFL entries 
44 DFL terminator 
50 DDS header 
51 inner spare area size 
52 outer spare area size 
53 writing mode information 
54 inner spare area TDMA size 
55 outer spare area TDMA size 
56 SBM #0 location information 
57 DFL H0 location information 
58 DFL #1 location information 
59 DFL H2 location information 
60 DFL H3 location information 
61 SBM #1 location information 
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100 optical disc reading/writing apparatus 
110 instruction processing section 
120 optical head 
130 laser control section 
140 mechanism control section 
150 memory 
160 management information storage memory 
170 system control section 
171 writing section 
172 reading section 
173 access location managing section 
174 management information updating section 
175 management information generating section 
180 IAO bus 

The invention claimed is: 
1. A write-once information recording medium, which has 

at least one recording layer and on which information is 
written on a block-by-block basis, 

wherein the write-once information recording medium 
comprises: 

a user data area on which user data is going to be written; 
and 

a management information area to store management 
information about the write-once information recording 
medium, and 

wherein the user data area is provided for each said record 
ing layer, and 

wherein the management information comprises: 
a space bitmap including bitmap information for use to 
manage recording statuses in the user data area on a 
predetermined one recording layer of the at least one 
recording layer, and 

a disc definition structure including location information of 
the space bitmap, and 

wherein the size of the space bitmap is determined so that 
the combined size of the space bitmap itself and the disc 
definition structure always becomes equal to that of one 
block, irrespective of the size of the user data area, and 

wherein the size of the user data area on the predetermined 
one recording layer exceeds a predetermined size, 

the predetermined size is a maximum size of the user data 
area that can be managed by one piece of bitmap infor 
mation 

multiple space bitmaps are generated for the user data area 
of the predetermined one recording layer, and 

wherein a disc management structure update unit, includ 
ing one of the multiple space bitmaps and the disc defi 
nition structure and having a size of one block, is written 
on the management information area. 

2. The write-once information recording medium of claim 
1, wherein if the size of the user data area on the predeter 
mined recording layer exceeds the predetermined size, the 
bitmap information is divided into multiple pieces of bitmap 
information, and 

wherein each of the multiple space bitmaps is provided 
with one of those pieces of bitmap information. 

3. The write-once information recording medium of claim 
2, wherein each of the multiple space bitmaps includes a 
header that provides information about an area range to be 
managed by reference to its associated piece of bitmap infor 
mation for the space bitmap itself. 

4. The write-once information recording medium of claim 
3, wherein the size of the bitmap information increases as the 
size of the user data area increases, and 
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wherein the predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, 
the disc definition structure, and the header becomes 
equal to that of one block. 

5. The write-once information recording medium of claim 
3, wherein the header provides information about the top 
address and size of an area range managed by reference to that 
piece of bitmap information. 

6. The write-once information recording medium of claim 
3, wherein the header provides information about the number 
of times the space bitmap has been updated. 

7. An information writing apparatus for writing informa 
tion on a write-once information recording medium, which 
has at least one recording layer and on which information is 
written on a block-by-block basis, 

wherein the write-once information recording medium 
comprises: 

a user data area on which user data is going to be written; 
and 

a management information area to store management 
information about the write-once information recording 
medium, and 

wherein the user data area is provided for each said record 
ing layer, and 

wherein the management information comprises: 
a space bitmap including bitmap information for use to 
manage recording statuses in the user data area on a 
predetermined one recording layer of the at least one 
recording layer, and 

a disc definition structure including location information of 
the space bitmap, and 

wherein the size of the space bitmap is determined so that 
the combined size of the space bitmap itself and the disc 
definition structure always becomes equal to that of one 
block, irrespective of the size of the user data area, and 

wherein the information writing apparatus comprising: 
a writing section for writing information on the write-once 

information recording medium, and 
a control section for controlling the writing section, and 
wherein if the size of the user data area on the predeter 

mined one recording layer exceeds a predetermined size 
where the predetermined size is a maximum size of the 
user data area that can be managed by one piece of 
bitmap information, the control section generate mul 
tiple space bitmaps for the user data area of the prede 
termined one recording layer, and the control section 
controls the writing section so as to write a disc man 
agement structure update unit, including one of the mul 
tiple space bitmaps and the disc definition structure and 
having a size of one block, on the management informa 
tion area. 

8. The information writing apparatus of claim 7, wherein if 
the size of the user data area on the predetermined recording 
layer exceeds the predetermined size, the control section 
divides the bitmap information into multiple pieces of bitmap 
information, and 

wherein the control section associates one of those pieces 
of bitmap information with each of the multiple space 
bitmaps, and 

the control section controls the writing section so as to 
write the one of the multiple space bitmaps including 
one of the multiple pieces of bitmap information. 

9. The information writing apparatus of claim 8, wherein 
each of the multiple space bitmaps generated by the control 
section includes a header that provides information about an 
area range to be managed by reference to its associated piece 
of bitmap information for the space bitmap itself, and 
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the control section controls the writing section so as to 

write each of the multiple space bitmaps including the 
header. 

10. The information writing apparatus of claim 9, wherein 
the control section increases the size of the bitmap informa 
tion as the size of the user data area increases, and 

wherein the predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, 
the disc definition structure, and the header becomes 
equal to that of one block. 

11. The information writing apparatus of claim 9, wherein 
the control section controls the writing section so as to write 
the header including information about the top address and 
size of an area range managed by reference to that piece of 
bitmap information. 

12. The information writing apparatus of claim 9, wherein 
the control section controls the writing section so as to write 
the header including information about the number of times 
the space bitmap has been updated. 

13. An information writing method for writing information 
on a write-once information recording medium, which has at 
least one recording layer and on which information is written 
on a block-by-block basis, 

wherein the write-once information recording medium 
comprises: 

a user data area on which user data is going to be written; 
and 

a management information area to store management 
information about the write-once information recording 
medium, and 

wherein the user data area is provided for each said record 
ing layer, and 

wherein the management information comprises: 
a space bitmap including bitmap information for use to 
manage recording statuses in the user data area on a 
predetermined one recording layer of the at least one 
recording layers; and 

a disc definition structure including location information of 
the space bitmap, and 

wherein the size of the space bitmap is determined so that 
the combined size of the space bitmap itself and the disc 
definition structure always becomes equal to that of one 
block, irrespective of the size of the user data area, and 

wherein the information writing method comprises the 
steps of: 

determining whether a size of the user data area on the 
predetermined one recording layer exceeds a predeter 
mined size where the predetermined size is a maximum 
size of the user data area that can be managed by one 
piece of bitmap information, 

if the size of the user data area on the predetermined record 
ing layer exceeds the predetermined size, 

generating multiple space bitmaps for the user data area of 
the predetermined one recording layer, and 

writing a disc management structure update unit, including 
one of the multiple space bitmaps and the disc definition 
structure and having a size of one block, on the manage 
ment information area. 

14. The information writing method of claim 13, further 
comprising the steps of 

if the size of the user data area on the predetermined record 
ing layer exceeds the predetermined size, 

dividing the bitmap information into multiple pieces of 
bitmap information, and 

associating one of those pieces of bitmap information with 
each of the multiple space bitmaps. 
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15. The information writing method of claim 14, wherein 
each of the multiple space bitmaps includes a header that 
provides information about an area range to be managed by 
reference to its associated piece of bitmap information for the 
space bitmap itself. 

16. The information writing method of claim 15, wherein 
the size of the bitmap information increases as the size of the 
user data area increases, and 

wherein the predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, 
the disc definition structure, and the header becomes 
equal to that of one block. 

17. The information writing method of claim 15, wherein 
the header provides information about the top address and 
size of an area range managed by reference to that piece of 
bitmap information. 

18. The information writing method of claim 15, wherein 
the header provides information about the number of times 
the space bitmap has been updated. 

19. An information reading apparatus for reading informa 
tion from a write-once information recording medium, which 
has at least one recording layer and on which information is 
written on a block-by-block basis, 

wherein the write-once information recording medium 
comprises: 

a user data area on which user data is going to be written; 
and 

a management information area to store management 
information about the write-once information recording 
medium, and 

wherein the user data area is provided for each said record 
ing layer, and 

wherein the management information comprises: 
a space bitmap including bitmap information for use to 
manage recording statuses in the user data area on a 
predetermined one recording layer of the at least one 
recording layer, and 

a disc definition structure including location information of 
the space bitmap, and 

wherein the size of the space bitmap is determined so that 
the combined size of the space bitmap itself and the disc 
definition structure always becomes equal to that of one 
block, irrespective of the size of the user data area, and 

wherein the size of the user data area on the predetermined 
one recording layer exceeds a predetermined size, 

the predetermined size is a maximum size of the user data 
area that can be managed by one piece of bitmap infor 
mation, 

multiple space bitmaps are generated for the user data area 
of the predetermined one recording layer, and 

a disc management structure update unit, including one of 
the multiple space bitmaps and the disc definition struc 
ture and having a size of one block, is written on the 
management information area, and 

wherein the information reading apparatus comprising: 
a reading section for reading information from the write 

once information recording medium, and 
a control section for controlling the reading section, and 
wherein the control section controls the reading section as 

to read the disc management structure update unit, 
including the disc definition structure and having a size 
of one block, from the management information area 
and obtains the space bitmap. 

20. The information reading apparatus of claim 19, 
wherein the size of the user data area on the predetermined 
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recording layer exceeds the predetermined size, and the bit 
map information is divided into multiple pieces of bitmap 
information, and 

wherein each of the multiple space bitmaps is provided 
with one of those pieces of bitmap information, and 

wherein the information reading apparatus reads an asso 
ciated piece of bitmap information from each said space 
bitmap. 

21. The information reading apparatus of claim 20, 
wherein each of the multiple space bitmaps includes aheader 
that provides information about an area range to be managed 
by reference to its associated piece of bitmap information for 
the space bitmap itself. 

22. The information reading apparatus of claim 21, 
wherein the size of the bitmap information increases as the 
size of the user data area increases, and 

wherein the predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, 
the disc definition structure, and the header becomes 
equal to that of one block. 

23. The information reading apparatus of claim 21, 
wherein the header provides information about the top 
address and size of an area range managed by reference to that 
piece of bitmap information. 

24. The information reading apparatus of claim 21, 
wherein the header provides information about the number of 
times the space bitmap has been updated. 

25. An information reading method for reading informa 
tion from a write-once information recording medium, which 
has at least one recording layer and on which information is 
written on a block-by-block basis, 

wherein the write-once information recording medium 
comprises: 

a user data area on which user data is going to be written; 
and 

a management information area to store management 
information about the write-once information recording 
medium, and 

wherein the user data area is provided for each said record 
ing layer, and 

wherein the management information comprises: 
a space bitmap including bitmap information for use to 
manage recording statuses in the user data area on a 
predetermined one recording layer of the at least one 
recording layer, and 

a disc definition structure including location information of 
the space bitmap, and 

wherein the size of the space bitmap is determined so that 
the combined size of the space bitmap itself and the disc 
definition structure always becomes equal to that of one 
block, irrespective of the size of the user data area, and 

wherein the size of the user data area on the predetermined 
one recording layer exceeds a predetermined size, 

the predetermined size is a maximum size of the user data 
area that can be managed by one piece of bitmap infor 
mation, 

multiple space bitmaps are generated for the user data area 
of the predetermined one recording layer, and 

a disc management structure update unit, including one of 
the multiple space bitmaps and the disc definition struc 
ture and having a size of one block, is written on the 
management information area, and 

wherein the information reading method includes the step 
of reading the disc management structure update unit, 
including the disc definition structure and having a size 
of one block, from the management information area 
and obtains the space bitmap. 
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26. The information reading method of claim 25, wherein 
the size of the user data area on the predetermined recording 
layer exceeds the predetermined size, and the bitmap infor 
mation is divided into multiple pieces of bitmap information, 
and 

wherein each of the multiple space bitmaps is provided 
with one of those pieces of bitmap information, and 

wherein the information reading method further includes 
the step of reading an associated piece of bitmap infor 
mation from each said space bitmap. 

27. The information reading method of claim 26, wherein 
each of the multiple space bitmaps includes a header that 
provides information about an area range to be managed by 
reference to its associated piece of bitmap information for the 
space bitmap itself. 
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28. The information reading method of claim 27, wherein 

the size of the bitmap information increases as the size of the 
user data area increases, and 

wherein the predetermined size is the size of the user data 
area when the combined size of the bitmap information, 
the disc definition structure, and the header becomes 
equal to that of one block. 

29. The information reading method of claim 27, wherein 
the header provides information about the top address and 
size of an area range managed by reference to that piece of 
bitmap information. 

30. The information reading method of claim 27, wherein 
the header provides information about the number of times 
the space bitmap has been updated. 

k k k k k 
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