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1. 

APPARATUS, SYSTEMS, METHODS AND 
COMPUTER PROGRAMI PRODUCTS FOR 
PRODUCING ASINGLE FREQUENCY 
NETWORK FOR ATSC MOBILE f 

HAND HELD SERVICES 

CROSS REFERENCE TO RELATED 
APPLICATIONS 

This application is a division of U.S. application Ser. No. 
12/491,305, filed on Jun. 25, 2009, which claims priority to, 
and benefit of, U.S. Provisional Application No. 61/075,523, 
filed Jun. 25, 2008, and U.S. Provisional Application No. 
61/111,761, filed Nov. 6, 2008, the disclosures of which are 
hereby incorporated by reference herein. 

BACKGROUND 

1. Field 
The present invention generally relates to ATSC digital 

television (“DTV) and mobile/handheld (“M/H') broadcast 
systems, and more particularly to data frame and trellis 
encoder synchronization. 

2. Related Art 
A single-frequency network (“SFN) is a collection of 

transmitters operating on the same frequency for carrying the 
same information to receivers in a given area. The transmit 
ters emit identical signals, several of which may be received 
more or less simultaneously by individual receivers. One 
application of SFNs is for transmission of digitally encoded 
data for digital television (“DTV), the system and related 
standards for which have been established by the Advanced 
Television Systems Committee (ATSC). Under the ATSC's 
DTV standard (or A/53 standard), it is possible to transmit 
large amounts of data including high definition pictures, high 
quality sound, multiple standard definition pictures, and other 
ancillary related or unrelated communications, which may be 
accessible by using, for example, a stationary receiver Such as 
a computer or television set. Such stationary receivers are also 
interchangeably referred to as “fixed receivers. The data 
broadcasted to stationary receivers are interchangeably 
referred to as “normal data,” “main service data' and “main 
stream data.” 

Another application of SFNs is for transmission of digi 
tally encoded data for mobile/handheld (“M/H) devices, the 
system and related Standards for which are currently being 
established as a candidate standard, the document for which is 
designated the ATSC A/153 candidate standard (also referred 
to as the “M/HDTV candidate standard'). Under the A/153 
candidate standard, M/H broadcasting services share the 
same RF channel as the ATSC A/53 broadcast service and are 
provided using a portion of the ~19.39 Mbps of the ATSC 
8-level vestigial sideband (“8-VSB) signal bandwidth. 

FIG. 1 depicts the system core functions and enhancement 
tools that have been added to the A/53 standard 102 to form 
the A/153 candidate standard 112. Generally, the A/53 can 
didate standard is based on the VSB modulation as is the 
standard ATSC A/53 broadcast service, coupled with addi 
tional forward error correction mechanisms and known train 
ing sequences to aid mobile receivers. As shown in FIG.1, the 
A/153 candidate standard requires, among other things, 
known data frame offsets 104 to map data packets with the 
A/153 standards frame structure, and pre-coder and trellis 
encoder initialization 106 (pre-coder and trellis encoder are 
collectively referred to herein as a “trellis coder”), which 
provides in part the mechanism for creating known training 
sequences. Techniques for providing VSB data frame and 

10 

15 

25 

30 

35 

40 

45 

50 

55 

60 

65 

2 
trellis coder synchronization are described in U.S. Pat. No. 
7.532,677 (the 677 patent), which is hereby incorporated 
herein by reference in its entirety. 
The system achieves the robustness needed for mobile 

reception by adding extra training sequences 108 and several 
levels of forward error correction (“FEC), one at the packet 
layer by a 2D Reed Solomon/CRC code, and another at the 
physical layer by a serial concatenated convolution code 
(“SCCC’) 110, which is formed together with the trellis 
coding of the 8-VSB exciter. A parallel concatenated code 
(“PCCC’) is also used for robust signalling to the mobile 
receiver. 

FIG. 2 depicts a block diagram of an ATSC M/H transmis 
sion system including a pre-processor 204 (also referred to as 
an “M/H multiplexer”) and a post-processor 222, 222, ..., 
222. . . . , 222. Generally, the M/H system is a dual-stream 
system including an ATSC service multiplexer for existing 
digital television services or “main service' data and an M/H 
service multiplexer for one or more mobile and handheld 
services or “M/H service' data. An example of such a trans 
mission system is described in U.S. Pat. No. 7.532,857, which 
is hereby incorporated herein by reference in its entirety. 
As shown in FIG. 2, the main service and M/H service 

multiplexers feed into a head-end 202(e.g., in a studio) where 
signal processing of main and M/H service data is performed. 
The processed data is then communicated over a studio 
transmitter link (STL) 206, 206, ..., 206, ..., 206, to a 
post-processor 222, 222, ..., 222,..., 222, at a remotely 
positioned transmitter 224, 224, . . . , 224, . . . , 224. As 
described in the A/153 candidate standard, in pre-processor 
204, M/H service data are encoded with a Reed-Solomon/ 
CRC ("RS/CRC) coding in the M/H Frame encoder 210, a 
serial concatenated convolutional encoder in the block pro 
cessor 212. Pre-processor 204 also generates signalling infor 
mation Such as status data Such as the length, the periodicity 
and the sequence number of data units for each service, the 
time marker for transmission time of each data unit, and so on 
which are PCCC (Parallel concentrated code) encoded by a 
signalling encoder 213 and combined with MH encoded data 
in the group formatter 214. The encoded M/H payload data 
containing M/H training signals, additional control and status 
data are formatted into a MH Group by the group formatter 
214 and formed into Mobile Handheld Encapsulated (MHE) 
transport stream (TS) data packets with a packet identifier 
(“PID) (in a normal ATSCTS header) by the packet format 
ter 216 at the end of pre-processing. 

Markers in TS data packets with main service data are 
modified by a packet timing and program clock reference 
(PCR) adjustment unit 220 which performs packet timing and 
PCR adjustment. A consecutively positioned packet multi 
plexer 218 multiplexes the normal TS data packets with MHE 
TS data packets to form the nominal 19,392.658 bit/s data rate 
specified in the A/53 standard. 
At each remote positioned transmitter 224, 224, . . . . 

224, . . . , 224 in the post-processor 222, 2222. . . . . 
222,..., 222, the normal data packets are channel coded as 
specified in A/53 to maintain compatibility with normal 
ATSC receivers. This includes stages which provide data 
randomization by a data randomizer 226, 226, . . . , 226, 
226, Systematic/non-systematic RS encoding by encoder 
228, data interleaving by interleaver 230, 230, ..., 230, 
230, and trellis encoding by trellis encoder 234, 234,..., 
234, 234. All stages in the post processor 222, 222. . . . . 
222. . . . , 222, other than data interleaver 230, have a dual 
mode (i.e. normal/MHE) capability which is selected per the 
type of packet (normal/MHE) being processed. Each post 
processor 222, 222. . . . , 222, ..., 222, is followed by a 
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synchronization multiplexer240, 240, ..., 240, ... , 240, 
for inserting synchronizing data (e.g., data field segments and 
data segment sync). Signalling is inserted in the data field 
sync to signal to receivers when MH mode is active or not, a 
pilot inserter 242,242,..., 242,..., 242, for inserting pilot 
symbols in the transport data stream, an optional pre-equal 
izer 244, 244. . . . , 244. . . . , 244, an 8-VSB modulator 
246, 246. . . . . 246. . . . . 246, an RF-up-converter 248, 
248. . . . . 248, . . . . 248, for RF signal processing and a 
transmitter antenna 250, 250, ..., 250, ..., 250. 

Non-Systematic RS parity bytes are calculated and placed 
in known positions within each MH Group by Non-System 
atic RS encoding in encoder 228, 228, ..., 228, 228, these 
positions enable, in part, the generation of six long MH train 
ing signals in each MH Group. Each of the six training 
sequences begins with 12 initialization bytes (one for each 1 
of 12 trellis encoders) and is used by modified trellis encoder 
234i, 234. . . . , 234, 234, to initialize all trellis states to a 
known Zero value before the following known training data 
begins to enter the trellis encoder. This action will create 
known repeatable training symbols for MH receivers. The 
encoder 228, 228, ..., 228, 228, inserts the non-systematic 
parity bytes prior to trellis initialization in modified trellis 
encoder 234,234,..., 234,234. Some parity will become 
erroneous after the training initialization bytes are processed 
(i.e., values are changed) in modified trellis encoder accord 
ing to the A/153 candidate standard. Accordingly, modified 
trellis encoder 234, 234. . . . , 234, 234, supplies these 
changed initialization bytes to a non-systematic RS encoder 
236, 236, . . . , 236, 236, which (non-systematically) 
re-calculates the RS parity of corresponding M/H packets 
using the changed data and original packet data from data 
interleaver 230, 230, ... , 230, 230. The new RS parity 
bytes obtained by performing the non-systematic RS re-en 
coding process are Supplied to RS parity replacer 238, 
238, . . . , 238, 238, which selects the output of the data 
interleaver 230, 230, . . . , 230, 230, or the output of 
non-systematic RS encoder 236,236, ..., 236,236, with 
the re-calculated RS parity. 

FIG.3 depicts the structure of an M/HFrame according to 
the A/153 candidate standard. As shown in FIG. 3, a data 
stream of consecutively transmitted M/H data frames 
includes 5 MWH Sub-Frames. Each sub-frame contains 156 
TS data packets and each TS data packet is 188 bytes. Each set 
of 156TS data packets is referred to as an M/HSlot which can 
contain a combination of M/H data packets and normal data 
packets, or only normal data packets. In normal data packets, 
only digital data for stationary (or fixed) receivers are trans 
ferred, whereas M/H data packets contain only data for M/H 
receivers. 
More specifically, an M/HSlot may contain 118 data pack 

ets with data for M/H receivers (i.e., “M/H Group’) and 38 
data packets of normal data for stationary receivers, i.e., "nor 
mal 38 packets'. Alternatively, an M/HSlot may contain 156 
data packets of normal data only (i.e., “normal 156 packets” 
with data for stationary or “main stream receivers). The 
mapping of the received ATSC M/H packets to positions in an 
8-level vestigial sideband (“8-VSB) data field is shown in 
FIG. 4. One purpose for this data mapping is to ensure MHE 
TS packets sent from pre-processor 204 are synchronized in 
and with post-processor 222, 222,..., 222, 222, in the MH 
exciter. This mapping also enables MH receivers to tune and 
select the MH data wanted during reception by ensuring the 
MH data will be at known symbol positions in the physical 
layer VSB Frame. As shown in FIG. 4, the 38th data packet 
(#37) in an ATSCM/HGroup received in the first data slot #0 
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4 
of a first sub-frame #0 in the received ATSC MIH data frame 
is mapped to the first position for a data packet in an odd VSB 
data field. 
The 38th data packet in the ATSC M/H Group received in 

Slot #2 is mapped to the first position for a data packet in an 
even VSB data field. The 38th data packet in the ATSC M/H 
Group received in Slot #1 is mapped to the 157th position for 
a data packet in an odd VSB data field. And, the 38th data 
packet in the ATSC M/H Group received in Slot #3 is mapped 
to the 157th position for a data packet in an even VSB data 
field. 

According to the A/153 candidate standard, an ATSC M/H 
Group with a data structure corresponding to FIG. 4 is created 
in the pre-processor 204 (FIG.2) in the ATSC M/H channel of 
the head-end 202 (FIG. 2). In total, 45 dummy bytes are 
placed in the 118 MHE packets of an ATSC M/H Group. 
These A/153 dummy bytes are used as padding bytes and 
serve no other useful purpose. Some of these dummy bytes 
will be used in the present invention to create a point to point 
signalling channel between pre-processor and post-proces 
sor. There are 13 dummy bytes in the first two (2) MHE 
packets including eight (8) dummy bytes in the 1 MHE 
packet and five (5) dummy bytes in the 2" MHE packet. 
When transmitted between transmitters and receivers, all 
these dummy bytes typically have a fixed pre-selected value, 
e.g. 0xAF. 

Since the pre-processor 204 and post-processor(s) 222, 
222,..., 222, 222, (FIG. 2) are remote from each other, they 
need to be synchronized to one another (i.e., a deterministic 
mapping with a known packet offset between the start of a 
VSB field and the MHE packets carrying enhanced data must 
be set). There also needs to be a way for the post processor 
222i to distinguish MHE packets and normal data packets 
when the packets are received at the exciter. Currently, neither 
the A/53 nor A/153-candidate standards provide mechanisms 
for signalling a mode or for synchronization between the pre 
and post processors, or for identifying the MHE packets in the 
exciter. In addition, there is a need to provide a mechanism to 
switch between modes in ATSCSFN, particularly ATSCSFN 
with M/H services and ATSC SFN without M/H services, and 
vice versa. U.S. patent application Ser. No. 12/468,938 (the 
“938 application'), filed on May 20, 2009, and hereby incor 
porated herein by reference in its entirety, describes example 
mechanisms for performing such synchronization and iden 
tification for a single transmitter. 
As described in the 938 application, to synchronize the 

pre-processor with the post-processor, each exciter uses sig 
nalling information determined in the pre-processing stage at 
the head-end. This signalling information is inserted by the 
packet multiplexer (FIG. 2, 218) in particular byte positions 
in the MH Group that are set aside for dummy bytes specified 
in the A/153 candidate standard. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION 

The example embodiments described herein meet the 
above-identified needs by providing apparatus, systems, 
methods and computer program products for producing a 
single frequency network for ATSC mobile/handheld ser 
vices. 

In one aspect of the present invention, a method for pro 
ducing coherent symbols from digital RF transmitters is pro 
vided. The method includes selecting, by a processor, data 
bytes corresponding to mobile-handheld (MH) encapsulation 
(MHE) packets and setting each one of the trellis coders to a 
predetermined state when a predetermined number of bits of 
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the data bytes enter a corresponding trellis coder. This causes 
the digital RF transmitters to transmit symbols coherently. 

In another example aspect of the present invention, an 
apparatus for producing coherent symbols is provided. The 
apparatus includes a processor and trellis coders. The proces 
Sor selects data bytes corresponding to mobile-handheld 
(MH) Encapsulation (MHE) packets and the trellis coders are 
capable of being set to a predetermined State based on a 
predetermined number of bits of the data bytes, correspond 
ingly. This causes the digital RF transmitters to transmit sym 
bols coherently. 

In yet another example aspect of the present invention, a 
method for performing data frame synchronization is pro 
vided, including replacing a predetermined number of bytes 
to be transmitted onto a studio-transmitter link with bytes 
containing signalling information and transmitting the prede 
termined number of bytes in a transport stream over the 
studio-to transmitter link. 
The method may further include assigning a packet iden 

tifier to a predetermined number of transport stream packets, 
where the packet identifier is unknown or known (i.e., pre 
stored) to a post processor on the studio-transmitter link. The 
method includes calculating a first checksum on the bytes 
containing the signalling information, and transmitting the 
first checksum onto the studio-transmitter link to the post 
processor. If the packet identifier is unknown, upon receiving 
the transport stream from the studio-transmitter link, parsing 
is performed on the transport stream to obtain the packet 
identifier of each transport stream packet. In addition, search 
ing for a predetermined number of consecutive transport 
stream packets having the same packet identifier, calculating 
a second checksum of a portion of the predetermined number 
of transport stream packets, comparing the first checksum and 
the second checksum, and extracting the signalling informa 
tion if the first checksum and the second checksum are the 
same are performed. The signalling information obtained 
from the extracting is used to perform frame synchronization. 

If the packet identifier has been prestored, searching for the 
predetermined number of transport stream packets having the 
packet identifier prestored in the memory is performed. In 
turn, calculating a second checksum of a portion of the pre 
determined number of transport stream packets, comparing 
the first checksum and the second checksum, and extracting 
the signalling information if the first checksum and the sec 
ond checksum are the same are performed. The signalling 
information obtained from the extracting is then used to per 
form frame synchronization. 

In yet another aspect of the present invention, a system for 
performing data frame synchronization is provides including 
a group formatter and a packet transmitter. The group format 
ter replaces bytes to be transmitted onto a studio-transmitter 
link with bytes containing signalling information and the 
packet transmitter transmits the bytes in a transport stream 
over the studio-transmitter link. 
A multiplexer and processor may also be provided to the 

system. The multiplexer assigns a packet identifier to a pre 
determined number of transport stream packets, the packet 
identifier being unknown or known (i.e., prestored) to a post 
processor on the studio-transmitter link. A checksum calcu 
lator calculates a first checksum on the bytes containing the 
signalling information and the packet transmitter further 
transmits the first checksum onto the studio-transmitter link 
to the post-processor. A packet receiver receives the transport 
stream from the studio-transmitter link and a processor parse 
the transport stream to obtain the packet identifier of each 
transport stream packet. In the case where the packet identi 
fier is unknown, the processor searches for a predetermined 
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number of consecutive transport stream packets having the 
same packet identifier, calculates a second checksum of a 
portion of the predetermined number of transport stream 
packets, and compares the first checksum and the second 
checksum. The processor then extracts the signalling infor 
mation if the first checksum and the second checksum are the 
same, and uses the signalling information obtained from said 
extracting to perform frame synchronization. 

In the case where the packet identifier is known the pro 
cessor searches for the predetermined number of transport 
stream packets having the packet identifier prestored in the 
memory, calculates a second checksum of a portion of the 
predetermined number of transport stream packets, compares 
the first checksum and the second checksum, and extracts the 
signalling information if the first checksum and the second 
checksum are the same. The processor then uses the signal 
ling information to perform frame synchronization. 

In yet another aspect of the present invention, a method is 
provided for signalling a change in single frequency network 
(SFN) modes including a SFN with mobile-handheld (MH) 
data services mode and an SFN without MH data services 
mode. The method includes receiving a signalling packet 
containing a mode element for Switching each RF transmitter 
between the SFN with MH data Services mode and the SFN 
without MH data services mode and signalling to an exciter, 
based on the value of the mode element, that a predetermined 
number of data frames following the signalling packet will 
correspond to at least one of (1) the SFN mode with MH data 
services, and (2) the SFN mode without MH data services. 

Another aspect of the invention provides an apparatus for 
signalling a change in single frequency network (SFN) modes 
including a SFN with mobile-handheld (MH) data services 
mode and an SFN without MH data services mode including 
a packet receiver and a processor. The packet receiver 
receives a signalling packet containing a mode element for 
switching each RF transmitter between the SFN with MH 
data services mode and the SFN without MH data services 
mode. The processor generates a signal to an exciter, based on 
the value of the mode element, that a predetermined number 
of data frames following the signalling packet will corre 
spond to at least one of (1) the SFN mode with MH data 
services, and (2) the SFN mode without MH data services. 

Further features and advantages, as well as the structure 
and operation, of various example embodiments of the 
present invention are described in detail below with reference 
to the accompanying drawings. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

The features and advantages of the example embodiments 
of the invention presented herein will become more apparent 
from the detailed description set forth below when taken in 
conjunction with the drawings in which like reference num 
bers indicate identical or functionally similar elements. 

FIG. 1 depicts the system core functions and enhancement 
tools that have been added to the A/53 standard to form the 
A/153 candidate standard; 

FIG. 2 depicts a block diagram of an ATSC M/H transmis 
sion system; 
FIG.3 depicts the structure and individual components of 

an M/H Frame according to the A/153 candidate standard; 
FIG. 4 depicts a mapping of received ATSCM/H packets to 

positions in an 8-VSB data field; 
FIG.5 depicts the system core functions and enhancement 

tools that have been added to the A/53 standard which results 
in enhanced ATSC mobile DTV, in accordance with an 
embodiment of the presentation invention; 
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FIG. 6 is a block diagram of a pre-processor and a post 
processor with a mechanism for inserting signalling into the 
TS stream over the STL in accordance with an embodiment of 
the present invention; 

FIG.7 depicts A/153 pre-processor architecture and where 
the group formatter inserts 45 dummy bytes into an MH 
Group. 

FIG. 8 depicts a pre-processor architecture and MH Frame 
as well as the basic dummy byte signalling syntax used to 
enable the alignment of MHE packets to VSB Data Fields and 
signal a mode in accordance with an embodiment of the 
present invention; 

FIG. 9 illustrates a signalling syntax used in place of 13 
dummy bytes in an M/H Group in accordance with an 
embodiment of the present invention; 

FIG. 10 depicts 1 of 12 modified trellis encoders that can be 
set to a normal mode or an initialization mode according to 
the ATSC A/153 candidate standard, which are leveraged in 
accordance with an embodiment of the present invention; 

FIG. 11 depicts the input before and output after the ATSC 
52 segment continuous convolutional byte interleaver show 
ing the select 12 packets (each having a single trellis initial 
ization byte) to be used for ATSC M/H SFN in accordance 
with an embodiment of the present invention; 

FIG. 12 illustrates the output of an ATSC 52-segment con 
tinuous convolutional byte interleaver and a timing diagram 
showing the instant each 1 of 12 initialization bytes enters 1 of 
12trellis encoders and the initialization mode is active for two 
symbol clock cycles or 4 bits of symbol data, in accordance 
with an embodiment of the present invention; 

FIG. 13 depicts mapping of a VSB synchronization packet 
to a VSB frame in an ATSCSFN (i.e., without mobile data) in 
accordance with an embodiment of the present invention; 

FIG. 14 depicts a memory map of an ATSC 52-segment 
continuous convolutional byte interleaver showing time dis 
persion of inserted VSB synchronization packet (“VSP) 
which has some fixed byte syntax locations in ATSC SFN 
(i.e., without mobile data) in accordance with an embodiment 
of the present invention; 

FIG. 15 depicts a syntax for a VSB synchronization packet 
(“VSP) in ATSC SFN (i.e., without mobile data) in accor 
dance with an embodiment of the present invention; 

FIG.16 depicts two flowcharts showing processes for tran 
sitioning between normal ATSC SFN (i.e., without mobile 
data) and ATSC SFN M/H modes in accordance with an 
embodiment of the present invention. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION 

The example embodiments of the invention presented 
herein are directed to apparatus, systems, methods and com 
puter program products for producing a single frequency 
network for ATSC mobile/handheld services. This is for con 
Venience only and is not intended to limit the application of 
the present invention. In fact, after reading the following 
description, it will be apparent to one skilled in the relevant 
art(s) how to implement the following invention in alternative 
embodiments (e.g., single transmitter or multi-frequency net 
works). 
I. General Overview 

FIG.5 depicts the system core functions and enhancement 
tools that have been added to the A/53 standard which results 
in an enhanced ATSC mobile DTV standard 504. As shown in 
FIG. 5, the core functions of deterministic frame offset and 
trellis initialization have been leverage for the mechanisms 
for providing SFN 502. Some new ATSC Time 506 enhance 
ment tools are shown coupled with the existing ATSC A/153 
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candidate standard. Generally, example aspects of the present 
invention describe mechanisms for synchronizing MHE 
packets with VSB data frames and the synchronizing of trellis 
coders in an ATSC M/HDTV system in either an SFN or 
non-SFN environment. ATSC Time 506, which is applicable 
for data frame alignment, is described in U.S. patent applica 
tion Ser. No. 12/024.238, which is hereby incorporated herein 
by reference in its entirety. 
II. ATSC M/HTransmission System 

FIG. 6 is a block diagram of an ATSC M/H transmission 
system including a pre-processor 600 (also referred to inter 
changeably as an “M/H multiplexer) and a post processor 
650, 650, ... , 650, 650. In the head-end 616, pre-proces 
sor 600 includes an M/HFrame encoder 602, a block proces 
sor 604, a group formatter 606, a signalling encoder 608, and 
a packet formatter 610. M/H Frame encoder 602 receives 
M/H service data and constructs RS/CRC Frames from the 
M/H service data. Block processor 604, in turn, performs an 
outer Serial Concatenated Convolution Code (SCCC) of the 
coded data received from the M/HFrame encoder 602. Group 
formatter 606 maps the FEC coded M/H service data received 
from block processor 604 into corresponding M/H blocks of 
an MVH Group, along with pre-determined training data 
bytes, PCCC-encoded signalling data, and data bytes to be 
used for initializing the trellis encoder memories. Group for 
matter 606 also inserts placeholder bytes for main service 
data, MPEG-2 headers, non-systematic RS parity, and 
dummy data bytes to complete construction of the intended 
group format. A packet formatter 610 then processes and 
formats the bytes of data output by group formatter 606 and 
completes creation of the MHE packets. PCRadjustment unit 
612 performs packet timing and PCR adjustment. A consecu 
tively positioned packet multiplexer 614, in turn, multiplexes 
the normal TS data fed by packet timing and PCR adjustment 
unit 612 with MHETS data packets fed by packet formatter 
610. 
III. M/HData Frame Synchronization Using Dummy Bytes 

FIG. 7 depicts the architecture of a pre-processor 600 
described above with respect to FIG. 6 as well as a mapping 
showing locations populated by dummy bytes. Group format 
ter 606, normally fills the M/H Frame with 45 dummy data 
bytes eachina known location and having a value of 0xAF per 
the A/153 candidate standard to complete the M/H Group 
structure. Thirteen (13) of these dummy bytes from the first 
two (2) MHE packets of a MH Group will be replaced with a 
new signalling syntax in the packet multiplexer 614. Refer 
ring to both FIGS. 6 and 7, the new dummy byte syntax is 
transmitted from packet multiplexer 614 over the STL 620, 
620, . . . , 620, 620 to the post-processor 650, in part to 
signal MH framing in the post-processor 650, 650, . . . . 
650, 650 (e.g., exciter). Post-processor 650, 650,..., 650, 
650, extracts the signalling data and replaces the fields hold 
ing this data with dummy bytes with the normal value 0xAF 
per the A/153 candidate standard. Hence, a point to point 
signalling channel between the pre-processor 600 and post 
processor 650, 650, . . . , 650, 650, over the STL 620, 
620, . . . , 620, 620, is established using thirteen (13) of 
forty-five (45) dummy bytes. For more signalling capacity the 
dummy bytes #14-45 can be used for future extensibility. 
The first twelve (12) dummy bytes transfer signalling 

information and the 13" dummy byte transfers a cyclic-re 
dundancy-check (“CRC) checksum calculated over the pre 
ceding 96 bits of signalling information for security and Veri 
fication purposes. In an example embodiment, the CRC check 
is an 8-bit CRC checksum, but another redundancy check 
algorithm can be used instead. 
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FIG. 8 depicts the pre-processor architecture 600 described 
above with respect to FIGS. 6 and 7 as well as the minimum 
dummy byte syntax 802 needed for MH Frame synchroniza 
tion. As shown in FIG. 8, packet multiplexer 614 creates five 
(5) M/HSub-Frames 812. Each sub-frame contains sixteen 
(16) slots 808 of 156 TS data packets where each TS data 
packet has 188 bytes. An M/H Slot may contain 118 data 
MHE packets with data for M/H receivers (i.e., “M/H 
Group') 804a and 38 data packets of normal data for station 
ary receivers (i.e., “normal 38 packets’) 804b, collectively 
804. Alternatively, a data slot may contain 156 data packets of 
normal data only (i.e., “normal 156 packets' with data for 
stationary or “mainstream receivers) 806. Every M/HGroup 
consists of 118 consecutive MHE packets and is formed and 
assigned the same thirteen (13) bit packet identifier (PID) 
value by packet formatter 610 located immediately before 
packet multiplexer 614 in pre-processor 600. The PID value 
can be a reserved value known to both pre-processor 600 and 
post-processor 650, 650, ... , 650, 650, in advance. Alter 
natively, the PID value may be a value known only to pre 
processor 600, which is discovered and verified by an algo 
rithm in post-processor 650, 650, ... , 650, 650. 

To start the MH Frame synchronization process, the exciter 
parses the incoming transport stream received over the STL 
620, 620, ..., 620, 620, looking at the PID value of every 
packet. If a reserved PID is in use, and known by exciter, the 
incoming stream is searched for the reserved PID. When 118 
consecutive reserved PID values are found, this indicates 
discovery of a MH Group. 

If the PID value used is known only to the pre-processor 
600, a discovery algorithm is performed by the exciter. The 
exciter parses the incoming stream and looks for any PID 
value that is present in 118 consecutive packets in the incom 
ing stream. Once 118 consecutive packets with the same PID 
are found, the first two (2) packets are treated as MHE packets 
and the CRC checksum from 13" byte is used to verify that 
118 consecutive packets are trulya MH Group. If CRC check 
sum is correct, it means that the MH Group (and the PID being 
used) has been discovered and verified by the exciter. 

Packet multiplexer 614 inserts signalling bits into the first 
two MHE packets of every MH Group in spaces normally 
occupied by dummy bytes. Once the exciter post processor 
650, 650, . . . , 650, 650, discovers and verifies the MH 
Group, the signalling syntax 802 carried in the twelve (12) 
dummy byte positions is used. In one embodiment, before the 
signalling data carried in the MHE packets reaches data ran 
domizer 652, 652. . . . , 652, 652, a processor (or other 
control logic) extracts the signalling data and resets the cor 
responding fields with dummy bytes (e.g., resets the element 
values to a value of 0xAF (hex)). 
The first thirteen (13) dummy bytes of an M/H Group are 

thus modified to create a point to point signalling channel. 
FIG. 8 shows a portion of syntax 802 used to signal to the 
exciter for MH frame synchronization. The full syntax with 
signalling for SFNTiming, etc., is shown for corresponding 
packet/byte pairs (902/904) in more detail in FIG. 9. The 
signalling information is carried in the first two (2) MHE 
packets of an ATSC M/H Group, and includes the following 
Syntax and semantics: 
Mode (1 bit)906: indicates control information for switch 

ing exciters from a first operation mode, in which data for 
both stationary and mobile receivers are transmitted, to a 
second operation mode, in which only data for stationary 
receivers are transmitted. When in ATSC SFN MIH mode, 
this mode bit is used to signal a mode change from ATSC SFN 
M/H mode to normal ATSC SFN mode (i.e. no mobile data). 
In an example embodiment, the Mode field 906 is set to 0 
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10 
only during the last M/H Frame before the M/H mode ends, 
otherwise it is set to 1. This allows the head end (e.g., from 
M/H multiplexer 614) to signal the exciter that the next M/H 
Frame will begin an ATSC SFN normal mode. This also 
signals the appearance of a VSB synchronization packet 
(VSP) in the next M/HFrame to be used for VSB framing and 
trellis initialization for SFN operation in normal ATSC SFN 
mode. The exciter will also set the enhanced mode bits in the 
Data Field Sync (“DFS) signal that the normal ATSC mode 
is being used. 

subframe number (3 bits) 908: Provides implicit signal 
ling of a MH sub-frame number, indicating the current sub 
frame number (0-4) within the M/H Frame carrying these 
signalling bits. 

slot number (4 bits) 910: Provides implicit signalling of 
MH slot number indicating the number of the current slot 
(0-15) within the M/HSub-Frames carrying these signalling 
bits. 
By signalling the current sub-frame number (0-4) and slot 

number (0-15) the post-processor 650, 650, ... , 650, 650, 
can align the MHE packets to proper VSB data field with the 
proper offset described above with respect to FIG. 4, thus 
making MH frame synchronization possible. MH frame syn 
chronization for this enhanced SFN 502 is shown in FIG.5by 
the dashed arrow pointing from deterministic frame offset 
104 towards SFN 502. 

sync time stamp (24 bits unsigned) 912: In an SFN, this 
value indicates the elapsed time, measured in 100 ns incre 
ments, between a 1-second tick of a GPS seconds reference 
clock and the release from an M/H multiplexer of the first bit 
of a M/H encapsulation (“MHE) packet into the distribution 
network (i.e., STL). This time stamp is compared with a local 
GPS reference at the exciter to enable the actual path time 
delay through the STL to be calculated. The result is then used 
in part to set size of FIFO buffer in the exciter. 
max delay (24 bits) 914: A value that is selected to be 

larger than the longest path delay in the distribution network 
(STL) to all exciters in a SFN and indicates a delay value from 
0 to 1 second in 100 nanosecond increments. This value is 
used with the calculated path time delay through STL at site 
to set the size of FIFO buffer in each exciter individually in 
SFN. By using the following equation: 

max delay (ns); STL path delay (ns)=size FIFO buffer 
(ns) (1) 

This enables the same TS packets to be sent over the STL and 
be removed from the FIFO at the same time independent of 
the different time delays experienced by the packets over STL 
to each transmitter in SFN. 

It should be understood that the time references described 
above at headend needed for SFN can be derived from a GPS 
receiver 1PPS or alternatively by an NTP (network time pro 
tocol) from an NTP server as described in German Patent 
Applin. DE 102008031796.9, which is hereby incorporated 
herein by reference in its entirety. 

System time (2 bits) 916: indicates the status of ATSC 
system time (more commonly referred to as ATSC Time') 
described in U.S. patent application Ser. No. 12/024.238, 
which is hereby incorporated herein by reference in its 
entirety. When set to 11, ATSC Time is not active. When set 
to 00, ATSC Time is active and a release of M/HFrame is in 
cadence with a GPS/ATSC Epoch. When set to '01, ATSC 
Time is active and adjusted GPS Seconds count is used to 
send the GPS seconds count to an exciter. When set to 10, 
ATSC Time is active and the GPS (seconds) count is available 
at the exciter and therefore adjusted GPS seconds count is 
not Sent. 
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MTxID (1 bit)918: when setto “1, the MTxID is On: when 
set to “O, MTxID is Off. 
MTXID MH Frame Align (2 bits) 920: a counter (started 

at 00 at Epoch) that cycles (00:01,10,11) and indicates a 
known offset of MTXID to the start of a M7H Frame. When 
MTXID MH Frame Align is equal to 00, it indicates that 
MTXID and the M/H Frame have the same alignment at 
Epoch; all other counts have a known offset. This enables 
exciter to start MTxID with a correct phase relative to a start 
of M/H Frame. 
An MTXID data block contains 32 fields and an M/HFrame 

contains 40 fields. A starting offset needs to be calculated 
from an epoch and signaled to an exciter which in turn inserts 
the MTxID in the correct phase. 

Reserved (3 bits) 922: all reserved bits set to 1. 
adjusted gps seconds count (32-bit unsigned integer) 

924: This field preferably contains the value of the globally 
available GPS seconds count, at the instant of release of the 
first MHE packet from M/H multiplexer 600. When the sum 
of the values of the synchronization time stamp and maxi 
mum delay is less than 10,000,000 the current value of glo 
bally available GPS seconds count is sent in MHE packet. 
When the sum is greater than 10,000,000, the currently avail 
able GPS seconds count shall be incremented by one (+1) 
before sending in MHE packet. This is only used in ATSC 
Time when a GPS seconds count is not available at the exciter. 
CRC-8 (8 bits) 926: a CRC-8 calculated over all 96 pre 

ceding bits of dummy byte signalling data. 
IV. M/H Deterministic Trellis Initialization (SFN) 

FIG. 10 depicts 1 of 12 modified trellis encoders 1002. 
Each encoder includes a multiplexer to switch between a 
normal (“N”) input mode 1004 and an initialization (“I”) 
input mode 1006 which is fed back from the delay devices 
within the trellis encoder. A normal/initialization control 
input to the multiplexer is used to select the initialization 
input path when initialization is required. Particularly, the 
normal/initialization control input selects the initialization 
path during the leading 2-symbol interval (4 bits) of each 
respective (1 of 12) trellis initialization bytes to synchronize 
(1 of 12) respective trellis codes to a Zero state. This permits 
pre-calculated training signal (FIG. 5, 108) data values to be 
inserted into the trellis encoder immediately after trellis ini 
tialization, resulting in known and repeatable training signal 
symbol sequences being produced by the modified trellis 
encoders. The multiplexer selects the normal path at all other 
times. The trellis initialization circuit shown in 1002 can also 
be used to enable synchronization of all trellis encoders in all 
exciters to support creating an SFN, as illustrated in FIG.5 by 
a dashed arrow pointing from trellis initialization 106towards 
SFN SO2. 
The use of the basic core function trellis initialization 106, 

for producing coherent symbols from multiple exciters in 
digital RF transmitters (i.e., in an SFN), will now be 
described. Referring again to FIG. 10, with the Mux of a 
trellis encoder in the initialization mode 1006, both inputs of 
the exclusive OR (XOR) gates are forced to the same logic 
value, particularly a logic Zero (0) output from XOR indepen 
dent of logic input, as shown in the XOR truth table 1008. 
Since the two D memory latches are in series in the Z0 path, 
two symbol clock cycles are required to initialize the state of 
trellis encoders. Thus, to initialize the three D memory latches 
all to a common Zero (0) state, the initialization line (“I’) on 
multiplexer is enabled for two symbol clock periods. This 
occurs as the first 4 bits (i.e., 2+2) from each initialization 
byte first enter the respective trellis encoder as will be 
explained. This forces both inputs of the exclusive OR gate to 
a common logic level to produces a Zero (0) output indepen 
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12 
dent of the current state. All three D memory latches will 
assume a Zero (0) output state after two symbol clock periods 
in initialization mode. 

Selection of the 12 trellis initialization bytes which will be 
used for MH SFN will now be described with reference to 
FIGS. 6 and 11. FIG. 11 depicts the post-processor 650, 
650,..., 650, ... , 650, in the MH exciter, when a 118 MHE 
packet (MH Group) is processed by the non-systematic RS 
encoder. Twenty (20) non-systematic RS parity bytes are 
generated for each MHE packet and placed in pre-determined 
locations within the MHE packet defined by the A/153 can 
didate standard. The MHE packet payload data (i.e., mobile 
data) is of no use to a normal ATSC receiver. Thus, a PID 
assigned the MHE packet is not recognized as a normal ATSC 
service and the MHE packets are simply ignored by an ATSC 
receiver. This ensures legacy backward compatibility. The 
output of the non-systematic RS encoder 654, 654, . . . . 
654, . . . , 654, before the data interleaver 656, 656, . . . . 
656, . . . , 656, mapping is shown in 1116 with the twelve 
(12) MHE packet/byte pairs selected (e.g., 1/19, 2/19, 3/19, 
4/19, 5/23, 6,23, 7/23, 8/23, 9/27, 10/27, 11/27, 12/27) for 
SFN trellis initialization. Each select byte from a packet/byte 
pair has been identified a priori before data interleaver 656, 
656, ... , 656, ... , 656, and will enter a respective (1 of 12) 
trellis encoder 660, 660, ... , 660, . . . , 660, as shown in 
mapping 1118 later in the post processing, at which time 
trellis initialization is conducted on the first 4 bits of each 
initialization byte shown in mapping 1116. With the Mux of 
trellis encoder 660, 660. . . . , 660, . . . , 660, in the 
initialization mode, both inputs of the exclusive OR (XOR) 
gates are forced to the same logic value this produces a logic 
Zero (0) output from XOR independent of logic input as 
shown in logic table 1008 (FIG. 10). To initialize the three D 
memory latches to a common Zero (0) state, the initialization 
line (“I’) on multiplexer is enabled for two symbol clock 
periods. This occurs on the first 4 bits (2 bits per symbol) from 
each initialization byte as they enter a respective trellis 
encoder. 

This trellis initialization causes all trellis encoder states to 
be set to the same Zero State at the same time, in each exciter 
in the SFN network. This will then produce coherent symbols 
from all transmitters (given the VSB Data Frames are syn 
chronized and all exciters are receiving the same data stream 
over the STL), which is a requirement for an SFN. 
The twelve (12) trellis initialization bytes selected are non 

systematic RS parity bytes from twelve (12) MHE packets. 
Using a RS parity byte for trellis initialization reduces the 
number of non-systematic RS parity bytes from 20 to 19 (i.e., 
1 byte is used trellis initialization) only over these twelve (12) 
MHE packets of MH Group #0, sub-frame #0, slot #0 once 
per MH frame (every 12,480 packets). This will cause a very 
small reduction of approximately 0.2 dB in RS error correc 
tion capability for just these 12 MHE packets alone approxi 
mately once per second. As described above, these and all 
MHE packets are discarded by legacy ATSC receivers (not 
shown). The non systematic RS parity is not used by MH 
mobile receivers. Thus, the reduction of parity bytes will not 
materially effect mobile services. 

FIG. 12 illustrates exemplary initialization of trellis encod 
ers 0-11 (1208) according to an embodiment of the present 
invention. As shown in FIG. 12, twelve initialization bytes 
shown in mapping 1202 are activated upon by a rising edge of 
the initialization (“I’) mode control signal 1206 as each ini 
tialization byte enters a respective (1 of 12) trellis encoder 
660, 660. . . . , 660. . . . , 660, as described above with 
respect to FIGS. 10 and 11. 
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V. Normal Mode VSB Frame Synchronization (SFN) 
When a station is operating with ATSC A/153 MH content 

in an SFN, the dummy byte signalling (i.e., VSB Frame 
Synchronization) and non-systematic RS parity bytes (trellis 
initialization) as described above are used to establish and 
maintain the synchronization in SFN. However, if a station 
desires to stop transmission of all MH mobile content (i.e., 
returns to normal A/53 mode) maintaining SFN in normal 
mode, a different mechanism in accordance with an embodi 
ment of the present invention, is used. This aspect of the 
present invention is used because the dummy bytes and non 
systematic RS parity bytes are only available when the station 
is broadcasting ATSC A/153 MH data. 

FIG. 13 depicts the mapping of a VSB synchronization 
packet (“VSP) 1302 sent over an STL to a A/53 VSB frame 
1304 generated in the exciter in accordance with an embodi 
ment of the present invention. In one embodiment, shown in 
FIG. 13, a VSP is transmitted to all exciters in the SFN once 
every 12,480 packets, which defines the cadence (i.e., 20VSB 
frames exactly equal to the length of a MH frame). In this 
example, a single VSP is sent as the last packet of the 12,480 
packet cadence and its appearance in TS defines the start of a 
VSB frame, as shown in FIG. 13. Preferably, the first packet 
after the VSP will be mapped as the first packet of an odd VSB 
data field. Thus, the cadence is the same in both MH SFN 
mode and normal SFN mode, which improves the switching 
between modes. The VSP also can be locked to an ATSC 
system time epoch. 

Referring briefly to FIG. 15 the syntax of a VSP is illus 
trated. As shown in FIG. 15, a VSP includes a packet identifier 
(“PID) 1504. In accordance with an example embodiment of 
the present invention, PID 1504 is used to identify a VSP in 
the transport stream. The PID value can be identified by using 
a reserved PID value which is known between MH multi 
plexer at studio and exciter. Alternatively, the PID value can 
be a null packet (e.g., 0x1FFF) or any undefined PID. The 
discovery algorithm and verification methods for both cases 
is described below. 

FIG. 14 depicts a memory map of an ATSC 52-segment 
continuous convolutional byte interleaver 1414 showing the 
time dispersion of VSB synchronization packet (“VSP). As 
shown in FIG. 14, a VSP 1408 contains a header 1402 fol 
lowed by signalling data 1404. The header section 1402 con 
tains a 13 bit VSP PID. If a reserved PID is used, the exciter 
will discover this by parsing the incoming TS sent over STL 
until it finds the reserved PID value in a packet. In an example 
embodiment, the reserved PID value is sent once every 
12,480 packets. 
Once the reserved PID value has been located within the 

TS, the exciter calculates the CRC 32 checksum 1410 carried 
at the end of the received packet to verify that it is a VSP. The 
exciter will then find the VSP PID value once every 12,480 
packets because the MH multiplexer is generating this 
cadence which the exciter then slaves to. As described above 
with regard to FIG. 13, the VSP is then aligned 1304 and the 
next packet following the VSP will start an odd VSB data 
field. 

Ifa Null packet oran undefined PID value is used for a VSP 
these can appear multiple times in a 12,480 packet cadence. 
To discover the PID value, the exciter parses every incoming 
packet and calculates the CRC32 checksum assumed to be 
carried in last four (4) bytes of all packets. When the Check 
sum is found to be correct this indicates this is the VSP. The 
exciter will then find this VSPPID value every 12,480 packets 
and the CRC32 checksum is checked and found to be correct. 
This gives confidence the exciter is synchronized with 
cadence. As described above with regard to FIG. 13, the VSP 
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14 
is then aligned 1304 and the next packet following VSP will 
start an odd VSB data field. The undefined PID or Null packet 
may occur several times during cadence interval, but will 
have VSP Syntax only every 12,480 packets. Either of the 
above VSP discovery methods may be used to provide more 
system flexibility in operation. 
VI. Normal Mode Deterministic Trellis Reset or Initialization 
(SFN) 

In normal mode SFNitis also necessary to synchronize the 
trellis encoder memories of all exciters in a SFN to a common 
Zero state at specific points in time in the data stream simul 
taneously by all exciters in a SFN. In another embodiment, a 
deterministic trellis reset (DTR) or initialization byte is used 
to perform trellis encoder synchronization. The VSP 1408 has 
twelve (12) pre-determined byte (DTR) positions 1406. Each 
byte will be used to initialize (1 of 12) trellis encoders when 
the byte first enters the respective (1 of 12) trellis encoder. 

Trellis encoder synchronization is accomplished based on 
a priori knowledge of the location of the interleaved VSP 
packet DTR bytes at the output of data byte interleaver before 
the trellis encoder stage. With the knowledge of the time 
dispersion of VSP at the output of the ATSC interleaver (once 
the data frame synchronization data has been achieved and 
the same data is being sent over STL to all exciters), twelve 
(12) predetermined byte positions 1406 in VSP are identified 
and used to trigger a DTR or initialization in each of the 
twelve trellis encoders in all of the exciters in the SFN. The 
initialization occurs as soon as each of these deterministically 
assigned bytes enters its designated trellis encoder. This will 
then cause Coherent symbols to be produced from all trans 
mitters in the SFN. 
The diagonal arrows in FIG. 14 shows the time dispersed 

positions assumed by bytes of the VSP 1412 in the interleaver. 
The four (4) bytes selected and marked (DTR) on each of the 
three diagonal sections show that these fixed position VSP 
bytes 53-56, 105-108, 157-160 will each be delivered deter 
ministically to one of the twelve (12) trellis coders numbered 
5, 2, 11, 8; 9.6, 3, 12; 1, 10, 7, 4, respectively, when they exit 
the interleaver memory. This allows the timing in the exciter 
to be designed to enable a deterministic trellis initialization 
1006 to a zero state to occur over the first 4 bits of each DTR 
orinitialization byte when each byte first enters the respective 
1 of 12 trellis encoder. 

This initialization will occur in a serial fashion over four 
(4) segments in every exciter and effectively synchronizes all 
twelve (12) trellis coders in all exciters in a deterministic 
fashion. Twelve (12) RS parity errors will occur on every VSP 
by the action of the trellis initialization on the twelve desig 
nated DTR bytes. This will not affect any packet carrying 
normal content. The VSP, which is identified as a reserved or 
undefined PID is not used for any purpose by normal ATSC 
receivers and will be ignored. As used for purpose of SFN the 
parity errors generated by trellis Initialization function 1006 
are not corrected by RS parity re-encoding 1114, 
1114. . . . , 1114, 1114, and parity replacer 1108, 
1108,..., 1108, 1108, as is described in the A/153 candi 
date standard when trellis initialization is used for purpose of 
generating known training signals. 

FIG. 15 depicts the syntax for a VSB synchronization 
packet (“VSP), in accordance with an embodiment of the 
present invention. The normal ATSC header 1504 has a thir 
teen (13) bit packet identifier (PID) which can be a reserved 
PID value, or an undefined freely assigned PID value that is 
assigned by the M/H multiplexer and sent over an STL and 
discovered downstream in an exciter. In addition to the nor 
mal ATSC header 1504 the VSP includes the following syntax 
and semantics: 
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The Mode (1 bit), System Time (2 bits), and Reserved (5 
bits) fields 1506 have the following semantics: 

Mode: used to signal a mode change from normal ATSC 
mode to ATSC M/H mode. In one example embodiment, the 
mode bit is set to 0 only during the last two (2) (Two) VSPs 
before the normal mode ends; otherwise it is set to 1. The 
M/H service multiplexer at the head-end provides signalling 
to an exciter that a transition to ATSC M/H mode will begin. 
This signalling also indicates that 118 consecutive MHE 
packets used for VSB Framing and trellis initialization for 
SFN operation in ATSC M/H mode will soon appear. In 
addition, this signalling also causes the exciter to set 
enhanced mode bits in a Data Field Sync to signal to receivers 
that the mode is ATSC M/H. 

System time (2 bits): indicates the status of ATSC Time 
described in U.S. patent application Ser. No. 12/024.238, 
which is hereby incorporated herein by reference in its 
entirety. When set to 11, ATSC Time is not active. When set 
to 00, ATSC Time is active. When set to 01 ATSC Time is 
active and adjusted GPS seconds count is used to send the 
GPS seconds count to an exciter. When set to 10, ATSC 
Time is active and the GPS Seconds count is available at 
exciter in which case adjusted GPS Seconds count is not 
Sent. 

Reserved (5 bits): remaining bits are reserved and set to 1. 
sync time stamp (24 bit unsigned integer) 1508: a field 

that indicates the elapsed time, measured in 100 ns incre 
ments, between a 1-second tick of the GPS (seconds) refer 
ence clock and the release from the M/H multiplexer (of the 
first bit of VSP Packet into the distribution network (i.e., 
STL). 
max delay (24 bit) 1510: a value that is selected to be 

larger than the longest STL delay path in the distribution 
network and indicates a delay from 0 to 1 sec in 100 ns 
increments. 

adjusted gps seconds count (32-bit unsigned integer) 
1512: a field that shall contain the value of the globally 
available GPS seconds count at the instant of release of VSP 
packet from M/H multiplexer 600. When the sum of the 
values of the synchronization time stamp and maximium 
delay fields in 100 ns increments is less than 10,000,000 (or 1 
second) the current value of globally available GPS seconds 
count is sent in VSP packet. When the sum is greater than 
10,000,000 the currently available GPS seconds count shall 
be incremented by one (+1) before sending it in a VSP. This is 
only used in ATSC Time when a GPS seconds count is not 
available at the exciter. 
DTR (32-bits) 1514-1518: provide a deterministic trellis 

reset (DTR) or initialization bits used to perform trellis 
encoder synchronization. In a preferred embodiment, these 
bits are set to 1. 
CRC 32 (32bits) 1520: the CRC checksum is calculated 

overall VSP bytes other than the DTR and is placed at the end 
of the VSP. When the exciter receives the VSP it calculates a 
CRC-32 checksum in same manner and compares with CRC 
32 in VSP. If the values are the same this verifies no data errors 
have occurred and this is a VSP. If the checksumdo not match 
an error in data has occurred or this is notaVSP. In a preferred 
embodiment, the remaining unused bytes/bits 1522 are 
reserved and set to 1. 

It is immaterial where the above signalling is carried within 
a VSP. Accordingly, it should be understood that the above 
Syntax can be carried in various locations and still be within 
the scope of the present invention. 
VII. Switching between ATSC Modes in SFN 

During ATSC A/153M/H (Mobile) operation, a broad 
caster may want to switch the M/H mode off and operate in 
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16 
normal ATSC A/53 mode (i.e., no mobile data), while main 
taining the SFN. Accordingly, mode switching under SFN 
operation must be supported. As explained above with refer 
ence to the MHE and VSP syntax, a mode element signals a 
mode change. 

FIG.16 depicts two flowcharts showing processes for tran 
sitioning between modes, particularly from a normal ATSC 
mode without M/H services using the VSP for SFN synchro 
nization to an ATSC mode with M/H services using the MHE 
packets and non-systematic RS parity bytes for SFN synchro 
nization, and vice versa. As shown in block 1602, the current 
mode is the normal ATSC mode, which uses VSP to provide 
SFN synchronization. In block 1604, the Mode bit is checked 
by the exciter to determine whether it has been set to 0 to 
signal a mode change from normal ATSC mode to ATSCM/H 
mode. 

If the Modebit is set to 0, this signals to the exciter that the 
next 20VSB Frames will correspond to the ATSCM/H mode 
and that MHE packets that are used for SFN operation in 
ATSC M/H mode will soon appear. Ifa determination is made 
at block 1606 that the Mode bit is set to “1, then it will loop 
back to block 1604. However, if a determination is made at 
block 1606 that the Mode bit is set to 0, then block 1608 
signals this to the exciter that the next M/H Frame will cor 
respond to the ATSC M/H mode and that MHE packets that 
are used for signalling and VSB framing and non-systematic 
RS parity bytes will be used for trellis initialization for SFN 
operation in ATSCM/H mode will begin. It also signals to the 
exciter to set enhanced mode bits in a Data Field Sync to 
signal to receivers that the mode is ATSC M/H mode. As 
shown in block 1610, the exciter is now prepared to transition 
to ATSC M/H mode and use dummy byte signalling. 
When switching from an SFN ATSC M/H mode to a SFN 

normal ATSC mode (i.e., no M/H services), the syntax includ 
ing dummy bytes will cease to exist. Block 1612 illustrates 
that the current mode is the ATSC M/H mode, which uses 
dummy bytes to provide frame synchronization. Block 1614 
checks the Modebit to determine whetherit has been setto '0' 
to signal a mode change from ATSC M/H mode to normal 
ATSC mode. If the Mode bit in the last M/HFrame before the 
M/H mode ends is set to 0, this signals to the exciter that the 
next 20 VSB Frames will correspond to the ATSC normal 
mode and that a VSP will appear for VSP framing and trellis 
initialization for SFN operation in ATSC normal mode. This 
also signals an exciter to set the enhanced mode bits in a Data 
Field Sync to signal normal ATSC mode to receivers. Accord 
ingly, block 1616 makes a determination if the Modebit is 1. 
If so, then the process loops back to block 1614 indicating that 
the mode is still in ATSC M/H mode. If, however, block 1616 
makes a determination that the Mode bit is 0, then the 
process proceeds to block 1618, where a signal is communi 
cated to the exciter(s) that the mode is transitioning to the 
normal ATSC mode. As shown in block 1620, the exciter is 
now prepared to transition to normal ATSC mode and use 
VSP signalling which appear in TS. 
The example embodiments of the invention described 

above, including their procedures, part(s) or function(s) 
thereof, may be implemented using hardware, software or a 
combination thereof and may be implemented in one or more 
computer systems or other processing systems. However, the 
manipulations performed by these example embodiments 
were often referred to in terms, such as entering, which are 
commonly associated with mental operations performed by a 
human operator. No Such capability of a human operator is 
necessary in any of the operations described herein. Rather, 
the operations may be completely implemented with machine 
operations. Useful machines for performing the operation of 
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the example embodiments presented herein include general 
purpose digital computers or similar devices. 

From a hardware standpoint, components in an M/HDTV 
transmission system typically includes one or more compo 
nents, such as one or more microprocessors, for performing 
the arithmetic and/or logical operations required for program 
execution, and storage media, Such as one or more disk drives 
or memory cards (e.g., flash memory) for program and data 
storage, and a random access memory, for temporary data and 
program instruction storage. From a software standpoint, a 
processor typically includes Software resident on a storage 
media (e.g., a disk drive or memory card), which, when 
executed, directs the processor in performing transmission 
and reception functions. The processor Software may run on 
an operating system stored on the storage media, such as, for 
example, UNIX or Windows (e.g., NT, XP, Vista), Linux, and 
the like, and can adhere to various protocols such as the 
Ethernet, ATM, TCP/IP protocols and/or other connection or 
connectionless protocols. AS is well known in the art, proces 
sors can run different operating systems, and can contain 
different types of software, each type devoted to a different 
function, Such as handling and managing data/information 
from a particular source, or transforming data/information 
from one format into another format. It should thus be clear 
that the embodiments described herein are not to be construed 
as being limited for use with any particular type of server 
computer, and that any other suitable type of device for facili 
tating the exchange and storage of information may be 
employed instead. 

Software embodiments of the example embodiments pre 
sented herein may be provided as a computer program prod 
uct, or software, that may include an article of manufacture on 
a machine accessible or machine readable medium having 
instructions. The instructions on the machine accessible or 
machine readable medium may be used to program a com 
puter system or other electronic device (e.g., computer-read 
able medium). The machine-readable medium may include, 
but is not limited to, floppy diskettes, optical disks, CD 
ROMs, and magneto-optical disks or other type of media/ 
machine-readable medium Suitable for storing or transmitting 
electronic instructions. The techniques described herein are 
not limited to any particular software configuration. They 
may find applicability in any computing or processing envi 
ronment. The terms “machine accessible medium”, “machine 
readable medium' or “computer-readable medium' used 
herein shall include any medium that is capable of storing, 
encoding, or transmitting a sequence of instructions for 
execution by the machine and that cause the machine to 
perform any one of the methods described herein. Further 
more, it is common in the art to speak of software, in one form 
or another (e.g., program, procedure, process, application, 
module, unit, logic, and so on) as taking an action or causing 
a result. Such expressions are merely a shorthand way of 
stating that the execution of the Software by a processing 
system causes the processor to perform an action to produce 
a result. 

While various example embodiments of the present inven 
tion have been described above, it should be understood that 
they have been presented by way of example, and not limita 
tion. It will be apparent to persons skilled in the relevant art(s) 
that various changes in form and detail can be made therein. 
Thus, the present invention should not be limited by any of the 
above described example embodiments, but should be 
defined only in accordance with the following claims and 
their equivalents. 

In addition, it should be understood that the FIGS. 1-16 are 
presented for example purposes only. The architecture of the 
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18 
example embodiments presented herein is sufficiently flex 
ible and configurable, such that it may be utilized (and navi 
gated) in ways other than that shown in the accompanying 
figures. 

Further, the purpose of the foregoing Abstract is to enable 
the U.S. Patent and Trademark Office and the public gener 
ally, and especially the Scientists, engineers and practitioners 
in the art who are not familiar with patent or legal terms or 
phraseology, to determine quickly from a cursory inspection 
the nature and essence of the technical disclosure of the 
application. The Abstract is not intended to be limiting as to 
the scope of the example embodiments presented herein in 
any way. It is also to be understood that the procedures recited 
in the claims need not be performed in the order presented. 

What is claimed is: 
1. A method for performing data frame synchronization, 

comprising the steps of 
replacing a predetermined number of bytes to be transmit 

ted onto a studio-transmitter link with a plurality of 
bytes containing signalling information; 

transmitting the predetermined number of bytes in a trans 
port stream over the studio-to transmitter link; 

assigning a packet identifier to a predetermined number of 
transport stream packets, the packet identifier being 
unknown to a post processor on the studio-transmitter 
link; 

calculating a first checksum on the plurality of bytes con 
taining the signalling information; and 

transmitting the first checksum onto the studio-transmitter 
link to the post-processor. 

2. The method according to claim 1, further comprising: 
resetting the plurality of bytes containing signalling infor 

mation with dummy bytes at a post-processor. 
3. The method according to claim 1, wherein the signalling 

information includes a Sub-frame number and a slot number. 
4. The method according to claim 1, further comprising: 
receiving the transport stream from the studio-transmitter 

link; 
parsing the transport stream to obtain the packet identifier 

of each transport stream packet; 
searching for a predetermined number of consecutive 

transport stream packets having the same packet identi 
fier; 

calculating a second checksum of a portion of the prede 
termined number of transport stream packets; 

comparing the first checksum and the second checksum: 
extracting the signalling information if the first checksum 

and the second checksum are the same; and 
using the signalling information obtained from said 

extracting to perform frame synchronization. 
5. A method for performing data frame synchronization, 

comprising the steps of 
replacing a predetermined number of bytes to be transmit 

ted onto a studio-transmitter link with a plurality of 
bytes containing signalling information; 

transmitting the predetermined number of bytes in a trans 
port stream over the studio-to transmitter link; 

assigning a packet identifier to a predetermined number of 
transport stream packets, the packet identifier being pre 
stored in a memory of a post processor on the studio 
transmitter link: 

calculating a first checksum on the plurality of bytes con 
taining the signalling information; and 

transmitting the first checksum onto the studio-transmitter 
link to the post-processor. 
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6. The method according to claim 5, further comprising: 
receiving the transport stream from the studio-transmitter 

link; 
parsing the transport stream to obtain the packet identifier 

of each transport stream packet; 
searching for the predetermined number of transport 

stream packets having the packet identifier prestored in 
the memory; 

calculating a second checksum of a portion of the prede 
termined number of transport stream packets; 

comparing the first checksum and the second checksum: 
extracting the signalling information if the first checksum 

and the second checksum are the same; and 
using the signalling information obtained from said 

extracting to perform frame synchronization. 
7. A system for performing data frame synchronization, 

comprising: 
a group formatter operable to replace a predetermined 
number of bytes to be transmitted onto a studio-trans 
mitter link with a plurality of bytes containing signalling 
information; 

a packet transmitter operable to transmit the predetermined 
number of bytes in a transport stream over the studio-to 
transmitter link: 

a multiplexer operable to assigning a packet identifier to a 
predetermined number of transport stream packets, the 
packet identifier being unknown to a post processor on 
the studio-transmitter link; 

a checksum calculator operable to calculate a first check 
Sum on the plurality of bytes containing the signalling 
information; and 

the packet transmitter further operable to transmit the first 
checksum onto the studio-transmitter link to the post 
processor. 

8. The system according to claim 7, wherein the plurality of 
bytes containing signalling information are reset with dummy 
bytes at a post-processor. 

9. The system according to claim 7, wherein the signalling 
information includes a Sub-frame number and a slot number. 

10. The system according to claim 7, further comprising: 
a packet receiver operable to receive the transport stream 

from the studio-transmitter link; 
a processor operable to: 

parse the transport stream to obtain the packet identifier 
of each transport stream packet, 

search for a predetermined number of consecutive trans 
port stream packets having the same packet identifier, 

calculate a second checksum of a portion of the prede 
termined number of transport stream packets, 

compare the first checksum and the second checksum, 
extract the signalling information if the first checksum 

and the second checksum are the same, and 
use the signalling information to perform frame Syn 

chronization. 
11. A system for performing data frame synchronization, 

comprising: 
a group formatter operable to replace a predetermined 
number of bytes to be transmitted onto a studio-trans 
mitter link with a plurality of bytes containing signalling 
information; 

a packet transmitter operable to transmit the predetermined 
number of bytes in a transport stream over the studio-to 
transmitter link: 

a multiplexer operable to assign a packet identifier to a 
predetermined number of transport stream packets, the 
packet identifier being prestored in a memory of a post 
processor on the studio-transmitter link: 
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a checksum calculator operable to calculate a first check 
Sum on the plurality of bytes containing the signalling 
information; and 

the packet transmitter further operable to transmitting the 
first checksum onto the studio-transmitter link to the 
post-processor. 

12. The system according to claim 11, further comprising: 
a packet receiver operable to receive the transport stream 

from the studio-transmitter link; 
a processor operable to: 

parse the transport stream to obtain the packet identifier 
of each transport stream packet, 

search for the predetermined number of transport stream 
packets having the packet identifier prestored in the 
memory, 

calculate a second checksum of a portion of the prede 
termined number of transport stream packets, 

compare the first checksum and the second checksum, 
extract the signalling information if the first checksum 

and the second checksum are the same, and 
use the signalling information to perform frame Syn 

chronization. 
13. A non-transitory computer-readable medium having 

stored thereon sequences of instructions, the sequences of 
instructions including instructions which when executed by a 
computer system causes the computer system to perform: 

replacing a predetermined number of bytes to be transmit 
ted onto a studio-transmitter link with a plurality of 
bytes containing signalling information; 

transmitting the predetermined number of bytes in a trans 
port stream over the studio-to transmitter link; 

assigning a packet identifier to a predetermined number of 
transport stream packets, the packet identifier being 
unknown to a post processor on the studio-transmitter 
link; 

calculating a first checksum on the plurality of bytes con 
taining the signalling information; and 

transmitting the first checksum onto the studio-transmitter 
link to the post-processor. 

14. The computer-readable medium according to claim 13, 
further having stored thereon a sequence of instructions 
which when executed by the computer system causes the 
computer system to perform: 

resetting the plurality of bytes containing signalling infor 
mation with dummy bytes at a post-processor. 

15. The computer-readable medium according to claim 13, 
wherein the signalling information includes a Sub-frame 
number and a slot number. 

16. The computer-readable medium according to claim 13, 
further having stored thereon a sequence of instructions 
which when executed by the computer system causes the 
computer system to perform: 

receiving the transport stream from the studio-transmitter 
link; 

parsing the transport stream to obtain the packet identifier 
of each transport stream packet; 

searching for a predetermined number of consecutive 
transport stream packets having the same packet identi 
fier; 

calculating a second checksum of a portion of the prede 
termined number of transport stream packets; 

comparing the first checksum and the second checksum: 
extracting the signalling information if the first checksum 

and the second checksum are the same; and 
using the signalling information obtained from said 

extracting to perform frame synchronization. 
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17. The non-transitory computer-readable medium having 
stored thereon a sequence of instructions which when 
executed by the computer system causes the computer system 
to perform: 

replacing a predetermined number of bytes to be transmit 
ted onto a studio-transmitter link with a plurality of 
bytes containing signalling information; 

transmitting the predetermined number of bytes in a trans 
port stream over the studio-to transmitter link: 10 

assigning a packet identifier to a predetermined number of 
transport stream packets, the packet identifier being pre 
stored in a memory of a post processor on the studio 
transmitter link: 

calculating a first checksum on the plurality of bytes con- 15 
taining the signalling information; and 

transmitting the first checksum onto the studio-transmitter 
link to the post-processor. 

22 
18. The computer-readable memory according to claim 17, 

further having stored thereon a sequence of instructions 
which when executed by the computer system causes the 
computer system to perform: 

receiving the transport stream from the studio-transmitter 
link; 

parsing the transport stream to obtain the packet identifier 
of each transport stream packet; 

searching for the predetermined number of transport 
stream packets having the packet identifier prestored in 
the memory; 

calculating a second checksum of a portion of the prede 
termined number of transport stream packets; 

comparing the first checksum and the second checksum: 
extracting the signalling information if the first checksum 

and the second checksum are the same; and 
using the signalling information obtained from said 

extracting to perform frame synchronization. 
k k k k k 


