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1. 

METHOD AND SYSTEM FOR OPTIMIZING 
COKE PLANT OPERATION AND OUTPUT 

CROSS-REFERENCE TO RELATED 
APPLICATIONS 

This application claims the benefit of priority to U.S. 
Provisional Patent Application No. 62/043,359, filed Aug. 
28, 2014, the disclosure of which is incorporated herein by 
reference in its entirety. 

TECHNICAL FIELD 

The present technology is generally directed to optimizing 
the operation and output of coke plants. 

BACKGROUND 

Coke is a solid carbon fuel and carbon source used to melt 
and reduce iron ore in the production of steel. In one process, 
known as the “Thompson Coking Process, coke is pro 
duced by batch feeding pulverized coal to an oven that is 
sealed and heated to very high temperatures for approxi 
mately forty-eight hours under closely-controlled atmo 
spheric conditions. Coking ovens have been used for many 
years to convert coal into metallurgical coke. During the 
coking process, finely crushed coal is heated under con 
trolled temperature conditions to devolatilize the coal and 
form a fused mass of coke having a predetermined porosity 
and strength. Because the production of coke is a batch 
process, multiple coke ovens are operated simultaneously. 
Much of the coke manufacturing process is automated due 

to the extreme temperatures involved. For example, a pusher 
charger machine (“PCM) is typically used on the coal side 
of the oven for a number of different operations. A common 
PCM operation sequence begins as the PCM is moved along 
a set of rails that run in front of an oven battery to an 
assigned oven and align a coal charging system of the PCM 
with the oven. The pusher side oven door is removed from 
the oven using a door extractor from the coal charging 
system. The PCM is then moved to align a pusher ram of the 
PCM to the center of the oven. The pusher ram is energized, 
to push coke from the oven interior. The PCM is again 
moved away from the oven center to align the coal charging 
system with the oven center. Coal is delivered to the coal 
charging system of the PCM by a tripper conveyor. The coal 
charging system then charges the coal into the oven interior. 
In some systems, particulate matter entrained in hot gas 
emissions that escape from the oven face are captured by the 
PCM during the step of charging the coal. In Such systems, 
the particulate matter is drawn into an emissions hood 
through the baghouse of a dust collector. The charging 
conveyor is then retracted from the oven. Finally, the door 
extractor of the PCM replaces and latches the pusher side 
oven door. 

With reference to FIG. 1, PCM coal charging systems 10 
have commonly included an elongated frame 12 that is 
mounted on the PCM (not depicted) and reciprocally mov 
able, toward and away from the coke ovens. A planar 
charging head 14 is positioned at a free distal end of the 
elongated frame 12. A conveyor 16 is positioned within the 
elongated frame 12 and Substantially extends along a length 
of the elongated frame 12. The charging head 14 is used, in 
a reciprocal motion, to generally level the coal that is 
deposited in the oven. However, with regard to FIGS. 2A, 
3A, and 4A, the prior art coal charging systems tend to leave 
voids 16 at the sides of the coal bed, as shown in FIG. 2A, 
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and hollow depressions in the surface of the coal bed. These 
voids limit the amount of coal that can be processed by the 
coke oven over a coking cycle time (coal processing rate), 
which generally reduces the amount of coke produced by the 
coke oven over the coking cycle (coke production rate). FIG. 
2B depicts the manner in which an ideally charged, level 
coke bed would look. 
The weight of coal charging system 10, which can include 

internal water cooling systems, can be 80,000 pounds or 
more. When charging system 10 is extended inside the oven 
during a charging operation, the coal charging system 10 
deflects downwardly at its free distal end. This shortens the 
coal charge capacity. FIG. 3A indicates the drop in bed 
height caused by the deflections of the coal charging system 
10. The plot depicted in FIG. 5 shows the coal bed profile 
along the oven length. The bed height drop, due to coal 
charging system deflection, is from five inches to eight 
inches between the pusher side to the coke side, depending 
upon the charge weight. As depicted, the effect of the 
deflection is more significant when less coal is charged into 
the oven. In general, coal charging system deflection can 
cause a coal volume loss of approximately one to two tons. 
FIG. 3B depicts the manner in which an ideally charged, 
level coke bed would look. 

Despite the ill effect of coal charging system deflection, 
caused by its weight and cantilevered position, the coal 
charging system 10 provides little benefit in the way of coal 
bed densification. With reference to FIG. 4A, the coal 
charging system 10 provides minimal improvement to inter 
nal coal bed density, forming a first layer d1 and a second, 
less dense layer d2 at the bottom of the coal bed. Increasing 
the density of the coal bed can facilitate conductive heat 
transfer throughout the coal bed which is a component in 
determining oven cycle time and oven production capacity. 
FIG. 6 depicts a set of density measurements taken for an 
oven test using a prior art coal charging system 10. The line 
with diamond indicators shows the density on the coal bed 
surface. The line with the square indicators and the line with 
the triangular indicators show density twelve inches and 
twenty-four inches below the surface respectively. The data 
demonstrates that bed density drops more on the coke side. 
FIG. 4B depicts the manner in which an ideally charged, 
level coke bed would look, having relatively increased 
density layers D1 and D2. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

Non-limiting and non-exhaustive embodiments of the 
present invention, including the preferred embodiment, are 
described with reference to the following figures, wherein 
like reference numerals refer to like parts throughout the 
various views unless otherwise specified. 

FIG. 1 depicts a front perspective view of a prior art coal 
charging System. 

FIG. 2A depicts a front view of a coal bed that was 
charged into a coke oven using a prior art coal charging 
system and depicts that the coal bed is not level, having 
voids at the sides of the bed. 

FIG. 2B depicts a front view of a coal bed that was ideally 
charged into a coke oven, without Voids at the sides of the 
bed. 

FIG. 3A depicts a side elevation view of a coal bed that 
was charged into a coke oven using a prior art coal charging 
system and depicts that the coal bed is not level, having 
voids at the end portions of the bed. 
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FIG. 3B depicts a side elevation view of a coal bed that 
was ideally charged into a coke oven, without Voids at the 
end portions of the bed. 

FIG. 4A depicts a side elevation view of a coal bed that 
was charged into a coke oven using a prior art coal charging 
system and depicts two different layers of minimal coal 
density formed by the prior art coal charging system. 

FIG. 4B depicts a side elevation view of a coal bed that 
was ideally charged into a coke oven having two different 
layers of relatively increased coal density. 

FIG. 5 depicts a plot of mock data of bed height over bed 
length and the bed height drop, due to coal charging system 
deflection. 

FIG. 6 depicts a plot of test data of surface and internal 
coal bulk density over bed length. 

FIG. 7 depicts a front, perspective view of one embodi 
ment of a charging frame and charging head of a coal 
charging system according to the present technology. 

FIG. 8 depicts a top, plan view of the charging frame and 
charging head depicted in FIG. 7. 

FIG. 9A depicts a top plan view of one embodiment of a 
charging head according to the present technology. 

FIG. 9B depicts a front elevation view of the charging 
head depicted in FIG. 9A. 
FIG.9C depicts a side elevation view of the charging head 

depicted in FIG. 9A. 
FIG. 10A depicts a top plan view of another embodiment 

of a charging head according to the present technology. 
FIG. 10B depicts a front elevation view of the charging 

head depicted in FIG. 10A. 
FIG. 10C depicts a side elevation view of the charging 

head depicted in FIG. 10A. 
FIG. 11A depicts a top plan view of yet another embodi 

ment of a charging head according to the present technology. 
FIG. 11B depicts a front elevation view of the charging 

head depicted in FIG. 11A. 
FIG. 11C depicts a side elevation view of the charging 

head depicted in FIG. 11A. 
FIG. 12A depicts a top plan view of still another embodi 

ment of a charging head according to the present technology. 
FIG. 12B depicts a front elevation view of the charging 

head depicted in FIG. 12A. 
FIG. 12C depicts a side elevation view of the charging 

head depicted in FIG. 12A. 
FIG. 13 depicts a side elevation view of one embodiment 

of a charging head, according to the present technology, 
wherein the charging head includes particulate deflection 
Surfaces on top of the upper edge portion of the charging 
head. 

FIG. 14 depicts a partial, top elevation view of one 
embodiment of the charging head of the present technology 
and further depicts one embodiment of a densification bar 
and one manner in which it can be coupled with a wing of 
the charging head. 

FIG. 15 depicts a side elevation view of the charging head 
and densification bar depicted in FIG. 14. 

FIG. 16 depicts a partial side elevation view of one 
embodiment of the charging head of the present technology 
and further depicts another embodiment of a densification 
bar and a manner in which it can be coupled with the 
charging head. 

FIG. 17 depicts a partial, top elevation view of one 
embodiment of a charging head and charging frame, accord 
ing to the present technology, and further depicts one 
embodiment of a slotted joint that couples the charging head 
and charging frame with one another. 
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FIG. 18 depicts a partial, cutaway side elevation view of 

the charging head and charging frame depicted in FIG. 17. 
FIG. 19 depicts a partial front elevation view of one 

embodiment of a charging head and charging frame, accord 
ing to the present technology, and further depicts one 
embodiment of a charging frame deflection face that may be 
associated with the charging frame. 

FIG. 20 depicts a partial, cutaway side elevation view of 
the charging head and charging frame depicted in FIG. 19. 

FIG. 21 depicts a front perspective view of one embodi 
ment of an extrusion plate, according to the present tech 
nology, and further depicts one manner in which it may be 
associated with a rearward face of a charging head. 

FIG. 22 depicts a partial isometric view of the extrusion 
plate and charging head depicted in FIG. 21. 

FIG. 23 depicts a side perspective view of one embodi 
ment of an extrusion plate, according to the present tech 
nology, and further depicts one manner in which it may be 
associated with a rearward face of a charging head and 
extrude coal that is being conveyed into a coal charging 
system. 

FIG. 24A depicts a top plan view of another embodiment 
of extrusion plates, according to the present technology, and 
further depicts one manner in which they may be associated 
with wing members of a charging head. 

FIG. 24B depicts a side elevation view of the extrusion 
plates of FIG. 24A. 

FIG. 25A depicts a top plan view of still another embodi 
ment of extrusion plates, according to the present technol 
ogy, and further depicts one manner in which they may be 
associated with multiple sets of wing members that are 
disposed both forwardly and rearwardly of a charging head. 

FIG. 25B depicts a side elevation view of the extrusion 
plates of FIG. 25A. 

FIG. 26 depicts a front elevation view of one embodiment 
of a charging head, according to the present technology, and 
further depicts the differences in coal bed densities when an 
extrusion plate is used and not used in a coal bed charging 
operation. 

FIG. 27 depicts a plot of coal bed density over a length of 
a coal bed where the coal bed is charged without the use of 
an extrusion plate. 

FIG. 28 depicts a plot of coal bed density over a length of 
a coal bed where the coal bed is charged with the use of an 
extrusion plate. 

FIG. 29 depicts a top plan view of one embodiment of a 
charging head, according to the present technology, and 
further depicts another embodiment of an extrusion plate 
that may be associated with a rearward surface of the 
charging head. 

FIG. 30 depicts a top, plan view of a prior art false door 
assembly. 

FIG. 31 depicts a side elevation view of the false door 
assembly depicted in FIG. 30. 

FIG. 32 depicts a side elevation view of one embodiment 
of a false door, according to the present technology, and 
further depicts one manner in which the false door may be 
coupled with an existing, angled false door assembly. 

FIG. 33 depicts a side elevation view of one manner in 
which a coal bed may be charged into a coke oven according 
to the present technology. 

FIG. 34A depicts a front perspective view of one embodi 
ment of a false door assembly according to the present 
technology. 

FIG. 34B depicts a rear elevation view of one embodi 
ment of a false door that may be used with the false door 
assembly depicted in FIG. 34A. 
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FIG. 34C depicts a side elevation view of the false door 
assembly depicted in FIG. 34A and further depicts one 
manner in which a height of the false door may be selec 
tively increased or decreased. 

FIG. 35A depicts a front perspective view of another 
embodiment of a false door assembly according to the 
present technology. 

FIG. 35B depicts a rear elevation view of one embodi 
ment of a false door that may be used with the false door 
assembly depicted in FIG. 35A. 

FIG. 35C depicts a side elevation view of the false door 
assembly depicted in FIG. 35A and further depicts one 
manner in which a height of the false door may be selec 
tively increased or decreased. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION 

The present technology is generally directed to coal 
charging systems used with coke ovens. In various embodi 
ments, the coal charging systems, of the present technology, 
are configured for use with horizontal heat recovery coke 
ovens. However, embodiments of the present technology 
can be used with other coke ovens, such as horizontal, 
non-recovery ovens. In some embodiments, a coal charging 
system includes a charging head having opposing wings that 
extend outwardly and forwardly from the charging head, 
leaving an open pathway through which coal may be 
directed toward the side edges of the coal bed. In other 
embodiments, an extrusion plate is positioned on a rearward 
face of the charging head and oriented to engage and 
compress coal as the coal is charged along a length of the 
coking oven. In still other embodiments, a false door is 
vertically oriented to maximize an amount of coal being 
charged into the oven. In some embodiments, a lower 
extension plate associate with the false door is selectively, 
automatically extended beyond a lower end portion of the 
false door in order to extend an effective length of the false 
door. In other embodiments, an extension plate may be 
coupled with an existing false door having an angled front 
Surface. The extension plate provides the existing false door 
with a vertically oriented face. 

Specific details of several embodiments of the technology 
are described below with reference to FIGS. 7-29 and 
32-35C. Other details describing well-known structures and 
systems often associated with pusher systems, charging 
systems, and coke ovens have not been set forth in the 
following disclosure to avoid unnecessarily obscuring the 
description of the various embodiments of the technology. 
Many of the details, dimensions, angles, and other features 
shown in the Figures are merely illustrative of particular 
embodiments of the technology. Accordingly, other embodi 
ments can have other details, dimensions, angles, and fea 
tures without departing from the spirit or scope of the 
present technology. A person of ordinary skill in the art, 
therefore, will accordingly understand that the technology 
may have other embodiments with additional elements, or 
the technology may have other embodiments without several 
of the features shown and described below with reference to 
FIGS. 7-29 and 32-35C. 

It is contemplated that the coal charging technology of the 
present matter will be used in combination with a pusher 
charger machine (“PCM) having one or more other com 
ponents common to PCMs, such as a door extractor, a pusher 
ram, a tripper conveyor, and the like. However, aspects of 
the present technology may be used separately from a PCM 
and may be used individually or with other equipment 
associated with a coking system. Accordingly, aspects of the 
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present technology may simply be described as “a coal 
charging system” or components thereof. Components asso 
ciated with coal charging systems, such as coal conveyers 
and the like that are well-known may not be described in 
detail, if at all, to avoid unnecessarily obscuring the descrip 
tion of the various embodiments of the technology. 

With reference to FIGS. 7-9C, a coal charging system 100 
is depicted, having an elongated charging frame 102 and a 
charging head 104. In various embodiments, the charging 
frame 102 will be configured to have opposite sides 106 and 
108 that extend between a distal end portion 110 and 
proximal end portion 112. In various applications, the proxi 
mal end portion 112 may be coupled with a PCM in a 
manner that permits selective extension and retraction of the 
charging frame 102 into, and from within, a coke oven 
interior during a coal charging operation. Other systems, 
Such as a height adjustment system that selectively adjusts 
the height of the charging frame 102 with respect to a coke 
oven floor and/or a coal bed, may also be associated with the 
coal charging system 100. 
The charging head 104 is coupled with the distal end 

portion 110 of the elongated charging frame 102. In various 
embodiments, the charging head 104 is defined by a planar 
body 114, having an upper edge portion 116, lower edge 
portion 118, opposite side portions 120 and 122, a front face 
124, and a rearward face 126. In some embodiments, a 
substantial portion of the body 114 resides within a charging 
head plane. This is not to suggest that embodiments of the 
present technology will not provide charging head bodies 
having aspects that occupy one or more additional planes. In 
various embodiments, the planar body is formed from a 
plurality of tubes, having square or rectangular cross-sec 
tional shapes. In particular embodiments, the tubes are 
provided with a width of six inches to twelve inches. In at 
least one embodiment, the tubes have a width of eight 
inches, which demonstrated a significant resistance to warp 
ing during charging operations. 

With further reference to FIGS. 9A-9C, various embodi 
ments of the charging head 104 include a pair of opposing 
wings 128 and 130 that are shaped to have free end portions 
132 and 134. In some embodiments, the free end portions 
132 and 134 are positioned in a spaced-apart relationship, 
forwardly from the charging head plane. In particular 
embodiments, the free end portions 132 and 134 are spaced 
forwardly from the charging head plane a distance of six 
inches to 24 inches, depending on the size of the charging 
head 104 and the geometry of the opposing wings 128 and 
130. In this position, the opposing wings 128 and 130 define 
open spaces rearwardly from the opposing wings 128 and 
130, through the charging head plane. As the design of these 
open spaces is increased in size, more material is distributed 
to the sides of the coal bed. As the spaces are made Smaller, 
less material is distributed to the sides of the coal bed. 
Accordingly, the present technology is adaptable as particu 
lar characteristics are presented from coking system to 
coking System. 

In some embodiments, such as depicted in FIGS. 9A-9C. 
the opposing wings 128 and 130 include first faces 136 and 
138 that extend outwardly from the charging head plane. In 
particular embodiments, the first faces 136 and 138 extend 
outwardly from the charging plane at a forty-five degree 
angle. The angle at which the first face deviates from the 
charging head plane may be increased or decreased accord 
ing to the particular intended use of the coal charging system 
100. For example, particular embodiments may employ an 
angle of ten degrees to sixty degrees, depending on the 
conditions anticipated during charging and leveling opera 
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tions. In some embodiments, the opposing wings 128 and 
130 further include second faces 140 and 142 that extend 
outwardly from the first faces 136 and 138 toward the free 
distal end portions 132 and 134. In particular embodiments, 
the second faces 140 and 142 of the opposing wings 128 and 
130 reside within a wing plane that is parallel to the charging 
head plane. In some embodiments, the second faces 140 and 
142 are provided to be approximately ten inches in length. 
In other embodiments, however, the second faces 140 and 
142 may have lengths ranging from Zero to ten inches, 
depending on one or more design considerations, including 
the length selected for the first faces 136 and 138 and the 
angles at which the first faces 136 and 138 extend away from 
the charging plane. As depicted in FIGS. 9A-9C, the oppos 
ing wings 128 and 130 are shaped to receive loose coal from 
the rearward face of the charging head 104, while the coal 
charging system 100 is being withdrawn across the coal bed 
being charged, and funnel or otherwise direct loose coal 
toward the side edges of the coal bed. In at least this manner, 
the coal charging system 100 may reduce the likelihood of 
voids at the sides of the coal bed, as shown in FIG. 2A. 
Rather, the wings 128 and 130 help to promote the level coal 
bed depicted in FIG. 2B. Testing has shown that use of the 
opposing wings 128 and 130 can increase the charge weight 
by one to two tons by filling these side voids. Moreover, the 
shape of the wings 128 and 130 reduce drag back of the coal 
and spillage from the pusher side of the oven, which reduces 
waste and the expenditure of labor to retrieve the spilled 
coal. 

With reference to FIGS. 10A-10C, another embodiment 
of a charging head 204 is depicted as having a planar body 
214, having an upper edge portion 216, lower edge portion 
218, opposite side portions 220 and 222, a front face 224, 
and a rearward face 226. The charging head 204 further 
includes a pair of opposing wings 228 and 230 that are 
shaped to have free end portions 232 and 234 that are 
positioned in a spaced-apart relationship, forwardly from the 
charging head plane. In particular embodiments, the free end 
portions 232 and 234 are spaced forwardly from the charg 
ing head plane a distance of six inches to 24 inches. The 
opposing wings 228 and 230 define open spaces rearwardly 
from the opposing wings 228 and 230, through the charging 
head plane. In some embodiments, the opposing wings 228 
and 230 include first faces 236 and 238 that extend out 
wardly from the charging head plane at a forty-five degree 
angle. In particular embodiments, the angle at which the first 
faces 236 and 238 deviate from the charging head plane 
from ten degrees to sixty degrees, depending on the condi 
tions anticipated during charging and leveling operations. 
The opposing wings 228 and 230 are shaped to receive loose 
coal from the rearward face of the charging head 204, while 
the coal charging system is being withdrawn across the coal 
bed being charged, and funnel or otherwise direct loose coal 
toward the side edges of the coal bed. 

With reference to FIGS. 11A-11C, a further embodiment 
of a charging head 304 is depicted as having a planar body 
314, having an upper edge portion 316, lower edge portion 
318, opposite side portions 320 and 322, a front face 324, 
and a rearward face 326. The charging head 300 further 
includes a pair of curved opposing wings 328 and 330 that 
have free end portions 332 and 334 that are positioned in a 
spaced-apart relationship, forwardly from the charging head 
plane. In particular embodiments, the free end portions 332 
and 334 are spaced forwardly from the charging head plane 
a distance of six inches to twenty-four inches. The curved 
opposing wings 328 and 330 define open spaces rearwardly 
from the curved opposing wings 328 and 330, through the 
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charging head plane. In some embodiments, the curved 
opposing wings 328 and 330 include first faces 336 and 338 
that extend outwardly from the charging head plane at a 
forty-five degree angle from a proximal end portion of the 
curved opposing wings 328 and 330. In particular embodi 
ments, the angle at which the first faces 336 and 338 deviate 
from the charging head plane from ten degrees to sixty 
degrees. This angle dynamically changes along lengths of 
the curved opposing wings 328 and 330. The opposing 
wings 328 and 330 receive loose coal from the rearward face 
of the charging head 304, while the coal charging system is 
being withdrawn across the coal bed being charged, and 
funnel or otherwise direct loose coal toward the side edges 
of the coal bed. 

With reference to FIGS. 12A-12C, an embodiment of a 
charging head 404 includes a planar body 414, having an 
upper edge portion 416, lower edge portion 418, opposite 
side portions 420 and 422, a front face 424, and a rearward 
face 426. The charging head 400 further includes a first pair 
of opposing wings 428 and 430 that have free end portions 
432 and 434 that are positioned in a spaced-apart relation 
ship, forwardly from the charging head plane. The opposing 
wings 428 and 430 include first faces 436 and 438 that 
extend outwardly from the charging head plane. In some 
embodiments, the first faces 436 and 438 extend outwardly 
from the charging head plane at a forty-five degree angle. 
The angle at which the first face deviates from the charging 
head plane may be increased or decreased according to the 
particular intended use of the coal charging system 400. For 
example, particular embodiments may employ an angle of 
ten degrees to sixty degrees, depending on the conditions 
anticipated during charging and leveling operations. In some 
embodiments, the free end portions 432 and 434 are spaced 
forwardly from the charging head plane a distance of six 
inches to twenty-four inches. The opposing wings 428 and 
430 define open spaces rearwardly from the curved opposing 
wings 428 and 430, through the charging head plane. In 
some embodiments, the opposing wings 428 and 430 further 
include second faces 440 and 442 that extend outwardly 
from the first faces 436 and 438 toward the free distal end 
portions 432 and 434. In particular embodiments, the second 
faces 440 and 442 of the opposing wings 428 and 430 reside 
within a wing plane that is parallel to the charging head 
plane. In some embodiments, the second faces 440 and 442 
are provided to be approximately ten inches in length. In 
other embodiments, however, the second faces 440 and 442 
may have lengths ranging from Zero to ten inches, depending 
on one or more design considerations, including the length 
selected for the first faces 436 and 438 and the angles at 
which the first faces 436 and 438 extend away from the 
charging plane. The opposing wings 428 and 430 are shaped 
to receive loose coal from the rearward face of the charging 
head 404, while the coal charging system 400 is being 
withdrawn across the coal bed being charged, and funnel or 
otherwise direct loose coal toward the side edges of the coal 
bed. 

In various embodiments, it is contemplated that opposing 
wings of various geometries may extend rearwardly from a 
charging head associated with a coal charging system 
according to the present technology. With continued refer 
ence to FIGS. 12A-12C, the charging head 400 further 
includes a second pair of opposing wings 444 and 446 that 
each include free end portions 448 and 450 that are posi 
tioned in a spaced-apart relationship, rearwardly from the 
charging head plane. The opposing wings 444 and 446 
include first faces 452 and 454 that extend outwardly from 
the charging head plane. In some embodiments, the first 
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faces 452 and 454 extend outwardly from the charging head 
plane at a forty-five degree angle. The angle at which the 
first faces 452 and 454 deviate from the charging head plane 
may be increased or decreased according to the particular 
intended use of the coal charging system 400. For example, 
particular embodiments may employ an angle often degrees 
to sixty degrees, depending on the conditions anticipated 
during charging and leveling operations. In some embodi 
ments, the free end portions 448 and 450 are spaced rear 
wardly from the charging head plane a distance of six inches 
to twenty-four inches. The opposing wings 444 and 446 
define open spaces rearwardly from the opposing wings 444 
and 446, through the charging head plane. In some embodi 
ments, the opposing wings 444 and 446 further include 
second faces 456 and 458 that extend outwardly from the 
first faces 452 and 454 toward the free distal end portions 
448 and 450. In particular embodiments, the second faces 
456 and 458 of the opposing wings 444 and 446 reside 
within a wing plane that is parallel to the charging head 
plane. In some embodiments, the second faces 456 and 458 
are provided to be approximately ten inches in length. In 
other embodiments, however, the second faces 456 and 458 
may have lengths ranging from Zero to ten inches, depending 
on one or more design considerations, including the length 
selected for the first faces 452 and 454 and the angles at 
which the first faces 452 and 454 extend away from the 
charging plane. The opposing wings 444 and 446 are shaped 
to receive loose coal from the front face 424 of the charging 
head 404, while the coal charging system 400 is being 
extended along the coal bed being charged, and funnel or 
otherwise direct loose coal toward the side edges of the coal 
bed. 

With continued reference to FIGS. 12A-12C, the rear 
wardly faced opposing wings 444 and 446 are depicted as 
being positioned above the forwardly faced opposing wings 
428 and 430. However, it is contemplated that this particular 
arrangement may be reversed, in Some embodiments, with 
out departing from the scope of the present technology. 
Similarly, the rearwardly faced opposing wings 444 and 446 
and forwardly faced opposing wings 428 and 430 are each 
depicted as angularly disposed wings having first and second 
sets of faces that are disposed at angles with respect to one 
another. However, it is contemplated that either or both sets 
of opposing wings may be provided in different geometries, 
Such as demonstrated by the straight, angularly disposed 
opposing wings 228 and 230, or the curved wings 328 and 
330. Other combinations of known shapes, intermixed or in 
pairs, are contemplated. Moreover, it is further contemplated 
that the charging heads of the present technology could be 
provided with one or more sets of opposing wings that only 
face rearwardly from the charging head, with no wings that 
face forwardly. In Such instances, the rearwardly positioned 
opposing wings will distribute the coal to the side portions 
of the coal bed when the coal charging system is moving 
forward (charging). 

With reference to FIG. 13, it is contemplated that, as the 
coal is being charged into the oven and as the coal charging 
system 100 (or in a similar manner charging heads 526,300. 
or 400) is being withdrawn across the coal bed, loose coal 
may begin to pile onto the upper edge portion 116 of the 
charging head 104. Accordingly, some embodiments of the 
present technology will include one or more angularly 
disposed particulate deflection surfaces 144 on top of the 
upper edge portion 116 of the charging head 104. In the 
depicted example, a pair of oppositely faced particulate 
deflection surfaces 144 combine to form a peaked structure, 
which disperses errant particulate material in front of and 
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behind the charging head 104. It is contemplated that it may 
be desirable in particular instances to have the particulate 
material land primarily in front of or behind the charging 
head 104, but not both. Accordingly, in Such instances, a 
single particulate deflection surface 144 may be provided 
with an orientation chosen to disperse the coal accordingly. 
It is further contemplated that the particulate deflection 
Surfaces 144 may be provided in other, non-planar or non 
angular configurations. In particular, the particulate deflec 
tion Surfaces 144 may be flat, curvilinear, convex, concave, 
compound, or various combinations thereof. Some embodi 
ments will merely dispose the particulate deflection surfaces 
144 so that they are not horizontally disposed. In some 
embodiments, the particulate Surfaces can be integrally 
formed with the upper edge portion 116 of the charging head 
104, which may further include a water cooling feature. 
Coal bed bulk density plays a significant role in deter 

mining coke quality and minimizing burn loss, particularly 
near the oven walls. During a coal charging operation, the 
charging head 104 retracts against a top portion of the coal 
bed. In this manner, the charging head contributes to the top 
shape of the coal bed. However, particular aspects of the 
present technology cause portions of the charging head to 
increase the density of the coal bed. With regard to FIGS. 13 
and 14, the opposing wings 128 and 130 may be provided 
with one or more elongated densification bars 146 that, in 
Some embodiments, extend along a length of, and down 
wardly from, each of the opposing wings 128 and 130. In 
some embodiments, such as depicted in FIGS. 13 and 14, the 
densification bars 146 may extend downwardly from bottom 
surfaces of the opposing wings 128 and 130. In other 
embodiments, the densification bars 146 may be operatively 
coupled with forward or rearward faces of either or both of 
the opposing wings 128 and 130 and/or the lower edge 
portion 118 of the charging head 104. In particular embodi 
ments, such as depicted in FIG. 13, the elongated densifi 
cation bar 146 has a long axis disposed at an angle with 
respect to the charging head plane. It is contemplated that the 
densification bar 146 may be formed from a roller that 
rotates about a generally horizontal axis, or a static structure 
of various shapes, such as a pipe or rod, formed from a high 
temperature material. The exterior shape of the elongated 
densification bar 146 may be planar or curvilinear. More 
over, the elongated densification bar may be curved along its 
length or angularly disposed. 

In some embodiments, the charging heads and charging 
frames of various systems may not include a cooling system. 
The extreme temperatures of the ovens will cause portions 
of Such charging heads and charging frames to expand 
slightly, and at different rates, with respect to one another. In 
Such embodiments, the rapid, uneven heating and expansion 
of the components may stress the coal charging system and 
warp or otherwise misalign the charging head with respect 
to the charging frame. With reference to FIGS. 17 and 18. 
embodiments of the present technology couple the charging 
head 104 to the sides 106 and 108 of the charging frame 102 
using a plurality of slotted joints that allow relative move 
ment between the charging head 104 and the elongated 
charging frame 102. In at least one embodiment, first frame 
plates 150 extend outwardly from inner faces of the sides 
106 and 108 of the elongated frame 102. The first frame 
plates 150 include one or more elongated mounting slots 152 
that penetrate the first frame plates 150. In some embodi 
ments, second frame plates 154 are also provided to extend 
outwardly from the inner faces of the sides 106 and 108, 
beneath the first frame plates 150. The second frame plates 
154 of the elongated frame 102 also include one or more 
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elongated mounting slots 152 that penetrate the second 
frame plates 154. First head plates 156 extend outwardly 
from opposite sides of the rearward face 126 of the charging 
head 104. The first head plates 156 include one or more 
mounting apertures 158 that penetrate the first head plates 
156. In some embodiments, second head plates 160 are also 
provided to extend outwardly from the rearward face 126 of 
the charging head 104, beneath the first head plates 156. The 
second head plates 160 also include one or more mounting 
apertures 158 that penetrate the second head plates 158. The 
charging head 104 is aligned with the charging frame 102 so 
that the first frame plates 150 align with first head pates 156 
and the second frame plates 154 align with the second head 
plates 160. Mechanical fasteners 161 pass through the 
elongated mounting slots 152 of the first frame plates 150 
and second frame plates 152 and corresponding mounting 
apertures 160. In this manner, the mechanical fasteners 161 
are placed in a fixed position with respect to the mounting 
apertures 160 but are allowed to move along lengths of the 
elongated mounting slots 152 as the charging head 104 move 
with respect to the charging frame 102. Depending on the 
size and configuration of the charging head 104 and the 
elongated charging frame 102, it is contemplated that more 
or fewer charging head plates and frame plates of various 
shapes and sizes could be employed to operatively couple 
the charging head 104 and the elongated charging frame 102 
with one another. 

With reference to FIGS. 19 and 20, particular embodi 
ments of the present technology provide the lower inner 
faces of each of the opposite sides 106 and 108 of the 
elongated charging frame 102 with charging frame deflec 
tion faces 162, positioned to face at a slightly downward 
angle toward a middle portion of the charging frame 102. In 
this manner, the charging frame deflection faces 162 engage 
the loosely charged coal and direct the coal down and toward 
the sides of the coal bed being charged. The angle of the 
deflection faces 162 further compress the coal downwardly 
in a manner that helps to increase the density of the edge 
portions of the coal bed. In another embodiment, forward 
end portions of each of the opposite sides 106 and 108 of the 
elongated charging frame 102 include charging frame 
deflection faces 163 that are also positioned rearwardly from 
the wings but are oriented to face forwardly and down 
wardly from the charging frame. In this manner, the deflec 
tion faces 163 may further help to increase the density of the 
coal bed and direct the coal outwardly toward the edge 
portions of the coal bed in an effort to more fully level the 
coal bed. 
Many prior coal charging systems provide a minor 

amount of compaction on the coal bed surface due to the 
weight of the charging head and charging frame. However, 
the compaction is typically limited to twelve inches below 
the surface of the coal bed. Data during coal bed testing 
demonstrated that the bulk density measurement in this 
region to be a three to ten unit point difference inside the coal 
bed. FIG. 6 graphically depicts density measurements taken 
during mock oven testing. The top line shows the density of 
the coal bed surface. The lower two lines depict the density 
at twelve inches and twenty-four inches below the coal bed 
Surface, respectively. From the testing data, one can con 
clude that bed density drops more significantly on the coke 
side of the oven. 

With reference to FIGS. 21-28, various embodiments of 
the present technology position an extrusion plate 166 
operatively coupled with the rearward face 126 of the 
charging head 104. In some embodiments, the extrusion 
plate 166 includes a coal engagement face 168 that is 
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12 
oriented to face rearwardly and downwardly with respect to 
the charging head 104. In this manner, loose coal being 
charged into the oven behind the charging head 104 will 
engage the coal engagement face 168 of the extrusion plate 
166. Due to the pressure of the coal being deposited behind 
the charging head 104, the coal engagement face 168 
compacts the coal downwardly, increasing the coal density 
of the coal bed beneath the extrusion plate 166. In various 
embodiments, the extrusion plate 166 extends substantially 
along a length of the charging head 104 in order to maximize 
density across a significant width of the coal bed. With 
continued reference to FIGS. 20 and 21, the extrusion plate 
166 further includes an upper deflection face 170 that is 
oriented to face rearwardly and upwardly with respect to the 
charging head 104. In this manner, the coal engagement face 
168 and the upper deflection face 170 are coupled with one 
another to define a peak shape, having a peak ridge that faces 
rearwardly away from the charging head 104. Accordingly, 
any coal that falls atop the upper deflection face 170 will be 
directed off the extrusion plate 166 to join the incoming coal 
before it is extruded. 

In use, coal is shuffled to the front end portion of the coal 
charging system 100, behind the charging head 104. Coal 
piles up in the opening between the conveyor and the 
charging head 104 and conveyor chain pressure starts to 
build up gradually until reaching approximately 2500 to 
2800 psi. With reference to FIG. 23, the coal is fed into the 
system behind the charging head 104 and the charging head 
104 is retracted, rearwardly through the oven. The extrusion 
plate 166 compacts the coal and extrudes it into the coal bed. 

With reference to FIGS. 24A-25B, embodiments of the 
present technology may associate extrusion plates with one 
or more wings that extend from the charging head. FIGS. 
24A and 24B depict one such embodiment where extrusion 
plates 266 extend rearwardly from opposing wings 128 and 
130. In such embodiments, the extrusion plates 266 are 
provided with coal engagement faces 268 and upper deflec 
tion faces 270 that are coupled with one another to define a 
peak shape, having a peak ridge that faces rearwardly away 
from the opposing wings 128 and 130. The coal engagement 
faces 268 are positioned to compact the coal downwardly as 
the coal charging system is retracted through the oven, 
increasing the coal density of the coal bed beneath the 
extrusion plates 266. FIGS. 25A and 25B depict a charging 
head similar to that depicted in FIGS. 12A-12C except that 
extrusion plates 466, having coal engagement faces 468 and 
upper deflection faces 470, are positioned to extend rear 
wardly from the opposing wings 428 and 430. The extrusion 
plates 466 function similarly to the extrusion plates 266. 
Additional extrusion plates 466 may be positioned to extend 
forwardly from the opposing wings 444 and 446, which are 
positioned behind the charging head 400. Such extrusion 
plates compact the coal downwardly as the coal charging 
system is advanced through the oven, further increasing the 
coal density of the coal bed beneath the extrusion plates 466. 

FIG. 26 depicts the effect on the density of a coal charge 
with the benefit of the extrusion plate 166 (left side of the 
coal bed) and without the benefit of the extrusion plate 166 
(right side of the coal bed). As depicted, use of the extrusion 
plate 166 provides area "D' of increased coal bed bulk 
density and an area of lesser coal bed bulk density “d where 
the extrusion plate is not present. In this manner, the 
extrusion plate 166 not only demonstrates an improvement 
in the surface density, but also improves the overall internal 
bed bulk density. The test results, depicted in FIGS. 27 and 
28 below, show the improvement of bed density with the use 
of the extrusion plate 166 (FIG. 28) and without the use of 
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the extrusion plate 166 (FIG. 27). The data demonstrates a 
significant impact on both Surface density and twenty-four 
inches below the Surface of the coal bed. In some testing, an 
extrusion plate 166 having a ten inch peak (distance from 
back of the charging head 104 to the peak ridge of the 
extrusion plate 166, where the coal engagement face 168 and 
the upper deflection face 170 meet). In other tests, where a 
six inch peak was used, coal density was increased but not 
to the levels resulting from the use of the ten inch peak 
extrusion plate 166. The data reveals that the use of the ten 
inch peak extrusion plate increased the density of the coal 
bed, which allowed for an increase in charge weight of 
approximately two and a half tons. In some embodiments of 
the present technology, it is contemplated that Smaller extru 
sion plates, of five to ten inches in peak height, for example, 
or larger extrusion plates, often to twenty inches in peak 
height, for example, could be used. 

With reference to FIG. 29, other embodiments of the 
present technology provide an extrusion plate 166 that is 
shaped to include opposing side deflection faces 172 that are 
oriented to face rearwardly and laterally with respect to the 
charging head 104. By shaping the extrusion plate 166 to 
include the opposing side deflection faces 172, testing 
showed that more extruded coal flowed toward both sides of 
the bed while it was extruded. In this manner, extrusion plate 
166 helps to promote the level coal bed, depicted in FIG. 2B, 
as well as an increase in coal bed density across the width 
of the coal bed. 
When charging systems extend inside the ovens during 

charging operations, the coal charging systems, typically 
weighing approximately 80,000 pounds, deflect down 
wardly at their free, distal ends. This deflection shortens the 
coal charge capacity. FIG. 5 shows that the bed height drop, 
due to coal charging system deflection, is from five inches to 
eight inches between the pusher side to the coke side, 
depending upon the charge weight. In general, coal charging 
system deflection can cause a coal Volume loss of approxi 
mately 1 to 2 tons. During a charging operation, coal piles 
up in the opening between the conveyor and the charging 
head 104 and conveyor chain pressure starts to build up. 
Traditional coal charging systems operate at a chain pressure 
of approximately 2300 psi. However, the coal charging 
system of the present technology can be operated at a chain 
pressure of approximately 2500 to 2800 psi. This increase in 
chain pressure increases the rigidity of the coal charging 
system 100 along a length of its charging frame 102. Testing 
indicates that operating the coal charging system 100 at a 
chain pressure of approximately 2700 psi reduces deflection 
of the coal charging system deflection by approximately two 
inches, which equates to a higher charge weight and 
increased production. Testing has further shown that oper 
ating the coal charging system 100 at a higher chain pressure 
of approximately 3000 to 3300 psi can produce a more 
effective charge and further realize greater benefit from the 
use of one or more extrusion plates 166, as described above. 

With reference to FIGS. 30 and 31, various embodiments 
of the coal charging system 100 include a false door assem 
bly 500, having an elongated false door frame 502 and a 
false door 504, which is coupled to a distal end portion 506 
of the false door frame 502. The false door frame 502 further 
includes a proximal end portion 508, and opposite sides 510 
and 512 that extend between the proximal end portion 508 
and the distal end portion 506. In various applications, the 
proximal end portion 508 may be coupled with a PCM in a 
manner that permits selective extension and retraction of the 
false door frame 502 into and from within a coke oven 
interior during a coal charging operation. In some embodi 
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ments, the false door frame 502 is coupled with the PCM 
adjacent to and, in many instances, beneath the charging 
frame 102. The false door 504 is generally planar, having an 
upper end portion 514, a lower end portion 516, opposite 
side portions 518 and 520, a front face 522, and a rearward 
face 524. In operation, the false door 504 is placed just 
inside the coke oven during a coal charging operation. In this 
manner, the false door 504 substantially prevents loose coal 
from unintentionally exiting the pusher side of the coke oven 
until the coal is fully charged and the coke oven can be 
closed. Traditional false door designs are angled so that the 
lower end portion 516 of the false door 504 is positioned 
rearwardly of a top end portion 514 of the false door 504. 
This creates an end portion of a coal bed having a sloped or 
angled shape that typically terminates twelve inches to 
thirty-six inches into the coke oven from its pusher side 
opening. 
The false door 504 includes an extension plate 526, 

having an upper end portion 528, a lower end portion 530, 
opposite side portions 530 and 534, a front face 536, and a 
rearward face 538. The upper end portion 528 of extension 
plate 526 is removably coupled to the lower end portion 516 
of the false door 504 so that the lower end portion 530 of the 
extension plate 526 extends lower than the lower end portion 
516 of the false door 504. In this manner, a height of the 
front face 522 of the false door 504 may be selectively 
increased to accommodate the charging of a coal bed having 
a greater height. The extension plate 526 is typically coupled 
with the false door 504 using a plurality of mechanical 
fasteners 540 that form a quick connect/disconnect system. 
A plurality of separate extension plates 526, each having 
different heights, may be associated with a false door 
assembly 500. For example, a longer extension plate 526 
may be used for coal charges of forty-eight tons; whereas, a 
shorter extension plate 526 may be used for a coal charge of 
thirty-six tons, and no extension plate 526 might be used for 
a coal charge of twenty-eight tons. However, removing and 
replacing the extension plates 526 is labor intensive and time 
consuming, due to the weight of the extension plate and the 
fact that it is manually removed and replaced. This proce 
dure can interrupt coke production at a facility by an hour or 
O. 

With reference to FIG. 32, an existing false door 504 that 
resides within a body plane, which is disposed at an angle 
away from vertical, may be adapted to have a vertical false 
door. In some Such embodiments, a false door extension 542, 
having an upper end portion 544, a lower end portion 546, 
a front face 548, and a rearward face 550, may be opera 
tively coupled with the false door 504. In particular embodi 
ments, the false door extension 542 is shaped and oriented 
to define a replacement front face of the false door 504. It is 
contemplated that the false door extension 542 can be 
coupled with the false door 504 using mechanical fasteners, 
welding, or the like. In particular embodiments, the front 
face 548 is positioned to reside within a false door plane that 
is substantially vertical. In some embodiments, the front face 
548 is shaped to closely mirror a contour of a refractory 
surface 552 of a pusher side oven door 554. 

In operation, the vertical orientation of the front face 548 
allows the false door extension 542 to be placed just inside 
the coke oven during a coal charging operation. In this 
manner, as depicted in FIG. 33, an end portion of the coal 
bed 556 is positioned closely adjacent the refractory surface 
552 of the pusher side oven door 554. Accordingly, in some 
embodiments, the six to twelve inch gap left between the 
coal bed and the refractory surface 552 can be eliminated or, 
at the very least, minimized significantly. Moreover, the 
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vertically disposed front face 548 of the false door extension 
542 maximizes the use of the full oven capacity to charge 
more coal into the oven, as opposed to the sloped bed shape 
created by the prior art designs, which increases the pro 
duction rate for the oven. For example, if the front face 536 
of the false door extension 542 is positioned twelve inches 
back from where the refractory surface 552 of the pusher 
side oven door 554 will be positioned when the coke oven 
is closed on a forty-eight ton coal charge, an unused oven 
Volume equal to approximately one ton of coal is formed. 
Similarly, if the front face 536 of the false door extension 
542 is positioned six inches back from where the refractory 
surface 552 of the pusher side oven door 554 will be 
positioned, the unused oven Volume will equal approxi 
mately one half of a ton of coal. Accordingly, using the false 
door extension 542 and the aforementioned methodology, 
each oven can charge an additional halfton to a full ton of 
coal, which can significantly improve the coke production 
rate for an entire oven battery. This is true despite the fact 
that a forty-nine ton charge may be placed into an oven 
typically operated with forty-eight ton charges. The forty 
nine ton charge will not increase the forty-eight hour coke 
cycle. If the twelve inch void is filled using the aforemen 
tioned methodology but only forty-eight tons of coal are 
charged into the oven, the bed will be reduced from an 
expected forty-eight inches high to forty-seven inches high. 
Coking the forty-seven inch high coal charge for forty-eight 
hours buys one additional hour of soak time for the coking 
process, which could improve coke quality (CSR or stabil 
ity). 

In particular embodiments of the present technology, as 
depicted in FIGS. 34A-34C, the false door frame 502 may 
be fitted with a vertical false door 558, in place of the false 
door 504. In various embodiments, the vertical false door 
558 has an upper end portion 560, a lower end portion 562, 
opposite side portions 564 and 566, a front face 568, and a 
rearward face 570. In the embodiment depicted, the front 
face 568 is positioned to reside within a false door plane that 
is substantially vertical. In some embodiments, the front face 
568 is shaped to closely mirror a contour of a refractory 
surface 552 of a pusher side oven door 554. In this manner, 
the vertical false door may be used much in the same manner 
as that described above with regard to the false door assem 
bly that employs a false door extension 542. 

It may be desirable to periodically coke successive coal 
beds of different bed heights. For example, an oven may be 
first charged with a forty-eight ton, forty-eight inch high, 
coal bed. Thereafter, the oven may be charged with a 
twenty-eight ton, twenty-eight inch high, coal bed. The 
different bed heights require the use of false doors of 
correspondingly different heights. Accordingly, with contin 
ued reference to FIGS. 34A-34C, various embodiments of 
the present technology provide a lower extension plate 572 
coupled with the front face 568 of the vertical false door 558. 
The lower extension plate 572 is selectively, vertically 
moveable with respect to the vertical false door 558 between 
retracted and extended positions. At least one extended 
position disposes a lower edge portion 574 of the lower 
extension plate 572 below the lower edge portion 562 of the 
vertical false door 558 such that an effective height of the 
vertical false door 558 is increased. In some embodiments, 
relative movement between the lower extension plate 572 
and the vertical false door 558 is effected by disposing one 
or more extension plate brackets 576, which extend rear 
wardly from the lower extension plate 572, through one or 
more vertically arranged slots 578 that penetrate the vertical 
false door 558. One of various arm assemblies 580 and 
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power cylinders 582 may be coupled to the extension plate 
brackets 576 to selectively move the lower extension plate 
572 between its retracted and extended positions. In this 
manner, the effective height of the vertical false door 558 
may be automatically customized to any height, ranging 
from an initial height of the vertical false door 558 to a 
height with the lower extension plate 572 at a full extension 
position. In some embodiments, the lower extension plate 
558 and its associated components may be operatively 
coupled with the false door 504, such as depicted in FIGS. 
35A-35C. In other embodiments, the lower extension plate 
558 and its associated components may be operatively 
coupled with the extension plate 526. 

It is contemplated that, in Some embodiments of the 
present technology, the end portion of the coal bed 556 may 
be slightly compacted to reduce the likelihood that the end 
portion of the coal charge will spill from the oven before the 
pusher side oven door 554 can be closed. In some embodi 
ments, one or more vibration devices may be associated with 
the false door 504, extension plate 526, or vertical false door 
558, in order to vibrate the false door 504, extension plate 
526, or vertical false door 558, and compact the end portion 
of the coal bed 556. In other embodiments, the elongated 
false door frame 502 may be reciprocally and repeatedly 
moved into contact with the end portion of the coal bed 204 
with sufficient force to compact the end portion of the coal 
bed 556. A water spray may also be used, alone or in 
conjunction with the vibratory or impact compaction meth 
ods, to moisten the end portion of the coal bed 556 and, at 
least temporarily, maintain a shape of the end portion of the 
coal bed 556 so that portions of the coal bed 556 do not spill 
from the coke oven. 

EXAMPLES 

The following Examples are illustrative of several 
embodiments of the present technology. 

1. A coal charging system, the system comprising: 
an elongated charging frame; and 
a charging head operatively coupled with the distal end 

portion of the elongated charging frame; 
an elongated false door frame having a distal end portion, 

proximal end portion, and opposite sides; and 
a generally planar false door operatively coupled with the 

distal end portion of the elongated false doorframe; the 
false door having an upper edge portion, lower edge 
portion, opposite side portions, a front face, and a 
rearward face; the front face of the false door residing 
within a false door plane that is substantially vertical. 

2. The coal charging system of claim 1 further compris 
1ng: 

a lower extension plate operatively coupled with the front 
face of the false door; the lower extension plate being 
selectively, vertically moveable with respect to the 
false door between retracted and extended positions: 
wherein at least one extended position disposes a lower 
edge portion of the lower extension plate below the 
lower edge portion of the false door such that an 
effective height of the false door is increased. 

3. The coal charging system of claim 2 further compris 
1ng: 

a linkage arm assembly operatively coupled with the 
lower extension plate and at least one power cylinder 
that may be selectively activated to move the lower 
extension plate between the retracted and extended 
positions. 
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4. The coal charging system of claim 3 further compris 
1ng: 

at least one extension plate bracket operatively coupled 
with the lower extension plate and the linkage arm 
assembly; the at least one extension plate bracket 
extending through at least one slot that penetrates the 
false door. 

5. The coal charging system of claim 1 wherein the false 
door is comprised of: 

a false door body that resides within a body plane that is 
disposed at an angle away from Vertical; and 

a face plate operatively coupled with the false door body 
that is shaped and oriented to define the front face of the 
false door. 

6. The coal charging system of claim 5 further compris 
1ng: 

a lower extension plate operatively coupled with the front 
face of the false door; the lower extension plate being 
selectively, vertically moveable with respect to the 
false door between retracted and extended positions: 
wherein at least one extended position disposes a lower 
edge portion of the lower extension plate below the 
lower edge portion of the false door such that an 
effective height of the false door is increased. 

7. A false door system for use with a coal charging system, 
having an elongated charging frame with a charging head 
coupled with a distal end portion of the charging frame, the 
system comprising: 

an elongated false door frame having a distal end portion, 
proximal end portion, and opposite sides; and 

a generally planar false door operatively coupled with the 
distal end portion of the elongated false doorframe; the 
false door having an upper edge portion, lower edge 
portion, opposite side portions, a front face, and a 
rearward face; 

a lower extension plate operatively coupled with the front 
face of the false door; the lower extension plate being 
Selectively, moveable in a generally parallel fashion 
with respect to the false door between retracted and 
extended positions; wherein at least one extended posi 
tion disposes a lower edge portion of the lower exten 
sion plate below the lower edge portion of the false 
door such that an effective height of the false door is 
increased. 

8. The coal charging system of claim 7 further compris 
1ng: 

a linkage arm assembly operatively coupled with the 
lower extension plate and at least one power cylinder 
that may be selectively activated to move the lower 
extension plate between the retracted and extended 
positions. 

9. The coal charging system of claim 8 further compris 
1ng: 

at least one extension plate bracket operatively coupled 
with the lower extension plate and the linkage arm 
assembly; the at least one extension plate bracket 
extending through at least one slot that penetrates the 
false door. 

10. A method of increasing a coal charge in a coke oven, 
the method comprising: 

positioning a coal charging System, having an elongated 
charging frame and a charging head operatively 
coupled with the distal end portion of the elongated 
charging frame, at least partially within a pusher side 
opening of a coke oven; 

positioning a false door system, having an elongated false 
door frame and a generally planar false door opera 
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tively coupled with a distal end portion of the elongated 
false door frame, at least partially within the pusher 
side opening of the coke oven; the false door having a 
front face that resides within a false door plane that is 
substantially vertical; 

charging coal into the coke oven with the coal charging 
system in a manner that defines a coal charge having a 
generally vertical end portion; and 

operatively coupling an oven door with the coke oven in 
a manner that closes the pusher side opening of the 
coke oven. 

11. The method of claim 10 wherein the generally vertical 
end portion of the coal charge is positioned closely adjacent 
a refractory face of the oven door. 

12. The method of claim 10 wherein the generally vertical 
end portion of the coal charge is positioned no more than six 
inches from a refractory face of the oven door. 

13. The method of claim 10 wherein the generally vertical 
end portion of the coal charge is positioned no more than 
twelve inches from a refractory face of the oven door. 

14. The method of claim 10 further comprising: 
reciprocally impacting the end portion of the coal face 

with the false door in a manner that at least partially 
compacts a portion of the coal face and resists portions 
of the coal face from spilling from the pusher side 
opening of the coke oven. 

15. The method of claim 10 further comprising: 
applying a fluid to the coal face with the false door in a 
manner that wets a portion of the coal face and resists 
portions of the coal face from spilling from the pusher 
side opening of the coke oven. 

16. The method of claim 10 further comprising: 
vibrating the end portion of the coal face with the false 

door in a manner that at least partially compacts a 
portion of the coal face and resists portions of the coal 
face from spilling from the pusher side opening of the 
coke oven. 

Although the technology has been described in language 
that is specific to certain structures, materials, and method 
ological steps, it is to be understood that the invention 
defined in the appended claims is not necessarily limited to 
the specific structures, materials, and/or steps described. 
Rather, the specific aspects and steps are described as forms 
of implementing the claimed invention. Further, certain 
aspects of the new technology described in the context of 
particular embodiments may be combined or eliminated in 
other embodiments. Moreover, while advantages associated 
with certain embodiments of the technology have been 
described in the context of those embodiments, other 
embodiments may also exhibit such advantages, and not all 
embodiments need necessarily exhibit such advantages to 
fall within the scope of the technology. Accordingly, the 
disclosure and associated technology can encompass other 
embodiments not expressly shown or described herein. 
Thus, the disclosure is not limited except as by the appended 
claims. Unless otherwise indicated, all numbers or expres 
sions, such as those expressing dimensions, physical char 
acteristics, etc. used in the specification (other than the 
claims) are understood as modified in all instances by the 
term “approximately. At the very least, and not as an 
attempt to limit the application of the doctrine of equivalents 
to the claims, each numerical parameter recited in the 
specification or claims which is modified by the term 
“approximately” should at least be construed in light of the 
number of recited significant digits and by applying ordinary 
rounding techniques. Moreover, all ranges disclosed herein 
are to be understood to encompass and provide Support for 
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claims that recite any and all Subranges or any and all 
individual values subsumed therein. For example, a stated 
range of 1 to 10 should be considered to include and provide 
Support for claims that recite any and all Subranges or 
individual values that are between and/or inclusive of the 
minimum value of 1 and the maximum value of 10; that is, 
all Subranges beginning with a minimum value of 1 or more 
and ending with a maximum value of 10 or less (e.g., 5.5 to 
10, 2.34 to 3.56, and so forth) or any values from 1 to 10 
(e.g., 3, 5.8, 9.9994, and so forth). 
We claim: 
1. A coal charging system for charging a coke oven, the 

system comprising: 
an elongated charging frame; and 
a charging head operatively coupled with the distal end 

portion of the elongated charging frame; 
an elongated false door frame having a distal end portion, 

proximal end portion, and opposite sides; 
a generally planar false door operatively coupled with the 

distal end portion of the elongated false door frame; the 
false door having an upper edge portion, lower edge 
portion, opposite side portions, a front face, and a 
rearward face; the front face of the false door residing 
within a false door plane that is substantially vertical; 
and 

a lower extension plate operatively coupled with the front 
face of the false door; the lower extension plate being 
automated. Such that it is selectively and incrementally 
moveable with respect to the false door between an 
infinite number of vertically retracted and extended 
positions when the false door is disposed within the 
coke oven; wherein at least some of the infinite number 
of Vertically extended positions disposes a lower edge 
portion of the lower extension plate below the lower 
edge portion of the false door such that an effective 
height of the false door is increased. 

2. The coal charging system of claim 1 further compris 
1ng: 

a linkage arm assembly operatively coupled with the 
lower extension plate and at least one power cylinder 
that may be selectively activated to move the lower 
extension plate between the retracted and extended 
positions. 

3. The coal charging system of claim 2 further compris 
1ng: 

at least one extension plate bracket operatively coupled 
with the lower extension plate and the linkage arm 
assembly; the at least one extension plate bracket 
extending through at least one slot that penetrates the 
false door. 

4. A false door system for use with a coal charging system 
to charge a coke oven, having an elongated charging frame 
with a charging head coupled with a distal end portion of the 
charging frame, the system comprising: 

an elongated false door frame having a distal end portion, 
proximal end portion, and opposite sides; and 

a generally planar false door operatively coupled with the 
distal end portion of the elongated false door frame; the 
false door having an upper edge portion, lower edge 
portion, opposite side portions, a front face, and a 
rearward face; 

a lower extension plate operatively coupled with the front 
face of the false door; the lower extension plate being 
automated. Such that it is selectively and incrementally 
moveable with respect to the false door between an 
infinite number of vertically retracted and extended 
positions when the false door is disposed within the 
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coke oven; wherein at least some of the infinite number 
of Vertically extended positions disposes a lower edge 
portion of the lower extension plate below the lower 
edge portion of the false door such that an effective 
height of the false door is increased. 

5. The coal charging system of claim 4 further compris 
1ng: 

a linkage arm assembly operatively coupled with the 
lower extension plate and at least one power cylinder 
that may be selectively activated to move the lower 
extension plate between the retracted and extended 
positions. 

6. The coal charging system of claim 5 further compris 
1ng: 

at least one extension plate bracket operatively coupled 
with the lower extension plate and the linkage arm 
assembly; the at least one extension plate bracket 
extending through at least one slot that penetrates the 
false door. 

7. A method of increasing a coal charge in a coke oven, 
the method comprising: 

positioning a coal charging System, having an elongated 
charging frame and a charging head operatively 
coupled with the distal end portion of the elongated 
charging frame, at least partially within a pusher side 
opening of a coke oven; 

positioning a false door system, having an elongated false 
door frame and a generally planar false door opera 
tively coupled with a distal end portion of the elongated 
false door frame, at least partially within the pusher 
side opening of the coke oven; the false door having an 
upper edge portion, lower edge portion, opposite side 
portions, a front face, and a reward face; wherein the 
false door system further comprises a lower extension 
plate operatively coupled with the front face of the false 
door, the lower extension plate being automated. Such 
that it is selectively and incrementally moveable with 
respect to the false door between an infinite number of 
vertically retracted and extended positions when the 
false door is disposed within the coke oven; wherein at 
least some of the infinite number of vertically extended 
positions disposes a lower edge portion of the lower 
extension plate below the lower edge portion of the 
false door such that an effective height of the false door 
is increased; 

charging coal into the coke oven with the coal charging 
system in a manner that defines a coal charge having a 
generally vertical end portion; and 

operatively coupling an oven door with the coke oven in 
a manner that closes the pusher side opening of the 
coke oven. 

8. The method of claim 7 wherein the generally vertical 
end portion of the coal charge is positioned closely adjacent 
a refractory face of the oven door. 

9. The method of claim 7 wherein the generally vertical 
end portion of the coal charge is positioned no more than six 
inches from a refractory face of the oven door. 

10. The method of claim 7 wherein the generally vertical 
end portion of the coal charge is positioned no more than 
twelve inches from a refractory face of the oven door. 

11. The method of claim 7 further comprising: 
reciprocally impacting the end portion of the coal face 

with the false door in a manner that at least partially 
compacts a portion of the coal face and resists portions 
of the coal face from spilling from the pusher side 
opening of the coke oven. 
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12. The method of claim 7 further comprising: 
applying a fluid to the coal face with the false door in a 
manner that wets a portion of the coal face and resists 
portions of the coal face from spilling from the pusher 
side opening of the coke oven. 5 
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